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National   level   entrance   test   or   state   level entrance test details 

 

Academic 

Year 

Branch Name of  

National Level  
Entrance  
Examination 

No. of 

Students 
Admitted 

% of 

students 
admitted 

Test Agency 

2018-19 

B. Tech  

(Computer 

Engineering) JEE 17 14 

National 

Testing 

Agency 

    MH CET 81 68 

 State 

Common 

Entrance 

Test Cell 

  

B. Tech  
(Mechanical 

Engineering)  JEE 3 9 

 National 
Testing 

Agency 

    MH CET 21 64 

 State 

Common 

Entrance 

Test Cell 

  MBA CAT 1 1  IIMs 

    ATMA 2 3 

Association 

for Indian 
Management 

Schools 

    

MAH MBA 

CET 22 32 

 State 

Common 

Entrance 

Test Cell 

         

 



 

 

 

Annexure K 

 

Eligibility Criteria 

SN Faculty Department Program Eligibility Special 
Subject (if 
any) 

Minimum % 
of marks at 
Qualifying 

Examination 
for Open 
Category 

Minimum 
marks at 
Qualifying 

Examination 
for Reserve 
category 

Entrance 
Examination 

Minimum 
Score for 
Entrance 

Examination 

1 Science & 
Technology 

 Department of 
Mechanical 
Engineering  

B.Tech 
(Mechanical)  

Passed 10+2 
examination with 
Physics and 

Mathematics as 
compulsory subjects 
along with one of the 
Chemistry/ 

Biotechnology/ 
Biology/ Technical 
Vocational subject.                  
Obtained at least 45% 

marks (40% in case of 
candidates belonging 
to reserved category) 
in the above subjects 

taken together. 

PM + C / B 
/ V 

45% 40% National 
Level/ State 
Level 

Entrance 
Examination 

Non-Zero 



 

 

B.Tech 
(Mechanical) - 
(Lateral entry to 
Second year) 

a. Passed Diploma 
examination with at 
least 45% marks (40% 
in case of candidates 

belonging to reserved 
category) in 
appropriate branch of 
Engineering and 

Technology. 
b. Passed B.Sc. 
Degree from a 
recognized University 

as defined by UGC, 
with at least 45% 
marks (40% in case of 
candidates belonging 

to reserved category) 
and passed 10+2 
examination with 

Mathematics as a 
subject. 
c. Provided that the 
students belonging to 

B.Sc. Stream, shall 
clear the subjects 
Engineering 
Graphics/ 

Engineering Drawing 
and Engineering 
Mechanics of the First 
Year Engineering 

Programme along 
with the Second year 
subjects. 
d. Provided that the 

students belonging to 
B.Sc. Stream shall be 
considered only after 
filling the 

supernumerary seats 
in this category with 
students belonging to 
the Diploma stream. 

Appropriate 
Branch 

45% 40% NA NA 



 

 

M.Tech 
(Mechanical - 
Design) 

Passed Bachelor’s 
Degree or equivalent 
in the relevant field. 
Obtained at least 50% 

marks (45% in case of 
candidates belonging 
to reserved category) 
in the qualifying 

Examination. 

Appropriate 
Branch 

50% 45% GATE Non-Zero 

Department of 
Computer 

Engineering  

B.Tech 
(Computer)  

Passed 10+2 
examination with 

Physics and 
Mathematics as 
compulsory subjects 
along with one of the 

Chemistry/ 
Biotechnology/ 
Biology/ Technical 
Vocational subject.                  

Obtained at least 45% 
marks (40% in case of 
candidates belonging 
to reserved category) 

in the above subjects 
taken together. 

PM + C / B 
/ V 

45% 40% National 
Level/ State 

Level 
Entrance 
Examination 

Non-Zero 

B.Tech 

(Computer) - 
SEDA 

a. Passed Diploma 

examination with at 
least 45% marks (40% 
in case of candidates 
belonging to reserved 

category) in 
appropriate branch of 
Engineering and 
Technology. 

b. Passed B.Sc. 
Degree from a 
recognized University 
as defined by UGC, 

with at least 45% 
marks (40% in case of 
candidates belonging 
to reserved category) 

and passed 10+2 
examination with 
Mathematics as a 

Appropriate 

Branch 

45% 40% NA NA 



 

 

subject. 
c. Provided that the 
students belonging to 
B.Sc. Stream, shall 

clear the subjects 
Engineering 
Graphics/ 
Engineering Drawing 

and Engineering 
Mechanics of the First 
Year Engineering 
Programme along 

with the Second year 
subjects. 
d. Provided that the 
students belonging to 

B.Sc. Stream shall be 
considered only after 
filling the 

supernumerary seats 
in this category with 
students belonging to 
the Diploma stream. 

M.Tech 
(Computer) 

Passed Bachelor’s 
Degree or equivalent 
in the relevant field. 
Obtained at least 50% 

marks (45% in case of 
candidates belonging 
to reserved category) 
in the qualifying 

Examination. 

Appropriate 
Branch 

50% 45% GATE Non-Zero 

Department of 
Mathematics & 

Statistics 

 B.Sc 
(Statistics)  

Higher Secondary 
School Certificate 

(10+2) or its 
equivalent 
Examination with 
English and 

Mathematics and two 
of the science 
subjects such as 
Physics, Chemistry, 

Biology, Geography, 
Geology etc. 

Mathematics 
& any two 

science 
subjects 

Pass Pass NA NA 



 

 

M.Sc (Statistics) A) B. Sc. (Second 
class) with Statistics 
principal and 
Mathematics at 

subsidiary level. B) B. 
Sc. (Second class) 
with Mathematics 
principal and 

Statistics at 
subsidiary level. C) M. 
Sc. (Second class) in 
Mathematics. D) B. 

Sc. (Second class) in 
Actuarial Science with 
Mathematics and 
Statistics at 

subsidiary level. E) B. 
Sc. (Second class), 
with three subjects at 

third year with 
Satisfices as one of 
the subjects. 

Statistics Second 
Class 

Second 
Class 

NA NA 

Department of 

Computer 
Sciences 

B.Sc. (Computer 

Science) 

H.S.C. (10+2) Level 

Examination in 
science with 
Mathematics. or (b) 
Three Years Diploma 

Course ,after S.S.C. 
(10th standard) of 
Board of Technical 
Education conducted 

by Government of 
Maharashtra or its 
equivalent. 

Mathematics   Pass Pass NA NA 

M.Sc. 
(Computer 
Science) 

Bachelor of Computer 
Science with 50% 
marks. Or B.Sc. 
(Computer Science) 

with 50% marks. Or 
B.E. in Computer 
Science / Information 
Technology / 

Electronics 
Telecommunication 
with 50% marks. 

Computer 
Science 

50% 45% NA NA 



 

 

2 Art & Design Department of 
Fashion & 

Apparel 

B.A. (Fashion & 
Apparel 
Design),B.A. 
(Graphic Design 

& Multimedia), 
B.A. (Interior 
Design & 
Decoration) 

Higher Secondary 
School Certificate 
(10+2) or its 
equivalent 

Examination with 
English as a passing 
subject. (b) Three 
Years Diploma Course 

(after S.S.C. i.e. 10th 
Standard), of Board of 
Technical Education 
conducted by 

Government of 
Maharashtra or its 
equivalent. (c) Three 
Years Diploma in 

Pharmacy Course 
(after S.S.C. i.e. 10th), 
of Board of Technical 

Education conducted 
by Government of 
Maharashtra or its 
equivalent. (d) S.S.C. 

of 10 years or 11 years 
with English and 
Indian Air Force 
Educational Test for 

promotion to the rank 
of Corporal. (e) 
Trained Teachers 
Certificate Course, of 

Inter-State Board of 
Anglo Indian 
Education, New Delhi. 
(f) Intermediate 

Commerce/Arts 
examination from the 
Recognized Board of 
Secondary Education, 

M.P. Bhopal with 4 
subjects including 
General English. (g) 
Diploma in Education 

with English, of 
Bureau of 

NA Pass Pass NA NA 



 

 

Government of 
Maharashtra. (h) 
MCVC (minimum 
competency 

Vocational Course 
Government of 
Maharashtra) or 
equivalent. 

M.A. (Fashion & 
Apparel Design) 

Bachelor’s Degree in 
any faculty from any 
recognized University 
or its equivalent 

examination. 

NA 45% 40% University 
Entrance 
Examination 

NA 

Department of 
Fashion Design 

& Apparel 
Technology 

B.Des. (Fashion 
Design) 

Pass in 10+2 or 3 
years Diploma or 

equivalent 
qualification from a 
recognized Board / 
University, with 

minimum 50 % 
aggregate marks or 
equivalent 

NA 50% 45% VU 
Entrance 

Non Zero 

M.Des. (Fashion 
Design) 

Passed 
Bachelor(12+4) in any 
subject from any 
recognized University 

or equivalent 

NA 45% 40% VU 
Entrance 

Non Zero 

Department of 
Graphic Design 

& Multimedia 
Technology 

B.Des. (Graphic 
Design) 

Pass in 10+2 or 3 
years Diploma or 

equivalent 
qualification from a 
recognized Board / 
University, with 

minimum 50 % 
aggregate marks or 
equivalent 

NA Pass 45% VU 
Entrance 

Non Zero 

M.Des. (Graphic 

Design) 

Passed 

Bachelor(12+4) in any 
subject from any 
recognized University 

or equivalent 

NA 45% 40% VU 

Entrance 

Non Zero 



 

 

Department of 
Product Design  

B.Des. (Product 
Design) 

Pass in 10+2 or 3 
years Diploma or 
equivalent 
qualification from a 

recognized Board / 
University, with 
minimum 50 % 
aggregate marks or 

equivalent 

NA 50% 45% VU 
Entrance 

Non Zero 

M.Des. (Product 
Design) 

Passed 
Bachelor(12+4) in any 

subject from any 
recognized University 
or equivalent 

NA 45% 40% VU 
Entrance 

Non Zero 

3 Commerce & 
Management 

Department of 
Business 

Administration  

B.B.A. Higher Secondary 
School Certificate 
(10+2) or its 
equivalent 

Examination with 
40% marks from any 
stream. (35% for 
Reserved category 

and 40% for Open 
category candidate as 
per maharashtra 
state government 

rules) and English as 
one of the Subjects. 
OR b) Three year 
Diploma Course (after 

S.S.C.) of Technical 
Education conducted 
by Government of 
Maharashtra or its 

equivalent. OR c) Two 
year Diploma Course 
in Pharmacy (after 
H.S.C.) of Board of 

Technical Education 
conducted by 
Government of 
Maharashtra or its 

equivalent. d) Higher 
Secondary School 
Certificate(10+2) 

NA 40% 35% VU 
Entrance 

Non Zero 



 

 

Examinition with 45% 
marks and any 
Vocational subject at 
(10+2) level. e) Higher 

Secondary School 
Certificate(10+2) 
Vocational (MCVC)- 
Minimum 

Competency based 
vocational course 
Examination with 
45% marks (40% for 

reserved category 
candidate as per 
maharashtra state 
government rules) 

M.B.A. A Bachelor’s degree or 
Master’s degree in any 
Faculty awarded by 

Statutory University. 

NA 50% 45% National 
Level/ State 
Level 

Entrance 
Examination 

Non Zero 

4 Interdisciplinary 

Studies 

Department of 

Travel and 
Tourism 

B.A. (Travels 

and Tourism) 

Higher Secondary 

School Certificate 
(10+2) or its 
equivalent 
Examination with 

English as a passing 
subject. (b) Three 
Years Diploma Course 
(after S.S.C. i.e. 10th 

Standard), of Board of 
Technical Education 
conducted by 
Government of 

Maharashtra or its 
equivalent. (c) Three 
Years Diploma in 
Pharmacy Course 

(after S.S.C. i.e. 10th), 
of Board of Technical 
Education conducted 
by Government of 

Maharashtra or its 
equivalent. (d) S.S.C. 
of 10 years or 11 years 

NA Pass Pass NA NA 



 

 

with English and 
Indian Air Force 
Educational Test for 
promotion to the rank 

of Corporal. (e) 
Trained Teachers 
Certificate Course, of 
Inter-State Board of 

Anglo Indian 
Education, New Delhi. 
(f) Intermediate 
Commerce/Arts 

examination from the 
Recognized Board of 
Secondary Education, 
M.P. Bhopal with 4 

subjects including 
General English. (g) 
Diploma in Education 

with English, of 
Bureau of 
Government of 
Maharashtra. (h) 

MCVC (minimum 
competency 
Vocational Course 
Government of 

Maharashtra) or 
equivalent. 

5 Humanities and 
Social Sciences 

Department of 
Psychology 

B.A. 
(Psychology) 

Higher Secondary 
School Certificate 

(10+2) or its 
equivalent 
Examination with 

English as a passing 
subject. (b) Three 
Years Diploma Course 
(after S.S.C. i.e. 10th 

Standard), of Board of 
Technical Education 
conducted by 
Government of 

Maharashtra or its 
equivalent. (c) Three 
Years Diploma in 

NA Pass Pass NA NA 



 

 

Pharmacy Course 
(after S.S.C. i.e. 10th), 
of Board of Technical 
Education conducted 

by Government of 
Maharashtra or its 
equivalent. (d) S.S.C. 
of 10 years or 11 years 

with English and 
Indian Air Force 
Educational Test for 
promotion to the rank 

of Corporal. (e) 
Trained Teachers 
Certificate Course, of 
Inter-State Board of 

Anglo Indian 
Education, New Delhi. 
(f) Intermediate 

Commerce/Arts 
examination from the 
Recognized Board of 
Secondary Education, 

M.P. Bhopal with 4 
subjects including 
General English. (g) 
Diploma in Education 

with English, of 
Bureau of 
Government of 
Maharashtra. (h) 

MCVC (minimum 
competency 
Vocational Course 
Government of 

Maharashtra) or 
equivalent. 

M.A. 

(Psychology) 

Graduate in any 

faculty. Preference 
will be given to B.A. 
with Psychology as 
special subject. 

NA 45% 40% NA NA 



 

 

Department of 
Economics 

B.A. 
(Economics) 

Higher Secondary 
School Certificate 
(10+2) or its 
equivalent 

Examination with 
English as a passing 
subject. (b) Three 
Years Diploma Course 

(after S.S.C. i.e. 10th 
Standard), of Board of 
Technical Education 
conducted by 

Government of 
Maharashtra or its 
equivalent. (c) Three 
Years Diploma in 

Pharmacy Course 
(after S.S.C. i.e. 10th), 
of Board of Technical 

Education conducted 
by Government of 
Maharashtra or its 
equivalent. (d) S.S.C. 

of 10 years or 11 years 
with English and 
Indian Air Force 
Educational Test for 

promotion to the rank 
of Corporal. (e) 
Trained Teachers 
Certificate Course, of 

Inter-State Board of 
Anglo Indian 
Education, New Delhi. 
(f) Intermediate 

Commerce/Arts 
examination from the 
Recognized Board of 
Secondary Education, 

M.P. Bhopal with 4 
subjects including 
General English. (g) 
Diploma in Education 

with English, of 
Bureau of 

NA Pass Pass NA NA 



 

 

Government of 
Maharashtra. (h) 
MCVC (minimum 
competency 

Vocational Course 
Government of 
Maharashtra) or 
equivalent. 

M.A. 
(Economics) 

Graduate in any 
faculty. Preference 
will be given to B.A. 
with Economics as 

special subject. 

NA 45% 40% NA NA 

6 Journalism, 
Media and 

Communication 

Department of 
Media, 

Communication 
& Journalism 

B.A. 
(Journalism & 

Mass 
Communication) 

Higher Secondary 
School Certificate 

(10+2) or its 
equivalent 
Examination with 
English as a passing 

subject. (b) Three 
Years Diploma Course 
(after S.S.C. i.e. 10th 
Standard), of Board of 

Technical Education 
conducted by 
Government of 
Maharashtra or its 

equivalent. (c) Three 
Years Diploma in 
Pharmacy Course 
(after S.S.C. i.e. 10th), 

of Board of Technical 
Education conducted 
by Government of 
Maharashtra or its 

equivalent. (d) S.S.C. 
of 10 years or 11 years 
with English and 
Indian Air Force 

Educational Test for 
promotion to the rank 
of Corporal. (e) 

Trained Teachers 
Certificate Course, of 

NA Pass Pass NA NA 



 

 

Inter - State Board of 
Anglo Indian 
Education, New Delhi. 
(f) Intermediate 

Commerce/Arts 
examination from the 
Recognized Board of 
Secondary Education, 

M.P. Bhopal with 4 
subjects including 
General English. (g) 
Diploma in Education 

with English, of 
Bureau of 
Government of 
Maharashtra. (h) 

MCVC (minimum 
competency 
Vocational Course 

Government of 
Maharashtra) or 
equivalent 

M.A. 

(Journalism & 
Mass 
Communication) 

Bachelor’s Degree in 

any faculty from any 
recognized University 
or equivalent. 
Preference will be 

given to Journalism 
as special subject. 

NA 45% 40% NA NA 

7 Law Department of 

Law & 
Governance 

LLM (Criminal 

Law, Business 
Law, Arbitration 
& International, 
Cyber Law, IPR) 

Graduate in Law of 

Statutory University ( 
Bachelor of Laws3 
Years/ 5 Years) 

NA Pass Class Pass Class All India 

Admission 
Test  

Non Zero 

 



 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

Admissions 2018-19 



Sr No. CandidateMarksheetN

ame

Gender Category CET Type CET Marks 12th % 10th % Status

1 JOGDAND AKANKSHA ANILFemale SC  MH CET 69 68.60 8.8 Provisionally Admitted

2 GAIKWAD ATHARV SUSHILMale NT-B  MH CET 55 52.46 7 Provisionally Admitted

3 HADBE PRASAD ANGADRAOMale NT-D  MH CET 57 58.15 82.40 Provisionally Admitted

4 DHAKRE SARTHAK YASHWANTMale OBC  VU 88 81 86 Provisionally Admitted

5 KARANJKAR SHREYAS PANKAJMale OBC  MH CET 83 69.54 88.80 Provisionally Admitted

6 SHAIKH MOHAMMEDNOOR SHAFIMale OBC  MH CET 74 58.92 70.80 Provisionally Admitted

7 SAKSHI KAPOTE Female OBC  MH CET 69 73.54 9.4 Provisionally Admitted

8 YADAV YASH AVINASH Male OBC  MH CET 66 71.54 76.8 Provisionally Admitted

9 WAGHMARE ADITYA CHANDRAKANTMale OBC  MH CET 64 61.32 87.32 Provisionally Admitted

10 PATIL CHETNA VISHWAJITFemale OBC  MH CET 61 56 77.40 Provisionally Admitted

11 KHAMKAR VAISHNAVI HARIPANDITFemale OBC  MH CET 59 58.6 85 Provisionally Admitted

12 GHAVGHAVE NACHIKET VINODMale OBC  VU 59 55.38 74.40 Provisionally Admitted

13 BAGADE ATHARVA SANJAYKUMARMale OBC  MH CET 57 48.3 69.40 Provisionally Admitted

14 ATHARVAVIJAYANAND GHAMMale OBC  MH CET 55 58.8 9.2 Provisionally Admitted

15 VANGUNDE AVINASH RAMESHMale OBC  VU 52 69.54 89.20 Provisionally Admitted

16 SINGAM MAHENDRA GANGADHARMale SBC  MH CET 70 71.38 84.80 Provisionally Admitted

17 DEVSANI UDAY KUMAR Male SBC  VU 53 53.08 57.40 Provisionally Admitted

18 NAVIN BUBNA Male OMS  JEE 4 52.60 6.2 CGPA Provisionally Admitted

19 LODHIYA VISHAL PIYUSHBHAIMale OMS  JEE 15 43.8 72 Provisionally Admitted

20 ANANT JAISWAL Male OMS  MH CET 16 83 82 Provisionally Admitted

21 PRABAL NIKKUMBH Male OMS  JEE 18 67.00 9.8 CGPA Provisionally Admitted

22 SANCHIT SIAL Male OMS  JEE 22 61.2 9.4cgpa Provisionally Admitted

23 HAIDER ALI Male OMS  MH CET 25 70 9 CGPA Provisionally Admitted

24 NITISH SINGH Male OMS  JEE 29 83 10 CGPA Provisionally Admitted

25 KHANDERIYA MANAV JEETENDRAKUMARMale OMS  MH CET 45 53 78 Provisionally Admitted

26 VASWANI JAI MANOJ Male OPEN MH CET 106 77.08 86.40 Provisionally Admitted

27 SHIVAM KUMAR JHA Male OMS  VU 55 58.4 8.6 Provisionally Admitted

28 ADARSH RAJ Male OMS  MH CET 55 58.6 85 Provisionally Admitted

29 SHAIKH RIDA JAVED Female OPEN MHCET 104 84.46 88.00 Provisionally Admitted

30 DESHPANDE JUILY YOGESHFemale OPEN MH CET 101 77.69 90 Provisionally Admitted

31 ABHISHEK PANDEY Male OMS  VU 55 59 7.6 CGPA Provisionally Admitted

32 DYASA AVINASH VEERBASAPPAMale OMS  MHCET 64 67.85 74.80 Provisionally Admitted

33 BHATT TIRTH DHRUV Male OMS  MH CET 68 72.9 83 Provisionally Admitted

34 LALWANI NIKHIL DILIP Male OPEN MHCET 98 68.15 92.40 Provisionally Admitted

35 ANIKET R. JAIN Male OMS  MH CET 70 72 7.8 CGPA Provisionally Admitted

36 SAKSHI SAHAY Female OMS  MH CET 70 78.3 10 Provisionally Admitted

37 SUMIR BROOTA Male OPEN MH CET 97 78 82 Provisionally Admitted

38 MALAY KHAKHAR Male OMS  MH CET 72 68 95 Provisionally Admitted

39 PAWAR PRATHAMESH VIVEKMale OPEN MHCET 95 80.40 9.4 Provisionally Admitted

40 PRITESH GURJAR Male OMS  MH CET 76 75.8 78 Provisionally Admitted

41 ABBAS BEHRAINWALA Male OMS  VU 77 73.6 8.6 CGPA Provisionally Admitted

42 SATVIK GURJAR Male OMS  VU 81 66.4 8.2 CGPA Provisionally Admitted

43 KAVYA SAGWARIA Female OMS  VU 82 54 81.7 Provisionally Admitted

44 AISHWARYA RAMAKRISHNANFemale OMS  JEE 84 59.08 87.28 Provisionally Admitted

45 SAFIYA NESAR Female OMS  MH CET 89 78.8 93 Provisionally Admitted

46 HARSHIT TIWARI Male OMS  MH CET 101 58.8 9.2 Provisionally Admitted

47 AMAR SAXENA Male OMS  MH CET 103 92.4 9.4 Provisionally Admitted

48 KULKARNI KEDAR DINESHMale OPEN MHCET 65.38 83.40 Provisionally Admitted

49 GADIYA MOHIT ABHAY Male OPEN MH CET 89 74.31 82.17 Provisionally Admitted

50 CHOUDHARY KUNDAN MANOJMale OPEN JEE 13 50.31 52.80 Provisionally Admitted

51 RANKA NEEL VIRENDRA Male OPEN MHCET 88 75.85 86.00 Provisionally Admitted

52 GAURAV SINGH DAFAUTIMale OPEN MH CET 87 72.9 83 Provisionally Admitted

53 BAGALKOTE MOHD AMAAN MOHD IQBALMale OPEN MH CET 47 51.54 76.80 Provisionally Admitted

54 KSHIRSAGAR SANIKA VIVEKFemale OPEN MH CET 86 80.46 95.80 Provisionally Admitted

55 SAYYED FAIZAN NAZIM Male OPEN MH CET 47 59.38 68.40 Provisionally Admitted

56 PATIL ABHINAV NAMDEOMale OPEN MH CET 85 48.92 80.40 Provisionally Admitted

57 RAUT PRARTHANA GIRISHFemale OPEN MH CET 48 57.69 82.20 Provisionally Admitted

58 DESAI OMKAR VIJAYSINHMale OPEN MH CET 84 80 93 Provisionally Admitted

59 AKSHIT KANERIYA Male OPEN MH CET 48 61 9.4 CGPA Provisionally Admitted

60 VASANWALA TAHER MUSTAFABHAIMale OPEN MH CET 84 61.23 79.80 Provisionally Admitted

VISHWAKARMA UNIVERSITY
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PROGRAMME : BTECH COMPUTER ENGINEERING

FINAL ADMISSIONS AS ON CUT-OFF DATE 



61 KAKADE ADITYA VIJAY Male OPEN VU 49 52 87 Provisionally Admitted

62 SHUBHAM KULKARNI Male OPEN MHCET 83 78 9.4 Provisionally Admitted

63 JAIN MIHIR SANTOSH Male OPEN MH CET 83 66.16 83.14 Provisionally Admitted

64 AMLANI JYOTI HARISH Female OPEN MHCET 50 63.69 85.40 Provisionally Admitted

65 SHRISTI DAS Female OPEN MHCET 52 61 77 Provisionally Admitted

66 JAIN KUSHAL MILIND Male OPEN MH CET 53 62.15 67.00 Provisionally Admitted

67 GANGWANI MOHIT JITENDRAMale OPEN VU 55 52 7.2 Provisionally Admitted

68 ANINDYA LALIT KOTHARIMale OPEN MH CET 81 77.38 98 Provisionally Admitted

69 THAKKAR DHAIRYA DINESHMale OPEN MHCET 81 66 80.2 Provisionally Admitted

70 SETHI DEEVESH MAHENDRAMale OPEN MH CET 81 64.31 73.60 Provisionally Admitted

71 SHIRKE NEEV DILIPRAJ Male OPEN MH CET 81 58 78 Provisionally Admitted

72 MOHAMMED BASHEER JAFFER ALIMale OPEN MHCET 55 53.08 56.40 Provisionally Admitted

73 SHAIKH ASAD IMTIYAZ Male OPEN MH CET 55 56.66 78.66 Provisionally Admitted

74 CHOUDHARY RAJAT JAINMale OPEN MH CET 80 78 85.17 Provisionally Admitted

75 RANKA NARENDRA GOPALDASMale OPEN MHCET 55 60.92 70.20 Provisionally Admitted

76 NAVLANI ISHIKA SUNIL Female OPEN MH CET 56 61.85 82.60 Provisionally Admitted

77 SIKCHI YASH AMAN Male OPEN MH CET 78 87 90.20 Provisionally Admitted

78 ROKADE DARPAN EKANATHMale OPEN MH CET 56 62 84.60 Provisionally Admitted

79 GHOSH ANIMESH KUNALMale OPEN MH CET 78 79.54 91.40 Provisionally Admitted

80 DASARWAR KEYUR SAGARMale OPEN MHCET 56 68 9 CGPA Provisionally Admitted

81 JAGTIANI KARAN MAHESHMale OPEN MH CET 78 56.3 74.1 Provisionally Admitted

82 MARDA ADITYA RAVINDRAMale OPEN MH CET 57 52.33 88.55 Provisionally Admitted

83 AYYANAGAOUDAR PRIYANKA PRAKASHGOUDAFemale OPEN MH CET 58 65.59 78 Provisionally Admitted

84 VAZ RYLAN PETER Male OPEN MH CET 58 76.46 87.8 Provisionally Admitted

85 WAGHELA KSHITIJ NITINMale OPEN MH CET 59 54 77.60 Provisionally Admitted

86 JAIN NIKITA DHARMENDRAFemale OPEN VU 59 63.08 82.00 Provisionally Admitted

87 SRIVASTWA ADITYA RAJ MADHURENDRAMale OPEN MH CET 77 71.08 83.33 Provisionally Admitted

88 CHOBE RUDRA UDAY Male OPEN MHCET 77 66.46 8.6 Provisionally Admitted

89 MAHIMA NIMBALKAR Female OPEN MH CET 59 75.60 80.30 Provisionally Admitted

90 ARVI MOHD FARZAN EKRAMMale OPEN MH CET 75 70 87.60 Provisionally Admitted

91 MAHAJAN ASHUTOSH SHARADMale OPEN MH CET 75 65.85 83.40 Provisionally Admitted

92 KHARWADKAR OM SUMEDHMale OPEN MH CET 60 56 89 Provisionally Admitted

93 SHIRBHATE YASH PRAMODMale OPEN MH CET 74 70.30 82.80 Provisionally Admitted

94 NAHAR YASH NITIN Male OPEN MH CET 74 69.38 87.60 Provisionally Admitted

95 GHATPANDE CHINMAY SHREETOSHMale OPEN MH CET 74 63.23 82 Provisionally Admitted

96 THARKUDE SAKSHI NARESHFemale OPEN MHCET 74 60.31 81.20 Provisionally Admitted

97 SHAH YASH JITENDRA Male OPEN MH CET 60 62.1 82.4 Provisionally Admitted

98 WADONE MALLESHWARI DATTATRAYAFemale OPEN MHCET 60 70 93 Provisionally Admitted

99 BALASINORWALA TAHER SAIFUDDINMale OPEN MH CET 61 54.62 72 Provisionally Admitted

100 CHAVAN ABHISHEK BHAGVATMale OPEN VU 61 55 56 Provisionally Admitted

101 KHAN MOHAMMAD FEROZ HAIDER ALIMale OPEN MH CET 61 62.46 81.20 Provisionally Admitted

102 MANKE SOMIL MILIND Male OPEN MH CET 72 73.50 92.00 Provisionally Admitted

103 SHESHADRI PRASHANT VYASMale OPEN MHCET 61 64 74.60 Provisionally Admitted

104 NAGEPATIL TANMAY RAJESHMale OPEN MH CET 72 62.31 91 Provisionally Admitted

105 RANA AKSHAD SHISHIR Male OPEN MH CET 62 50 70 Provisionally Admitted

106 PATEL ALIAKBAR SAIFEEMale OPEN MH CET 63 61.08 83.60 Provisionally Admitted

107 MULE PRANAV SAHEBRAOMale OPEN MH CET 63 64.15 86.80 Provisionally Admitted

108 RAJPUROHIT BHAVESH RAMESHMale OPEN MH CET 71 67.54 79.80 Provisionally Admitted

109 GADIYA AKASH NILESH Male OPEN MH CET 71 65.23 74.60 Provisionally Admitted

110 GONDE PATIL KSHITIJ PANDHARINATHMale OPEN MH CET 71 63 88.80 Provisionally Admitted

111 MULEY SUMEDH ANIRUDDHAMale OPEN VU 70 73.69 80.40 Provisionally Admitted

112 MOHITE KSHITIJA KIRANFemale OPEN MH CET 70 70.31 91.00 Provisionally Admitted

113 BHERDE SRUSHTI SADANANDFemale OPEN MH CET 63 65 89.6 Provisionally Admitted

114 MITRA ANANYA PRADYOTFemale OPEN MH CET 69 81.23 90.4 Provisionally Admitted

115 JOSHI MAYANK MANGESHMale OPEN MH CET 65 55.5 8.6 Provisionally Admitted

116 PARANJPE KARAN AJIT Male OPEN MH CET 65 76.15 92 Provisionally Admitted

117 NAVALE ANISH PRADEEPMale OPEN MH CET 66 66.00 82.00 Provisionally Admitted

118 ADEKAR SHRINIVAS RAJKUMARMale OPEN MH CET 69 59.07 84.12 Provisionally Admitted

119 NIHARIKA AVINASH DEVKHILEFemale OPEN MH CET 67 67 81 Provisionally Admitted

120 TAKBHATE SHIRISH RAMRAJAMale OPEN MH CET 68 62.15 93 Provisionally Admitted



Sr. No. CandidateMarksheetName CET Marks CET Type 12th % 10th % Gender Category Graduation %

1 AMAN SONAR 35 MH CET 60 59.20 Male OMS 57.08

2 ANJALI KUMARI 62 VU 8.8cgpa 63.8 Female OMS 63.8

3 CHAVAN ADITYA RAVIKANT 58 MH CET 74.18 67.08 Male OPEN 54

4 DHANASHREE RAJENDRA KUNJIR 37 MH CET 64.18 55.08 Female OPEN 51.05

5 GANDHI SHREEYA NITIN 46 MH CET 84.16 62.00 Female OPEN 76.00

6 GAPAT AMRUTA ASHOK 50 MH CET 90 62.77 Female OPEN

7 GOMARE GITANJALI GOVIND 56 ATMA 84.36 61.83 Female OBC  65.86

8 GUJAR KUNAL UMESH 43 MH CET 74.36 67.83 Male OPEN 55

9 HANKARE ASMITA VASANT 63 MH CET 84.91 61.83 Female SC  6.22

10 IKRAM AHMED NAVEED AHMED 50 MH CET 70.91 53.23 Male OPEN 61.02

11 JADHAV ASHITOSH SAMBHAJI 55 MH CET 54.73 59.38 Male OPEN 50.20

12 JAIDEEP KIRAN NADKARNI 91 MH CET 77.27 80.31 Male OPEN 76

13 JEET KAMLESH PATEL 73 MH CET 63.45 51.17 Male OBC  46.58

14 KANJAR JAY HASMUKH SHOBHANA 73 VU 73.09 55.50 Male OPEN 4.06

15 KASTURE SHREENATH BASAVESHWAR 56 VU 74.60 65.23 Male OPEN 52

16 KULKARNI VAIDEHI VIVEK 42 MH CET 68 64 Female OPEN 63

17 KULKARNI VARAD VINOD 64 MH CET 83.20 67.85 Male OPEN 57.11

18 KUMTHEKAR RIDDHI GIRISH 61 MH CET 84.55 84.15 Female OPEN 65.83

19 KURHADE VAISHNAVI SANJAY 77 VU 78.55 45.17 Female OPEN 65.30

20 KUSHENDRA SINGH CHANDEL 40 MH CET 6.4 CGPA 69.20 Male OMs 69.00

21 LAHOTI RISHI VISHNU 46 MH CET 72.55 69.08 Male OPEN 55

22 MAHARSHI SHUKLA 89 VU 7.2 71.20 Male OMs 6.53

23 NARSALE SAYALI AMBADAS 88 VU 85.09 77.23 Female OBC  70.21

24 NAZAIFNAZIM ZAMEERPASHA PATAIT 72 VU 37.76 73 Male OMS

25 PATHAK NIRAJ ANIL 70 MH CET 83.82 Male OPEN 66.2

26 PATIL SNEHAL BHALCHANDRA 59 MH CET 82.40 Female OPEN 61.13

27 POKHARKAR PRATIK PRABHAKAR 93 CMAT 82.92 48.83 Male OPEN 63.73

28 RENAKE ONKAR PRAVIN 80 VU 80 76 Male OBC  79

Sr. No. CandidateMarksheetName CET Marks CET Type 12th % 10th % Gender Category Graduation %

29 ROY NIKITA MONI 54 VU 6.2 CGPA 56.6 Female OMs

30 RUCHI VISHWAKARMA 76.57 CMAT 7.2 70 Female OMs 60.35

31 SAMBHUS PUSHKAR PRAMOD 50 MH CET 78 55 Male OPEN 50

32 SHAIKH SAJEDA MAHAMAD 89 VU 78.36 57.38 Female OPEN 55.21

33 SHARMA AISHWARYA ASHOK 32 MH CET 78.91 64.62 Female OPEN 59.16

34 SHETTY SAKSHI BHASKAR 46 VU 79.82 79.69 Female OPEN 66.33

35 SONALI MANE 41 MH CET 60.66 58.9 Female OMs 72

36 SURVE ASHISH SHIVAJI 64 VU 78.18 58.83 Male OBC  69.64

37 UDAWANT VISHAL VENKATESH 50 MH CET 65.64 62.00 Male OBC  52.33

38 UNDALE HARSHADA VIJAY 37 MH CET 60 66.31 Female SBC  48.79

39 UNDALE PRAJAKTA VIJAY 39 MH CET 43.64 56 Female SBC  50

40 VIBHUTE RHEA RAVINDRA 76 VU 86.36 90.31 Female OPEN 75.83

41 VIBHUTE RITIKA RAVINDRA 77 VU 72.80 70 Female OPEN 72.80

42 VIJAY SINGH 59 VU 58.56 68.33 Male OMs 66.17

43 VIRAAJ SRIVASTAVA 40 VU 5.8 CGPA 57 Male OMs

44 VORA CHIRAG SHRAVAN 52 MH CET 72.91 52 Male OPEN 62.29

45 YADAV JAYESH NARENDRA 53 MH CET 62 44.5 Male OPEN 58

46 ZAINEB YUSUFBHAI MADARWALA 56 VU 64.83 56.65 Female OMs 67.5

47 ZENDE SAKSHI DILIP 38 MH CET 84 Female OPEN 62.16

48 CHAVANDA SHAKHAMBARI CHANDRASHEKHAR58 MH CET 75.80 54.83 Female OBC  47.23

49 MOHITE JANHAVI AJAY 81 MH CET 89.40 66.92 Female OPEN 60.00

50 MORE KANCHAN VASANT 54 MH CET 68.40 80 Female OPEN 84.67

51 MAHULKAR PRIYANKA SURESH 47 VU 58.00 50.00 Female SC  55.00

52 HIBARE VIRAJ PRADNYAN 69 VU 72.91 55.23 Male OBC  63.36

53 AJAY SINGH BARGOTI 52 VU 65 66 Male OPEN 67

54 ANIMESH SHARAN 29 VU 71 51 Male OPEN 45

55 CHANAN ANUJ 57 VU 63 65 Male OPEN 55

56 DESAI YOGESH BHARAT 31 VU 72.3 72 Male OPEN 72

57 DINESH KUMAR JHA 22 VU 62 51 Male OPEN 8.02

58 GOPAKUMAR N. 53 VU 54.80 58 Male OMs 61.00

59 KAUSHIK GOSWAMI 71 VU 72.8 75.6 Male OPEN 6.49

60 MAJ VINAY SHARMA 52 VU 78 55 Male OPEN 7.34

PROGRAMME : MBA (MASTER OF BUSINESS ADMINISTRATION)

FINAL ADMISSIONS AS ON CUT-OFF DATE 

ADMISSIONS AY 2018-19

VISHWAKARMA UNIVERSITY



61 MOHAN VISHVANATH BHALSING 51 VU Male OPEN

Sr. No. CandidateMarksheetName CET Marks CET Type 12th % 10th % Gender Category Graduation %

62 RAJDEO SUNIL RAMDAS 43 VU 62.57 52.17 Male OPEN 68.75

63 RAMNATHKAR INDRANEEL PRAMOD 56 VU 56.8 61.5 Male OPEN 67

64 SARKAR AMIT ASHOK 25 VU  57 Male OPEN

65 SUMEET BAXI 35 VU 57.2 66 Male OPEN 59.33

66 SUNIT SINGH 42 VU 59 63 Male OMs 57

67 TARUN KHANNA 48 VU 5.5 5.3 Male OPEN 56.95

68 VIKAS KATOCH 52 VU 60.80 61.40 Male OMs 56.64

69  K S JANKIRAM 51 VU Male OMs

Sr. No. Category Admissoins

1 OMS 15

2 SC 2

3 ST 0

4 VJ/DT/NT-A 0

5 NT-B 0

6 NT-C 0

7 NT-D 0

8 OBC 10

9 Open 42

Total 69

Date: 01/09/2018  Authorized Signatory

Place: Pune Vishwakarma University

Admission Summary



Sr. No. CET Marks CET Type 12th % 10th % CandidateMarksheetName Gender Category Status

1 74 MH CET 54.15 55.40 Akole Amey Shrikant Male OBC  Provisionally Admitted

2 82 MH CET 78 80.80 Dangi Siddharth Kishor Male OPEN Provisionally Admitted

3 131 MH CET 57.07 91.40 Deshmukh Vaishnavi Udaysinh Female OPEN Provisionally Admitted

4 94 MH CET 71.8 92.2 Ghule Siddhant Sanjay Male OBC  Provisionally Admitted

5 48 MH CET 62.31 78.20 Gothekar Ajlan Amiruddin Male OPEN Provisionally Admitted

6 51 MH CET 75.80 78.83 IDRIS PRESSWALA Male OMS Provisionally Admitted

7 50 VU 58.46 78` Jadhav Shreyas Vilas Male OPEN Provisionally Admitted

8 47 VU 68.15 76.00 Jadhav Suraj Sanjay Male OPEN Provisionally Admitted

9 48 MH CET 62.92 83.40 JAIN AMAN MAHESH Male OPEN Provisionally Admitted

10 45 VU 63.08 93.80 KULKARNI NANDAN SANJAY Male OPEN Provisionally Admitted

11 43 MH CET 69.38 8.4 CGPA Lad Vinit Navin Male OBC  Provisionally Admitted

12 53 VU 57.38 67.80 Lodhi Ravikumar Shivmurat Male OPEN Provisionally Admitted

13 68 MH CET 76.15 82.60 Menezes Prestin Wilson Male OPEN Provisionally Admitted

14 68 VU 50.46 80 Mokal Rutik Subhash Male OBC  Provisionally Admitted

15 60 MH CET 73.85 89.40 More Abhishek Vivek Male OPEN Provisionally Admitted

16 48 MH CET 52 4.6 Muhammed Tauseef Male OMS Provisionally Admitted

17 68 MH CET 83 91 Musale Tanishk Kailas Male OBC  Provisionally Admitted

18 55 MH CET 70 84 Nahar Nandan Praful Male OPEN Provisionally Admitted

19 75 MH CET 77.01 88.80 Nair Vighnesh Suresh Male OPEN Provisionally Admitted

20 73 MH CET 62.46 84.80 Natekar Raju Mantappa Male SC  Provisionally Admitted

21 59 MH CET 63.54 83.20 Pal Vishwajeet kuber Male OPEN Provisionally Admitted

22 77 MH CET 73.60 90.00 Parmar Pooja Manoj Female OPEN Provisionally Admitted

23 74 MH CET 85.23 93 Patkar Rugved Atul Male OPEN Provisionally Admitted

VISHWAKARMA UNIVERSITY

ADMISSIONS AY 2018-19

PROGRAMME : BTECH MECHANICAL ENGINEERING

FINAL ADMISSIONS AS ON CUT-OFF DATE 



24 60 MH CET 63.08 88.20 Phatangare Siddesh Mukund Male OBC  Provisionally Admitted

25 60 MH CET 52 72 Rajput Sagar Ranjeetsingh Male VJ/DT, NT-A  Provisionally Admitted

26 64 MH CET 62.92 82.20 Sahasrabuddhe Amod Uday Male OPEN Provisionally Admitted

27 68 MH CET 62.92 85.80 Shityalkar Akhilesh Laxman Male OPEN Provisionally Admitted

28 67 VU 61.85 83.60 Suratwala Dhruv Gopal Male OPEN Provisionally Admitted

Sr. No. CET Marks CET Type 12th % 10th % CandidateMarksheetName Gender Category Status

29 66 VU 89.69 91.80 Talbar Akshay Jayant Male OBC  Provisionally Admitted

30 54 MH CET 79 82 Temghare Rushikesh Nivrutti Male OPEN Provisionally Admitted

31 66 MH CET 50.77 87.80 Pawar Rudrasen Chandrakant Male OPEN Provisionally Admitted

32 43 VU 54 86 Rishul Chouhan Male OMS Provisionally Admitted

33 83 MH CET 88.00 91.00 Ghorpade Pratik Shivaji Male OPEN Provisionally Admitted

Sr. No. Category Admissoins

1 OMS 3

2 SC 1

3 ST 0

4 VJ/DT/NT-A 1

5 NT-B 0

6 NT-C 0

7 NT-D 0

8 OBC 7

9 Open 21

Total 33

Date: 01/09/2018  Authorized Signatory

Place: Pune Vishwakarma University

Admission Summary



Sr. No. FacultyName DepartmentName ProgramName CandidateMarksheetName Gender Religion Category 10th % 12th % Diploma%

1 Art & Design Department of Fashion Design B.A. FASHION & APPAREL DESIGN Golekar Sonali Ramprasad Female Hindu OPEN 51.00 NULL 51.13

2 Art & Design Department of Fashion Design B.A. FASHION & APPAREL DESIGN Hadule Poonam Shahadev Female Hindu OPEN 80.40 76

3 Art & Design Department of Fashion Design B.A. FASHION & APPAREL DESIGN Joshi Dhanvee Atul Female Hindu OPEN 76 70.15

4 Art & Design Department of Fashion Design B.A. FASHION & APPAREL DESIGN Malusare Srushti Anand Female Hindu OPEN 85.00 57.69

5 Art & Design Department of Fashion Design B.A. FASHION & APPAREL DESIGN Oswal Daksha Bipinkumar Female Jain OPEN 76.40 68.31

6 Art & Design Department of Fashion Design B.A. FASHION & APPAREL DESIGN Pawar Payal Dipak Female Hindu OPEN 79.40 60.46

7 Art & Design Department of Fashion Design B.A. FASHION & APPAREL DESIGN Kinjal Vilas Sarode Female Hindu OPEN 76 NULL 74.31

8 Art & Design Department of Fashion Design B.A. FASHION & APPAREL DESIGN TUMMA VARSHA SATYANARAYANA Female Hindu SBC  49.60 49.68

9 Art & Design Department of Fashion Design B.A. FASHION & APPAREL DESIGN Javia Diptiben Rajeshbhai Female Hindu All India Candidature Candidates (General OMS)  59.38 65.57

10 Art & Design Department of Fashion Design B.A. FASHION & APPAREL DESIGN Gaikwad Vaishnavi Suryakant Female Hindu OPEN 64.20 62.62

11 Art & Design Department of Fashion Design B.A. FASHION & APPAREL DESIGN Hannure Najmin Bano Mohammed Husain Female Muslim OBC  49.46 48.67

12 Art & Design Department of Fashion Design B.DES. FASHION DESIGN Aundhkar Janhavi Ravindra Female Hindu OBC  8.6 61.85

13 Art & Design Department of Fashion Design B.DES. FASHION DESIGN Tadas Rinkal Deepak Female Hindu OBC  7.8 56.31

14 Art & Design Department of Fashion Design B.DES. FASHION DESIGN Tarayawale Supriya Sikandar Female Hindu NT-B  64.6 78

15 Art & Design Department of Fashion Design M.A. (Fashion & Apparel Design) Kanetkar Shraddha Shrikrushna Female Hindu OPEN 55.73 41.17

16 Art & Design Department of Fashion Design M.A. (Fashion & Apparel Design) Shaikh Roshni Aftab Anwar Female Muslim OPEN 82.28

17 Art & Design Department of Fashion Design M.A. (Fashion & Apparel Design) Tindwani Archana Rajkumar Female Hindu OPEN 45 62

18 Art & Design Department of Fashion Design M.A. (Fashion & Apparel Design) Karanjkar Gauri Anil Female Hindu OBC  84 54

19 Art & Design Department of Graphic Design B.A. GRAPHIC DESIGN & MULTIMEDIA Ahirrao Hemant Manesh Male Hindu OBC  NULL 47.85

20 Art & Design Department of Graphic Design B.A. GRAPHIC DESIGN & MULTIMEDIA Bhirud Rutik Chandrashekhar Male Hindu OBC  86 66

21 Art & Design Department of Graphic Design B.A. GRAPHIC DESIGN & MULTIMEDIA Bombade Kartik Narendra Male Hindu OPEN 66.20 56.15

22 Art & Design Department of Graphic Design B.A. GRAPHIC DESIGN & MULTIMEDIA Chavan Shubham Kailas Male Hindu OPEN 48.20 66.46

23 Art & Design Department of Graphic Design B.A. GRAPHIC DESIGN & MULTIMEDIA Dakle Jainam Santosh Male Jain OPEN 80.20 53.69

24 Art & Design Department of Graphic Design B.A. GRAPHIC DESIGN & MULTIMEDIA Doshi Vidhi Rajesh Female Jain OPEN 69.40 44.61

25 Art & Design Department of Graphic Design B.A. GRAPHIC DESIGN & MULTIMEDIA Gaikwad Shubham Ratansingh Male Hindu SC  58 57.69

26 Art & Design Department of Graphic Design B.A. GRAPHIC DESIGN & MULTIMEDIA Katariya Girish Sunil Male Hindu OPEN 63.80 61.85

27 Art & Design Department of Graphic Design B.A. GRAPHIC DESIGN & MULTIMEDIA Khedkar Sakshi Sanjay Female Hindu OBC  66.20 70.77

28 Art & Design Department of Graphic Design B.A. GRAPHIC DESIGN & MULTIMEDIA Mattani Neha Jitendra Female Hindu OPEN 89.60 85.69

29 Art & Design Department of Graphic Design B.A. GRAPHIC DESIGN & MULTIMEDIA Rahalkar Avanti Heramb Female Hindu OPEN 74.00 71.08

30 Art & Design Department of Graphic Design B.A. GRAPHIC DESIGN & MULTIMEDIA Rathi Kavish Santosh Male Hindu OPEN 72 47.85

31 Art & Design Department of Graphic Design B.A. GRAPHIC DESIGN & MULTIMEDIA Raut Siddharth Namdev Male Hindu OBC  70.20 72.46

32 Art & Design Department of Graphic Design B.A. GRAPHIC DESIGN & MULTIMEDIA Said Riddhi Ashok Female Hindu OPEN 91.40 69.38

33 Art & Design Department of Graphic Design B.A. GRAPHIC DESIGN & MULTIMEDIA Sujal Shashi Male Hindu All India Candidature Candidates (General OMS)  10 64.9

34 Art & Design Department of Graphic Design B.A. GRAPHIC DESIGN & MULTIMEDIA Shinde Dhananjay Sunil Male Hindu SC  63.40 57

35 Art & Design Department of Graphic Design B.A. GRAPHIC DESIGN & MULTIMEDIA Wankhede Harshal Dilip Male Hindu OBC  69.80 56

36 Art & Design Department of Graphic Design B.A. GRAPHIC DESIGN & MULTIMEDIA Ahuja Rohan Rajesh Male Hindu OPEN 54 69.38

Total Admitted Students  2018-19



37 Art & Design Department of Graphic Design B.A. GRAPHIC DESIGN & MULTIMEDIA Bhosale Prabhakar Ramdas Male Hindu OPEN 52 42.83

38 Art & Design Department of Graphic Design B.A. GRAPHIC DESIGN & MULTIMEDIA Gawandalkar Satyam Sanjay Male Hindu OPEN 87.60 NULL 71.30

39 Art & Design Department of Graphic Design B.A. GRAPHIC DESIGN & MULTIMEDIA Jadhav Prashant Ashok Male Hindu OPEN 8.6cgpa 60

40 Art & Design Department of Graphic Design B.A. GRAPHIC DESIGN & MULTIMEDIA Khetre Mrunal Gopal Female Hindu OBC  70 53.69

41 Art & Design Department of Graphic Design B.A. GRAPHIC DESIGN & MULTIMEDIA Lakde Sayali Ramdas Female Hindu NT-C  81.60 56.46

42 Art & Design Department of Graphic Design B.A. GRAPHIC DESIGN & MULTIMEDIA Patil Pratik Shridhar Male Hindu OPEN 51.80 55.85

43 Art & Design Department of Graphic Design B.A. GRAPHIC DESIGN & MULTIMEDIA Sairakesh Kolnati Male Hindu OPEN 9.4cgpa 60

44 Art & Design Department of Graphic Design B.A. GRAPHIC DESIGN & MULTIMEDIA Vara Purvesh Digesh Male Hindu OPEN 74.20 56

45 Art & Design Department of Graphic Design B.A. GRAPHIC DESIGN & MULTIMEDIA Waikar Samir Kadir Male Muslim OPEN 56 51

46 Art & Design Department of Graphic Design B.A. GRAPHIC DESIGN & MULTIMEDIA salvi Rutank Shirin Male Hindu SC  60.40 46

47 Art & Design Department of Graphic Design B.DES. GRAPHIC DESIGN SakshiRahul Chaure Female Hindu SC  82.2 80.62

48 Art & Design Department of Graphic Design B.DES. GRAPHIC DESIGN Chitale Megha Pralhad Female Hindu OPEN 70.40 58.77

49 Art & Design Department of Graphic Design B.DES. GRAPHIC DESIGN CHUGH ISHA ANIL Female Hindu OPEN 67.20 54.15

50 Art & Design Department of Graphic Design B.DES. GRAPHIC DESIGN Deshpande Neeraj Vivek Male Hindu OPEN 75.40 59.23

51 Art & Design Department of Graphic Design B.DES. GRAPHIC DESIGN Galande Sai Mukund Female Hindu OPEN 85 60

52 Art & Design Department of Graphic Design B.DES. GRAPHIC DESIGN Ghodke Rutuja Girish Female Hindu OPEN 65.09 48.92

53 Art & Design Department of Graphic Design B.DES. GRAPHIC DESIGN Gugale Shivani Rajesh Female Jain OPEN 84 70.62

54 Art & Design Department of Graphic Design B.DES. GRAPHIC DESIGN Jain Pooja Siddharth Female Jain OPEN 86.40 84.77

55 Art & Design Department of Graphic Design B.DES. GRAPHIC DESIGN Kulkarni Avani Prasad Female Hindu OPEN 81.60 72.77

56 Art & Design Department of Graphic Design B.DES. GRAPHIC DESIGN Panchal Neha Nitin Female Hindu OPEN 84.71 67.07

57 Art & Design Department of Graphic Design B.DES. GRAPHIC DESIGN Poonam Sampat Patil Female Hindu OPEN 6.2 58.2

58 Art & Design Department of Graphic Design B.DES. GRAPHIC DESIGN MOHD. ANAS QURAISHI Male Muslim All India Candidature Candidates (General OMS)  7.8 CGPA 54.00

59 Art & Design Department of Graphic Design B.DES. GRAPHIC DESIGN Rathod Vinisha Rajesh Female Jain OPEN 10 85.69

60 Art & Design Department of Graphic Design B.DES. GRAPHIC DESIGN Shah Grishma Minesh Female Hindu OPEN 79.80 73.38

61 Art & Design Department of Graphic Design B.DES. GRAPHIC DESIGN Solanki Jinisha Ajit Female Jain OPEN 88.80 78.77

62 Art & Design Department of Graphic Design B.DES. GRAPHIC DESIGN Patil Siddhi Pradeep Female Hindu OBC  74 55.85

63 Art & Design Department of Graphic Design B.DES. GRAPHIC DESIGN Hritika Chaudhari Female Hindu OPEN 84.6 57

64 Art & Design Department of Graphic Design B.DES. GRAPHIC DESIGN Vibhaw Saxena Male Hindu OPEN 8.2 CGPA 58

65 Art & Design Department of Graphic Design M.Des. (Graphic Design) Hanche Nikita Deepak Female Hindu SBC  93 69

66 Art & Design Department of Graphic Design M.Des. (Graphic Design) Nair Ananthu AnilKumar Male Hindu OPEN 71.27 51.85

67 Art & Design Department of Interior Design B.A.INTERIOR DESIGN & DECORATION Amilkanthwar Vaishnavi Pandurang Female Hindu OPEN NULL 68.31

68 Art & Design Department of Interior Design B.A.INTERIOR DESIGN & DECORATION Ansari Aziz Azim Male Muslim OPEN 61 52.77

69 Art & Design Department of Interior Design B.A.INTERIOR DESIGN & DECORATION SHAINEEN BABA FEMALE Muslim All India Candidature Candidates (General OMS)  8.6 CGPA 69.2

70 Art & Design Department of Interior Design B.A.INTERIOR DESIGN & DECORATION Bhadale Neha Sanjay Female Hindu OPEN 88 68

71 Art & Design Department of Interior Design B.A.INTERIOR DESIGN & DECORATION Bhagwat Mahesh Mohan Male Hindu NT-C  84 49.69

72 Art & Design Department of Interior Design B.A.INTERIOR DESIGN & DECORATION Bhilare Aishwarya Sanjay Female Hindu OPEN 89.40 71.69

73 Art & Design Department of Interior Design B.A.INTERIOR DESIGN & DECORATION Chavan Priyanka Prabhu Female Hindu OPEN 63 73

74 Art & Design Department of Interior Design B.A.INTERIOR DESIGN & DECORATION Choudhary Varsha Vanaram Female Hindu OPEN 89.80 60

75 Art & Design Department of Interior Design B.A.INTERIOR DESIGN & DECORATION Deshmukh Samiksha Pradip Female Hindu OPEN 59 64.62

76 Art & Design Department of Interior Design B.A.INTERIOR DESIGN & DECORATION Deshpande Anuja Chandrakant Female Hindu OPEN 94.00 69.54

77 Art & Design Department of Interior Design B.A.INTERIOR DESIGN & DECORATION Gangoli Sudeshna Vinay Female Hindu OPEN 76.80 58.31

78 Art & Design Department of Interior Design B.A.INTERIOR DESIGN & DECORATION Ganjale Srushti Subhash Female Hindu OPEN 93.60 66.46

79 Art & Design Department of Interior Design B.A.INTERIOR DESIGN & DECORATION Goykar Amruta Bhagwat Female Hindu NT-C  54.60 50.77

80 Art & Design Department of Interior Design B.A.INTERIOR DESIGN & DECORATION Hanwate Aniket Kishan Male Hindu SC  73.80 54

81 Art & Design Department of Interior Design B.A.INTERIOR DESIGN & DECORATION Aishwarya Ashok Hase Female Hindu OBC  71 54.47



82 Art & Design Department of Interior Design B.A.INTERIOR DESIGN & DECORATION Hiroli Haneen Abdul Kadeer Female Muslim OPEN 53.40 58.62

83 Art & Design Department of Interior Design B.A.INTERIOR DESIGN & DECORATION Jadhav Gauri Nitin Female Hindu NT-B  76.80 52.31

84 Art & Design Department of Interior Design B.A.INTERIOR DESIGN & DECORATION Jangid Vaibhav Omprakash Male Hindu OPEN

85 Art & Design Department of Interior Design B.A.INTERIOR DESIGN & DECORATION Joshi Sejal Milind Female Hindu OPEN 93.00 80.62

86 Art & Design Department of Interior Design B.A.INTERIOR DESIGN & DECORATION Kadam Amruta Ashok Female Hindu OPEN 78.20 50

87 Art & Design Department of Interior Design B.A.INTERIOR DESIGN & DECORATION Katkar Netra Chandrashekhar Female Hindu OPEN 6.8 CGPA 55.08

88 Art & Design Department of Interior Design B.A.INTERIOR DESIGN & DECORATION Kazi Needa Siraj Female Muslim OPEN 57.60 65.69

89 Art & Design Department of Interior Design B.A.INTERIOR DESIGN & DECORATION Lakhote Bhumika Rajesh Female Hindu OPEN 55.8 73.07

90 Art & Design Department of Interior Design B.A.INTERIOR DESIGN & DECORATION Mohite Shrutika Subhash Female Hindu OPEN 76 45.08

91 Art & Design Department of Interior Design B.A.INTERIOR DESIGN & DECORATION Nannaware Shubham Pradeep Male Hindu OBC  50.40 &nbsp;

92 Art & Design Department of Interior Design B.A.INTERIOR DESIGN & DECORATION Pranjali Balasaheb Nhavale Female Hindu OPEN 78.80 48.31

93 Art & Design Department of Interior Design B.A.INTERIOR DESIGN & DECORATION Rutuja Dwarkojirao Patankar Female Hindu OPEN 51 60

94 Art & Design Department of Interior Design B.A.INTERIOR DESIGN & DECORATION Patel Tahniyat Kafeel Female Muslim OPEN 67.80 73.69

95 Art & Design Department of Interior Design B.A.INTERIOR DESIGN & DECORATION Patil Prathamesh Santosh Male Hindu OBC  56 47.38

96 Art & Design Department of Interior Design B.A.INTERIOR DESIGN & DECORATION Pawar Pranita Yashwant Female Hindu OPEN 70 55 76

97 Art & Design Department of Interior Design B.A.INTERIOR DESIGN & DECORATION Pawar Prathamesh Kishor Male Hindu OBC  64.20 63.38

98 Art & Design Department of Interior Design B.A.INTERIOR DESIGN & DECORATION Potdar Aditya Nitin Male Hindu OPEN 56 62.77 58

99 Art & Design Department of Interior Design B.A.INTERIOR DESIGN & DECORATION Puranik Chaitali Chandrashekhar Female Hindu OPEN 78.80 77.38

100 Art & Design Department of Interior Design B.A.INTERIOR DESIGN & DECORATION Rampurawala Jamila Mufaddal Female Muslim OPEN 70 75.23

101 Art & Design Department of Interior Design B.A.INTERIOR DESIGN & DECORATION Randive Poonam Chandrakant Female Hindu OBC  69 NULL 77

102 Art & Design Department of Interior Design B.A.INTERIOR DESIGN & DECORATION Sankpal Aishwarya Sandip Female Hindu OPEN 82.40 76

103 Art & Design Department of Interior Design B.A.INTERIOR DESIGN & DECORATION Shende Rutuja Popat Female Hindu OBC  84.40 54.92

104 Art & Design Department of Interior Design B.A.INTERIOR DESIGN & DECORATION Sutar Rahul Bajranglal Male Hindu OPEN 78 56.92

105 Art & Design Department of Interior Design B.A.INTERIOR DESIGN & DECORATION Sutar Riddhi Sanjay Female Hindu OPEN 66 53

106 Art & Design Department of Interior Design B.A.INTERIOR DESIGN & DECORATION Tulaskar Bhushan Dattaram Male Hindu OPEN 74.80 63

107 Art & Design Department of Interior Design B.A.INTERIOR DESIGN & DECORATION Udupi Afrazbanu Althaf Female Muslim OPEN 70.00 70.77

108 Art & Design Department of Interior Design B.A.INTERIOR DESIGN & DECORATION Wagh Rutwik Rajesh Male Hindu OPEN 65.20 52.62

109 Art & Design Department of Interior Design B.A.INTERIOR DESIGN & DECORATION Deshpande Pratiksha Hanumantrao Female Hindu OPEN 83.20 53.69

110 Art & Design Department of Interior Design B.A.INTERIOR DESIGN & DECORATION Gupta Preetikumari Kailash Female Hindu OPEN 54.40 61.85

111 Art & Design Department of Interior Design B.A.INTERIOR DESIGN & DECORATION Jadhav Bhakti Sunil Female Hindu OPEN 80.20 54.62

112 Art & Design Department of Interior Design B.A.INTERIOR DESIGN & DECORATION Jaiswar Priya Tulsi Prasad Female Hindu OPEN 49.40 43.69

113 Art & Design Department of Interior Design B.A.INTERIOR DESIGN & DECORATION Pathak Apeksha Ashok Female Hindu OPEN 91.00 69.07

114 Art & Design Department of Interior Design B.A.INTERIOR DESIGN & DECORATION Shinde Aishwarya Ajit Female Hindu OPEN 79.20 62.31

115 Art & Design Department of Interior Design B.A.INTERIOR DESIGN & DECORATION Bhagat Omkar Bhogilal Male Hindu OPEN 83.80 71.38

116 Art & Design Department of Interior Design B.A.INTERIOR DESIGN & DECORATION Chhallani Achal Manoj Female Jain OPEN 83.8 83.85

117 Art & Design Department of Interior Design B.A.INTERIOR DESIGN & DECORATION Jejurkar Mayuri Vijay Female Hindu OBC  87.60 67.69

118 Art & Design Department of Interior Design B.A.INTERIOR DESIGN & DECORATION Mohd Rahman Male Muslim All India Candidature Candidates (General OMS)  48.5 50.8

119 Art & Design Department of Interior Design B.A.INTERIOR DESIGN & DECORATION Divase Megha Ramesh Female Hindu OPEN 70.00 62.00

120 Art & Design Department of Interior Design B.A.INTERIOR DESIGN & DECORATION Mane Deshmukh Vaishnavi Vaijinath Female Hindu OPEN 64.20 61.38

121 Art & Design Department of Interior Design B.A.INTERIOR DESIGN & DECORATION Naidu Kirtika Mahendran Female Hindu OPEN 7.8 CGPA 60.46

122 Art & Design Department of Interior Design B.A.INTERIOR DESIGN & DECORATION Bhosale Sanskruti Vikram Female Hindu OPEN 79.60 58.30

123 Art & Design Department of Interior Design B.A.INTERIOR DESIGN & DECORATION- Lateral EntryBhilare Pratiksha Vikas Female Hindu OPEN 77.40 51.69 68.21

124 Art & Design Department of Interior Design B.A.INTERIOR DESIGN & DECORATION- Lateral EntryKore Bhakti Sanjay Female Hindu OPEN 64.36 44.46 65.05

125 Art & Design Department of Interior Design B.A.INTERIOR DESIGN & DECORATION- Lateral EntryKumbharkar Pooja Kaluram Female Hindu OPEN 78 50

126 Art & Design Department of Interior Design M.A.-INTERIOR DESIGN & DECORATION Aakansha Saxena Female Hindu All India Candidature Candidates (General OMS)  54.50 55.80



127 Art & Design Department of Interior Design M.A.-INTERIOR DESIGN & DECORATION Diya Chakraborty Female Hindu All India Candidature Candidates (General OMS)  84 83

128 Art & Design Department of Interior Design M.A.-INTERIOR DESIGN & DECORATION NIDHI UMESH YAMSANWAR Female Hindu OPEN 7.6 CGPA 83

129 Art & Design Department of Interior Design M.A.-INTERIOR DESIGN & DECORATION Pallavi Uday Mahajan Female Hindu OPEN 8.0 53.17

130 Art & Design Department of Interior Design M.A.-INTERIOR DESIGN & DECORATION Sutar Ravi Bhuraram Male Hindu OBC  49.40 49.67

131 Art & Design Department of Interior Design M.A.-INTERIOR DESIGN & DECORATION Umare Puja Bhaskar Female Buddhist SC  64.40 58.67

132 Art & Design Department of Product Design B.DES. PRODUCT DESIGN Bagmar Saloni Sachin Female Jain OPEN 76.60 76.46

133 Art & Design Department of Product Design B.DES. PRODUCT DESIGN Bankar Om Lalit Male Hindu OPEN 65.80 53.69

134 Art & Design Department of Product Design B.DES. PRODUCT DESIGN Bhujbal Omkar Shahaji Male Hindu OBC  83.30 69.69

135 Art & Design Department of Product Design B.DES. PRODUCT DESIGN Dumbali Vedant Vijaykumar Male Hindu OPEN 8 63

136 Art & Design Department of Product Design B.DES. PRODUCT DESIGN Hardikar Gautami Pramod Female Hindu OPEN 81.20 73.85

137 Art & Design Department of Product Design B.DES. PRODUCT DESIGN Howale Kashmira kishor Female Hindu SC  83.00 77.23

138 Art & Design Department of Product Design B.DES. PRODUCT DESIGN Jadhav Deah Deepak Female Christian OPEN 88 60.92

139 Art & Design Department of Product Design B.DES. PRODUCT DESIGN Jeferani Alifya Imtiaz Female Muslim OPEN 84.80 78.62

140 Art & Design Department of Product Design B.DES. PRODUCT DESIGN Yatish Kapila Male Hindu All India Candidature Candidates (General OMS)  7.4 61.40

141 Art & Design Department of Product Design B.DES. PRODUCT DESIGN Khaparde Natasha Anil Female Hindu SC  73.60 50.77

142 Art & Design Department of Product Design B.DES. PRODUCT DESIGN Kitawat Aanchal Hasmukh Female Jain OPEN 77 67.85

143 Art & Design Department of Product Design B.DES. PRODUCT DESIGN Panse Aarya Manish Female Hindu OPEN 83 61

144 Art & Design Department of Product Design B.DES. PRODUCT DESIGN Purwat Payal Sanjay Female Jain OBC  78.40 64.77

145 Art & Design Department of Product Design B.DES. PRODUCT DESIGN Rigil Roy Male Christian All India Candidature Candidates (General OMS)  64 64

146 Art & Design Department of Product Design B.DES. PRODUCT DESIGN Sadhwani Moksh Pawankumar Male Hindu OPEN 8.4 CGPA 64.31

147 Art & Design Department of Product Design B.DES. PRODUCT DESIGN Samyak Ashutosh Saitwal Male Jain OPEN 89.30 60.40

148 Art & Design Department of Product Design B.DES. PRODUCT DESIGN Sali Sayali Sanjeev Female Hindu SBC  55.80 58

149 Art & Design Department of Product Design B.DES. PRODUCT DESIGN Shah Sandesh Chetan Male Jain OPEN 75.62 55.38

150 Art & Design Department of Product Design B.DES. PRODUCT DESIGN Siddharth Shah Male Jain OPEN 54.43 52

151 Art & Design Department of Product Design B.DES. PRODUCT DESIGN Gaurang Sharma Male Hindu All India Candidature Candidates (General OMS)  7.2 CGPA 57.80

152 Art & Design Department of Product Design B.DES. PRODUCT DESIGN Shinde Ishan Chandrakant Male Hindu OPEN 74 54.3

153 Art & Design Department of Product Design B.DES. PRODUCT DESIGN Shringarpure Raunak Parag Male Hindu OPEN 67.80 66.62

154 Art & Design Department of Product Design B.DES. PRODUCT DESIGN Faizaan Ahmed Siddiqui Male Muslim OPEN 9 69.6

155 Art & Design Department of Product Design B.DES. PRODUCT DESIGN Tathed Rachana Rajesh Female Jain OPEN 86.2 66.77

156 Art & Design Department of Product Design B.DES. PRODUCT DESIGN Thakur Prathamesh Nitin Male Hindu OPEN 80.40 60.77

157 Art & Design Department of Product Design B.DES. PRODUCT DESIGN Mehak Verma Female Hindu All India Candidature Candidates (General OMS)  8.8 75

158 Art & Design Department of Product Design B.DES. PRODUCT DESIGN Bedade Shashank Sharad Male Hindu NT-D  83.20 66.46

159 Art & Design Department of Product Design B.DES. PRODUCT DESIGN Nikam Shaunak Hemant Male Hindu OPEN 88.80 61.36

160 Art & Design Department of Product Design B.DES. PRODUCT DESIGN Thorat Pratik Bajirao Male Hindu OPEN 63.23 46.5 69.6

161 Art & Design Department of Product Design B.DES. PRODUCT DESIGN Sonavane Vedant Vinod Male Hindu SC  67.8 57

162 Art & Design Department of Product Design B.DES. PRODUCT DESIGN Banthia Meet Niraj Male Jain Persons with Disability  59.20 45.20

163 Art & Design Department of Fashion Design B.DES. PRODUCT DESIGN Bhandari Vaishnavi Vikas Female Jain OPEN 84.20 66.15

164 Art & Design Department of Product Design M.Des. (Product Design) Vishwakarma Shail Rajnarayan Male Hindu OPEN 70.61 67.67

165 Commerce & ManagementDepartment of Business Administration Bachelor of Business Administration(BBA) Agarwal Vishal Vinod Male Hindu OPEN 58.60 54.31

166 Commerce & ManagementDepartment of Business Administration Bachelor of Business Administration(BBA) Bafna Prasham Dinesh Male Jain OPEN 76 54.31

167 Commerce & ManagementDepartment of Business Administration Bachelor of Business Administration(BBA) Bansode Sakshi Ashok Female Hindu OBC  76.40 52.15

168 Commerce & ManagementDepartment of Business Administration Bachelor of Business Administration(BBA) Bhagat Vaishnavi Parmananda Female Hindu All India Candidature Candidates (General OMS)  6.8 61

169 Commerce & ManagementDepartment of Business Administration Bachelor of Business Administration(BBA) Sanyogita Dabhade Female Hindu OPEN 8.8 75

170 Commerce & ManagementDepartment of Business Administration Bachelor of Business Administration(BBA) Dabhade Veda Jagdishchandra Female Hindu OPEN 85.00 67.38

171 Commerce & ManagementDepartment of Business Administration Bachelor of Business Administration(BBA) Dasgupta Tushar Kamalkumar Male Hindu OPEN 77.8 92.1



172 Commerce & ManagementDepartment of Business Administration Bachelor of Business Administration(BBA) Dhanawade Vishvajeet Sambhaji Male Hindu OPEN 76.60 47.38

173 Commerce & ManagementDepartment of Business Administration Bachelor of Business Administration(BBA) Dhande Mahesh Ashok Male Hindu OBC  70 50.62

174 Commerce & ManagementDepartment of Business Administration Bachelor of Business Administration(BBA) Dussal Rushikesh Sachin Male Hindu SBC  74.60 50

175 Commerce & ManagementDepartment of Business Administration Bachelor of Business Administration(BBA) Ghodnadiwala Ibrahim Mustafa Male Muslim OPEN 88 76.31

176 Commerce & ManagementDepartment of Business Administration Bachelor of Business Administration(BBA) Irani Anoush Gayomard Male Zoroastrian OPEN 68.80 64.60

177 Commerce & ManagementDepartment of Business Administration Bachelor of Business Administration(BBA) Jagtap Pritam Sanjay Male Hindu OPEN 79.60 51.23

178 Commerce & ManagementDepartment of Business Administration Bachelor of Business Administration(BBA) Jain Gaurav Devichand Male Jain OPEN 77.00 70.00

179 Commerce & ManagementDepartment of Business Administration Bachelor of Business Administration(BBA) KALE ONKAR KIRAN Male Hindu OBC  81.00 66.70

180 Commerce & ManagementDepartment of Business Administration Bachelor of Business Administration(BBA) Kare Suhas Ashok Male Hindu NT-C  80.80 65.38

181 Commerce & ManagementDepartment of Business Administration Bachelor of Business Administration(BBA) Kawde Bhavesh Nandkumar Male Hindu OPEN 62 60.77

182 Commerce & ManagementDepartment of Business Administration Bachelor of Business Administration(BBA) Kulkarni Maitreyee Harshad Female Hindu OPEN 71.45 54.77

183 Commerce & ManagementDepartment of Business Administration Bachelor of Business Administration(BBA) Mandlik Gaurav Vijay Male Hindu OBC  80.40 54.31

184 Commerce & ManagementDepartment of Business Administration Bachelor of Business Administration(BBA) Munot Anand Ajit Male Hindu OPEN 80.90 80.92

185 Commerce & ManagementDepartment of Business Administration Bachelor of Business Administration(BBA) Nageshi Pooja Parmeshwar Female Hindu OPEN 64 75.54

186 Commerce & ManagementDepartment of Business Administration Bachelor of Business Administration(BBA) Nigade Anurag Nandkumar Male Hindu OPEN 83.60 51.85

187 Commerce & ManagementDepartment of Business Administration Bachelor of Business Administration(BBA) Oswal Bhavesh Hasmukh Male Jain OPEN 87.80 68.31

188 Commerce & ManagementDepartment of Business Administration Bachelor of Business Administration(BBA) Pai Sai Nath Male Hindu All India Candidature Candidates (General OMS)  67.80 52.00

189 Commerce & ManagementDepartment of Business Administration Bachelor of Business Administration(BBA) Pasalkar Atharva Yuvaraj Male Hindu OPEN 83.80 50.92

190 Commerce & ManagementDepartment of Business Administration Bachelor of Business Administration(BBA) Patel Kaushik Dinesh Male Hindu OPEN 76 58

191 Commerce & ManagementDepartment of Business Administration Bachelor of Business Administration(BBA) Yogesh Patel Male Hindu All India Candidature Candidates (General OMS)  84 67

192 Commerce & ManagementDepartment of Business Administration Bachelor of Business Administration(BBA) Patel Yogikumar Shaileshbhai Male Hindu OPEN 54 48

193 Commerce & ManagementDepartment of Business Administration Bachelor of Business Administration(BBA) Prajapati Mahesh Rajesh Male Hindu OPEN 47.60 42.46

194 Commerce & ManagementDepartment of Business Administration Bachelor of Business Administration(BBA) Raja Kaizar Muffadal Male Muslim OPEN 84 82

195 Commerce & ManagementDepartment of Business Administration Bachelor of Business Administration(BBA) Shresht Rana Male Hindu All India Candidature Candidates (General OMS)  7.2 56

196 Commerce & ManagementDepartment of Business Administration Bachelor of Business Administration(BBA) Ranjane Tanishq Sunil Male Hindu OPEN 79.8 80.46

197 Commerce & ManagementDepartment of Business Administration Bachelor of Business Administration(BBA) Ranka Darshan Niranjan Male Jain OPEN 52 53.23

198 Commerce & ManagementDepartment of Business Administration Bachelor of Business Administration(BBA) Shah Krish Rajesh Male Jain OPEN 71.40 58.76

199 Commerce & ManagementDepartment of Business Administration Bachelor of Business Administration(BBA) Shah Rushil Sanjay Male Jain OPEN 75.60 62.62

200 Commerce & ManagementDepartment of Business Administration Bachelor of Business Administration(BBA) Shah Smit Sameer Male Hindu OPEN 71.40 58.76

201 Commerce & ManagementDepartment of Business Administration Bachelor of Business Administration(BBA) Shaikh Zaid Munir Male Muslim OPEN 64 54

202 Commerce & ManagementDepartment of Business Administration Bachelor of Business Administration(BBA) Shinde Rushikesh Digambar Male Hindu OPEN 83.17 73.08

203 Commerce & ManagementDepartment of Business Administration Bachelor of Business Administration(BBA) Sirvi Mahesh Dhanraj Male Hindu All India Candidature Candidates (General OMS)  86 83.08

204 Commerce & ManagementDepartment of Business Administration Bachelor of Business Administration(BBA) Solanki Piyush Fulchand Male Hindu OPEN 81.80 77.54

205 Commerce & ManagementDepartment of Business Administration Bachelor of Business Administration(BBA) SOLANKI PREM JETHARAM Male Hindu OPEN 57.40 50.31

206 Commerce & ManagementDepartment of Business Administration Bachelor of Business Administration(BBA) Tiwari Gaurav Kumar Krishnakant Male Hindu All India Candidature Candidates (General OMS)  72.16 77.8

207 Commerce & ManagementDepartment of Business Administration Bachelor of Business Administration(BBA) Waikar Aquib Imtiyaz Male Muslim OPEN 76.60 60

208 Commerce & ManagementDepartment of Business Administration Bachelor of Business Administration(BBA) Wattamwar Shubham Vilas Male Hindu OPEN 58.20 70.77

209 Commerce & ManagementDepartment of Business Administration Bachelor of Business Administration(BBA) Jayesh Dewangan Male Hindu OPEN 6.6CGPA 44.04

210 Commerce & ManagementDepartment of Business Administration Bachelor of Business Administration(BBA) Faldu Parin Ashwin Male Hindu OPEN 68.60 66.31

211 Commerce & ManagementDepartment of Business Administration Bachelor of Business Administration(BBA) Jaiswal Nishant Pradeep Male Hindu OPEN 7.2CGPA 61.85

212 Commerce & ManagementDepartment of Business Administration Bachelor of Business Administration(BBA) Kadam Nishikant Shahaji Male Hindu OPEN 69.40 55.8

213 Commerce & ManagementDepartment of Business Administration Bachelor of Business Administration(BBA) KADAM PRATHAMESH SANJAY Male Hindu OPEN 80.60 62.15

214 Commerce & ManagementDepartment of Business Administration Bachelor of Business Administration(BBA) Kale Kunal Rupesh Male Hindu OBC  86.20 63.54

215 Commerce & ManagementDepartment of Business Administration Bachelor of Business Administration(BBA) Nalawade Aditya Anil Male Hindu OPEN 89.60 58.00

216 Commerce & ManagementDepartment of Business Administration Bachelor of Business Administration(BBA) Oswal Pranay Pramod Male Jain OPEN 70.40 62.15



217 Commerce & ManagementDepartment of Business Administration Bachelor of Business Administration(BBA) RAJPUROHIT HIMANSHU RAMESH KUMAR Male Hindu OPEN 64.60 68.77

218 Commerce & ManagementDepartment of Business Administration Bachelor of Business Administration(BBA) Shinde Abhishek Raviraj Male Hindu SC  64.40 51.08

219 Commerce & ManagementDepartment of Business Administration Bachelor of Business Administration(BBA) Burhanuddin Murtuza Hafizji Male Muslim All India Candidature Candidates (General OMS)  6.0 68

220 Commerce & ManagementDepartment of Business Administration Bachelor of Business Administration(BBA) Dalawat Ajaypalsingh Karansingh Male Hindu OPEN 53.20 43.69

221 Commerce & ManagementDepartment of Business Administration Bachelor of Business Administration(BBA) Holkar Yash Rahul Male Hindu SC  52.60 52.15

222 Commerce & ManagementDepartment of Business Administration Bachelor of Business Administration(BBA) Jain Bhairav Kiranraj Male Jain OPEN 65 64

223 Commerce & ManagementDepartment of Business Administration Bachelor of Business Administration(BBA) Nalawade Siddhant Sunil Male Hindu OPEN 61 48.31

224 Commerce & ManagementDepartment of Business Administration Bachelor of Business Administration(BBA) Ruparel Bhavin Dilip Male Hindu OPEN 73.20 62.15

225 Commerce & ManagementDepartment of Business Administration Bachelor of Business Administration(BBA) Sadigale Mrinal Vijaykumar Female Hindu OPEN 6.0 47.23

226 Commerce & ManagementDepartment of Business Administration Bachelor of Business Administration(BBA) Satpute Kiran Ankush Male Hindu OPEN 72.60 59.38

227 Commerce & ManagementDepartment of Business Administration Bachelor of Business Administration(BBA) Thopate Sanket Shivaji Male Hindu OBC  86.20 NULL 76.97

228 Commerce & ManagementDepartment of Business Administration Bachelor of Business Administration(BBA) Zoting Aditya Arun Male Hindu OPEN 69.40 54.15

229 Commerce & ManagementDepartment of Business Administration Bachelor of Business Administration(BBA) Akash Nitin Bajaj Male Hindu OPEN 62.20 43

230 Commerce & ManagementDepartment of Business Administration Bachelor of Business Administration(BBA) Dadhaniya Arpit Rajeshbhai Male Hindu OPEN 68.60 46.46

231 Commerce & ManagementDepartment of Business Administration Bachelor of Business Administration(BBA) KhilariAniket Dattatraya Male Hindu OPEN 70.40 47.54

232 Commerce & ManagementDepartment of Business Administration Bachelor of Business Administration(BBA) Kuldeep Patel Male Hindu All India Candidature Candidates (General OMS)  6.8 CGPA 62

233 Commerce & ManagementDepartment of Business Administration Bachelor of Business Administration(BBA) Shetty Bhavesh Sudhakar Male Hindu OPEN 7.4 CGPA NULL 46.62

234 Commerce & ManagementDepartment of Business Administration Bachelor of Business Administration(BBA) Waje Aniket Rohidas Male Hindu ST  72.80 60.46

235 Commerce & ManagementDepartment of Business Administration Bachelor of Business Administration(BBA) Balai Achal Abhay Female Jain OPEN 90.20 84.5

236 Commerce & ManagementDepartment of Business Administration Bachelor of Business Administration(BBA) Kajale Om Santosh Male Hindu OBC  6.2CGPA 49.08

237 Commerce & ManagementDepartment of Business Administration Bachelor of Business Administration(BBA) Deora Ravindrasingh Manohar Male Hindu OPEN 65.80 52.31

238 Commerce & ManagementDepartment of Business Administration Bachelor of Business Administration(BBA) Wattamwar Sagar Sachin Male Hindu OPEN 58.20 70.77

239 Commerce & ManagementDepartment of Business Administration Bachelor of Business Administration(BBA) Ghorpade Utkarsh Uttam Male Hindu OPEN 91 49

240 Commerce & ManagementDepartment of Business Administration Bachelor of Business Administration(BBA) Wadkar Aniket Suresh Male Hindu OPEN 77.80 52.92

241 Commerce & ManagementDepartment of Business Administration Bachelor of Business Administration(BBA) Abbas Mansoor Taxiwala Male Muslim All India Candidature Candidates (General OMS)  62.7 63.4

242 Commerce & ManagementDepartment of Business Administration Bachelor of Business Administration(BBA) Muskan Ahuja Female Hindu All India Candidature Candidates (General OMS)  58.8 64.8

243 Commerce & ManagementDepartment of Business Administration Bachelor of Business Administration(BBA)- Lateral Entry Aga Shehbaaz Mansoor Male Muslim OPEN 73.60 64.62

244 Commerce & ManagementDepartment of Management Master of Business Administration(MBA) Aman Sonar Male Hindu OPEN 60 59.20

245 Commerce & ManagementDepartment of Management Master of Business Administration(MBA) Anjali Kumari Female Hindu All India Candidature Candidates (General OMS)  8.8cgpa 63.8

246 Commerce & ManagementDepartment of Management Master of Business Administration(MBA) Chavan Aditya Ravikant Male Hindu OPEN 74.18 67.08

247 Commerce & ManagementDepartment of Management Master of Business Administration(MBA) Dhanashree Rajendra Kunjir Female Hindu OPEN 64.18 55.08

248 Commerce & ManagementDepartment of Management Master of Business Administration(MBA) Gandhi Shreeya Nitin Female Hindu OPEN 84.16 62.00

249 Commerce & ManagementDepartment of Management Master of Business Administration(MBA) Gapat Amruta Ashok Female Hindu OPEN 90 62.77

250 Commerce & ManagementDepartment of Management Master of Business Administration(MBA) Gomare Gitanjali Govind Female Hindu OBC  84.36 61.83

251 Commerce & ManagementDepartment of Management Master of Business Administration(MBA) Gujar Kunal Umesh Male Hindu OPEN 74.36 67.83

252 Commerce & ManagementDepartment of Management Master of Business Administration(MBA) Hankare Asmita Vasant Female Hindu SC  84.91 61.83

253 Commerce & ManagementDepartment of Management Master of Business Administration(MBA) Ikram Ahmed Naveed Ahmed Male Muslim OPEN 70.91 53.23

254 Commerce & ManagementDepartment of Management Master of Business Administration(MBA) Jadhav Ashitosh Sambhaji Male Hindu OPEN 54.73 59.38

255 Commerce & ManagementDepartment of Management Master of Business Administration(MBA) Jaideep Kiran Nadkarni Male Hindu OPEN 77.27 80.31

256 Commerce & ManagementDepartment of Management Master of Business Administration(MBA) Jeet Kamlesh Patel Male Hindu OBC  63.45 51.17

257 Commerce & ManagementDepartment of Management Master of Business Administration(MBA) Kanjar Jay Hasmukh Shobhana Male Hindu OPEN 73.09 55.50

258 Commerce & ManagementDepartment of Management Master of Business Administration(MBA) Kasture shreenath Basaveshwar Male Hindu OPEN 74.60 65.23

259 Commerce & ManagementDepartment of Management Master of Business Administration(MBA) Kulkarni Vaidehi Vivek Female Hindu OPEN 68 64

260 Commerce & ManagementDepartment of Management Master of Business Administration(MBA) Kulkarni Varad Vinod Male Hindu OPEN 83.20 67.85

261 Commerce & ManagementDepartment of Management Master of Business Administration(MBA) Kumthekar Riddhi Girish Female Hindu OPEN 84.55 84.15



262 Commerce & ManagementDepartment of Management Master of Business Administration(MBA) Kurhade Vaishnavi Sanjay Female Hindu OPEN 78.55 45.17

263 Commerce & ManagementDepartment of Management Master of Business Administration(MBA) Kushendra Singh Chandel Male Hindu All India Candidature Candidates (General OMS)  6.4 CGPA 69.20 

264 Commerce & ManagementDepartment of Management Master of Business Administration(MBA) Lahoti Rishi Vishnu Male Hindu OPEN 72.55 69.08

265 Commerce & ManagementDepartment of Management Master of Business Administration(MBA) Maharshi Shukla Male Hindu All India Candidature Candidates (General OMS)  7.2 71.20

266 Commerce & ManagementDepartment of Management Master of Business Administration(MBA) Narsale Sayali Ambadas Female Hindu OBC  85.09 77.23

267 Commerce & ManagementDepartment of Management Master of Business Administration(MBA) Nazaifnazim Zameerpasha Patait Male Muslim All India Candidature Candidates (General OMS)  37.76 73

268 Commerce & ManagementDepartment of Management Master of Business Administration(MBA) Pathak Niraj Anil Male Hindu OPEN 83.82 68

269 Commerce & ManagementDepartment of Management Master of Business Administration(MBA) Patil Snehal Bhalchandra Female Jain OPEN 82.40 75.00

270 Commerce & ManagementDepartment of Management Master of Business Administration(MBA) Pokharkar Pratik Prabhakar Male Hindu OPEN 82.92 48.83 79.00

271 Commerce & ManagementDepartment of Management Master of Business Administration(MBA) Renake Onkar Pravin Male Hindu OBC  80 76

272 Commerce & ManagementDepartment of Management Master of Business Administration(MBA) Roy Nikita Moni Female Christian All India Candidature Candidates (General OMS)  6.2 CGPA 56.6

273 Commerce & ManagementDepartment of Management Master of Business Administration(MBA) Ruchi Vishwakarma Female Hindu All India Candidature Candidates (General OMS)  7.2 70

274 Commerce & ManagementDepartment of Management Master of Business Administration(MBA) Sambhus Pushkar Pramod Male Hindu OPEN 78 55

275 Commerce & ManagementDepartment of Management Master of Business Administration(MBA) Shaikh Sajeda Mahamad Female Muslim OPEN 78.36 57.38

276 Commerce & ManagementDepartment of Management Master of Business Administration(MBA) SHARMA AISHWARYA ASHOK Female Christian OPEN 78.91 64.62

277 Commerce & ManagementDepartment of Management Master of Business Administration(MBA) SHETTY SAKSHI BHASKAR Female Hindu OPEN 79.82 79.69

278 Commerce & ManagementDepartment of Management Master of Business Administration(MBA) Sonali Mane Female Hindu OPEN 60.66 58.9

279 Commerce & ManagementDepartment of Management Master of Business Administration(MBA) Surve Ashish Shivaji Male Hindu OBC  78.18 58.83

280 Commerce & ManagementDepartment of Management Master of Business Administration(MBA) Udawant Vishal Venkatesh Male Hindu OBC  65.64 62.00

281 Commerce & ManagementDepartment of Management Master of Business Administration(MBA) Undale Harshada Vijay Female Hindu SBC  60 66.31

282 Commerce & ManagementDepartment of Management Master of Business Administration(MBA) Undale Prajakta Vijay Female Hindu SBC  43.64 56

283 Commerce & ManagementDepartment of Management Master of Business Administration(MBA) Vibhute Rhea Ravindra Female Hindu OPEN 86.36 90.31

284 Commerce & ManagementDepartment of Management Master of Business Administration(MBA) Vibhute Ritika Ravindra Female Hindu OPEN 72.80 70

285 Commerce & ManagementDepartment of Management Master of Business Administration(MBA) Vijay Singh Male Hindu All India Candidature Candidates (General OMS)  58.56 68.33

286 Commerce & ManagementDepartment of Management Master of Business Administration(MBA) VIRAAJ SRIVASTAVA Male Hindu All India Candidature Candidates (General OMS)  5.8 CGPA 57

287 Commerce & ManagementDepartment of Management Master of Business Administration(MBA) Vora Chirag Shravan Male Hindu OPEN 72.91 52

288 Commerce & ManagementDepartment of Management Master of Business Administration(MBA) Yadav Jayesh Narendra Male Hindu OPEN 62 44.5

289 Commerce & ManagementDepartment of Management Master of Business Administration(MBA) Zaineb Yusufbhai Madarwala Female Muslim All India Candidature Candidates (General OMS)  64.83 56.65

290 Commerce & ManagementDepartment of Management Master of Business Administration(MBA) Zende Sakshi Dilip Female Hindu OPEN 84 60.63

291 Commerce & ManagementDepartment of Management Master of Business Administration(MBA) Chavanda Shakhambari Chandrashekhar Female Hindu OBC  75.80 54.83

292 Commerce & ManagementDepartment of Management Master of Business Administration(MBA) Mohite Janhavi Ajay Female Hindu OPEN 89.40 66.92

293 Commerce & ManagementDepartment of Management Master of Business Administration(MBA) More Kanchan Vasant Female Hindu OPEN 68.40 80

294 Commerce & ManagementDepartment of Management Master of Business Administration(MBA) Mahulkar Priyanka Suresh Female Hindu SC  58.00 50.00

295 Commerce & ManagementDepartment of Management Master of Business Administration(MBA) Hibare Viraj Pradnyan Male Hindu OBC  72.91 55.23

296 Commerce & ManagementDepartment of Management Master of Business Administration(MBA) Ajay Singh Bargoti Male Hindu OPEN 65 66

297 Commerce & ManagementDepartment of Management Master of Business Administration(MBA) Animesh Sharan Male Hindu OPEN 71 51

298 Commerce & ManagementDepartment of Management Master of Business Administration(MBA) Chanan Anuj Male Hindu OPEN 63 65

299 Commerce & ManagementDepartment of Management Master of Business Administration(MBA) Desai Yogesh Bharat Male Hindu OPEN 72.3 72

300 Commerce & ManagementDepartment of Management Master of Business Administration(MBA) Dinesh Kumar Jha Male Hindu OPEN 62 51

301 Commerce & ManagementDepartment of Management Master of Business Administration(MBA) Gopakumar N. Male Hindu All India Candidature Candidates (General OMS)  54.80 58

302 Commerce & ManagementDepartment of Management Master of Business Administration(MBA) Kaushik Goswami Male Hindu OPEN 72.8 75.6

303 Commerce & ManagementDepartment of Management Master of Business Administration(MBA) Maj Vinay Sharma Male Hindu OPEN 78 55

304 Commerce & ManagementDepartment of Management Master of Business Administration(MBA) Mohan Vishvanath Bhalsing Male Hindu OPEN

305 Commerce & ManagementDepartment of Management Master of Business Administration(MBA) Rajdeo Sunil Ramdas Male Hindu OPEN 62.57 52.17

306 Commerce & ManagementDepartment of Management Master of Business Administration(MBA) Ramnathkar Indraneel Pramod Male Hindu OPEN 56.8 61.5



307 Commerce & ManagementDepartment of Management Master of Business Administration(MBA) Sarkar Amit Ashok Male Hindu OPEN  57

308 Commerce & ManagementDepartment of Management Master of Business Administration(MBA) Sumeet Baxi Male Hindu OPEN 57.2 66

309 Commerce & ManagementDepartment of Management Master of Business Administration(MBA) SUNIT SINGH Male Hindu All India Candidature Candidates (General OMS)  59 63

310 Commerce & ManagementDepartment of Management Master of Business Administration(MBA) Tarun Khanna Male Hindu OPEN 5.5 5.3

311 Commerce & ManagementDepartment of Management Master of Business Administration(MBA) Vikas Katoch Male Hindu All India Candidature Candidates (General OMS)  60.80 61.40

312 Commerce & ManagementDepartment of Management Master of Business Administration(MBA)  K S Jankiram Male Hindu All India Candidature Candidates (General OMS)  

313 Sciences & TechnologyDepartment of Computer Engineering B.Tech.- Computer Engineering Abbas Behrainwala Male Muslim All India Candidature Candidates (General OMS)  8.6cgpa 73.6

314 Sciences & TechnologyDepartment of Computer Engineering B.Tech.- Computer Engineering Abhishek Pandey Male Hindu All India Candidature Candidates (General OMS)  7.6 CGPA 59

315 Sciences & TechnologyDepartment of Computer Engineering B.Tech.- Computer Engineering Adarsh Raj Male Hindu All India Candidature Candidates (General OMS)  85 58.6

316 Sciences & TechnologyDepartment of Computer Engineering B.Tech.- Computer Engineering Adekar Shrinivas Rajkumar Male Hindu OPEN 84.12 59.07

317 Sciences & TechnologyDepartment of Computer Engineering B.Tech.- Computer Engineering Aishwarya Ramakrishnan Female Hindu OPEN 87.28 59.08

318 Sciences & TechnologyDepartment of Computer Engineering B.Tech.- Computer Engineering AKSHIT KANERIYA Male Hindu OPEN 9.4 CGPA 61

319 Sciences & TechnologyDepartment of Computer Engineering B.Tech.- Computer Engineering Amar Saxena Male Hindu All India Candidature Candidates (General OMS)  9.4 92.4

320 Sciences & TechnologyDepartment of Computer Engineering B.Tech.- Computer Engineering Anant Jaiswal Male Hindu All India Candidature Candidates (General OMS)  82 83

321 Sciences & TechnologyDepartment of Computer Engineering B.Tech.- Computer Engineering ANIKET R. JAIN Male Jain All India Candidature Candidates (General OMS)  7.8 CGPA 72

322 Sciences & TechnologyDepartment of Computer Engineering B.Tech.- Computer Engineering Anindya Lalit Kothari Male Hindu OPEN 98 77.38 0

323 Sciences & TechnologyDepartment of Computer Engineering B.Tech.- Computer Engineering Arvi Mohd Farzan Ekram Male Muslim OPEN 87.60 70

324 Sciences & TechnologyDepartment of Computer Engineering B.Tech.- Computer Engineering AtharvaVijayanand Gham Male Hindu OBC  9.2 58.8

325 Sciences & TechnologyDepartment of Computer Engineering B.Tech.- Computer Engineering Ayyanagaoudar Priyanka Prakashgouda Female Hindu OPEN 78 65.59

326 Sciences & TechnologyDepartment of Computer Engineering B.Tech.- Computer Engineering Bagade Atharva Sanjaykumar Male Hindu OBC  69.40 48.3 0

327 Sciences & TechnologyDepartment of Computer Engineering B.Tech.- Computer Engineering Bagalkote Mohd Amaan Mohd Iqbal Male Muslim OPEN 76.80 51.54

328 Sciences & TechnologyDepartment of Computer Engineering B.Tech.- Computer Engineering Balasinorwala Taher Saifuddin Male Muslim OPEN 72 54.62

329 Sciences & TechnologyDepartment of Computer Engineering B.Tech.- Computer Engineering Bhatt Tirth Dhruv Male Hindu All India Candidature Candidates (General OMS)  83 72.9

330 Sciences & TechnologyDepartment of Computer Engineering B.Tech.- Computer Engineering Bherde Srushti Sadanand Female Hindu OPEN 89.6 65

331 Sciences & TechnologyDepartment of Computer Engineering B.Tech.- Computer Engineering Choudhary Kundan Manoj Male Hindu OPEN 52.80 50.31

332 Sciences & TechnologyDepartment of Computer Engineering B.Tech.- Computer Engineering Choudhary Rajat Jain Male Hindu OPEN 85.17 78

333 Sciences & TechnologyDepartment of Computer Engineering B.Tech.- Computer Engineering Desai Omkar Vijaysinh Male Hindu OPEN 93 80

334 Sciences & TechnologyDepartment of Computer Engineering B.Tech.- Computer Engineering Deshpande Juily Yogesh Female Hindu OPEN 90 77.69

335 Sciences & TechnologyDepartment of Computer Engineering B.Tech.- Computer Engineering Devsani Uday Kumar Male Hindu SBC  57.40 53.08

336 Sciences & TechnologyDepartment of Computer Engineering B.Tech.- Computer Engineering Dhakre Sarthak Yashwant Male Hindu OBC  86 81

337 Sciences & TechnologyDepartment of Computer Engineering B.Tech.- Computer Engineering Dyasa Avinash Veerbasappa Male Hindu All India Candidature Candidates (General OMS)  74.80 67.85

338 Sciences & TechnologyDepartment of Computer Engineering B.Tech.- Computer Engineering Gadiya Akash Nilesh Male Jain OPEN 74.60 65.23

339 Sciences & TechnologyDepartment of Computer Engineering B.Tech.- Computer Engineering Gadiya Mohit Abhay Male Jain OPEN 82.17 74.31

340 Sciences & TechnologyDepartment of Computer Engineering B.Tech.- Computer Engineering Gaikwad Atharv Sushil Male Hindu NT-B  7 52.46

341 Sciences & TechnologyDepartment of Computer Engineering B.Tech.- Computer Engineering Gangwani Mohit Jitendra Male Hindu OPEN 7.2 52

342 Sciences & TechnologyDepartment of Computer Engineering B.Tech.- Computer Engineering Gaurav Singh Dafauti Male Hindu OPEN 83 72.9

343 Sciences & TechnologyDepartment of Computer Engineering B.Tech.- Computer Engineering Ghatpande Chinmay Shreetosh Male Hindu OPEN 82 63.23

344 Sciences & TechnologyDepartment of Computer Engineering B.Tech.- Computer Engineering Ghavghave Nachiket Vinod Male Hindu OBC  74.40 55.38

345 Sciences & TechnologyDepartment of Computer Engineering B.Tech.- Computer Engineering Ghosh Animesh Kunal Male Hindu OPEN 91.40 79.54 0

346 Sciences & TechnologyDepartment of Computer Engineering B.Tech.- Computer Engineering Gonde Patil Kshitij Pandharinath Male Hindu OPEN 88.80 63

347 Sciences & TechnologyDepartment of Computer Engineering B.Tech.- Computer Engineering Hadbe Prasad Angadrao Male Hindu NT-D  82.40 58.15

348 Sciences & TechnologyDepartment of Computer Engineering B.Tech.- Computer Engineering Haider Ali Male Muslim All India Candidature Candidates (General OMS)  9 CGPA 70

349 Sciences & TechnologyDepartment of Computer Engineering B.Tech.- Computer Engineering Harshit Tiwari Male Hindu All India Candidature Candidates (General OMS)  9.2 58.8

350 Sciences & TechnologyDepartment of Computer Engineering B.Tech.- Computer Engineering Jagtiani Karan Mahesh Male Hindu OPEN 74.1 56.3

351 Sciences & TechnologyDepartment of Computer Engineering B.Tech.- Computer Engineering Jain Kushal Milind Male Jain OPEN 67.00 62.15



352 Sciences & TechnologyDepartment of Computer Engineering B.Tech.- Computer Engineering Jain Mihir Santosh Male Jain OPEN 83.14 66.16

353 Sciences & TechnologyDepartment of Computer Engineering B.Tech.- Computer Engineering Jain Nikita Dharmendra Female Jain OPEN 82.00 63.08

354 Sciences & TechnologyDepartment of Computer Engineering B.Tech.- Computer Engineering Jogdand Akanksha Anil Female Buddhist SC  8.8 68.60

355 Sciences & TechnologyDepartment of Computer Engineering B.Tech.- Computer Engineering Joshi Mayank Mangesh Male Hindu OPEN 8.6 55.5

356 Sciences & TechnologyDepartment of Computer Engineering B.Tech.- Computer Engineering Kakade Aditya Vijay Male Hindu OPEN 87 52

357 Sciences & TechnologyDepartment of Computer Engineering B.Tech.- Computer Engineering karanjkar shreyas pankaj Male Hindu OBC  88.80 69.54

358 Sciences & TechnologyDepartment of Computer Engineering B.Tech.- Computer Engineering Kavya Sagwaria Female Hindu All India Candidature Candidates (General OMS)  81.7 54

359 Sciences & TechnologyDepartment of Computer Engineering B.Tech.- Computer Engineering Khamkar Vaishnavi Haripandit Female Hindu OBC  85 58.6

360 Sciences & TechnologyDepartment of Computer Engineering B.Tech.- Computer Engineering Khan Mohammad Feroz Haider Ali Male Muslim OPEN 81.20 62.46

361 Sciences & TechnologyDepartment of Computer Engineering B.Tech.- Computer Engineering Khanderiya Manav Jeetendrakumar Male Hindu All India Candidature Candidates (General OMS)  78 53

362 Sciences & TechnologyDepartment of Computer Engineering B.Tech.- Computer Engineering Kharwadkar Om Sumedh Male Hindu OPEN 89 56

363 Sciences & TechnologyDepartment of Computer Engineering B.Tech.- Computer Engineering Kshirsagar Sanika Vivek Female Hindu OPEN 95.80 80.46

364 Sciences & TechnologyDepartment of Computer Engineering B.Tech.- Computer Engineering Lalwani Nikhil Dilip Male Jain OPEN 92.40 68.15

365 Sciences & TechnologyDepartment of Computer Engineering B.Tech.- Computer Engineering Lodhiya Vishal piyushbhai Male Hindu All India Candidature Candidates (General OMS)  72 43.8

366 Sciences & TechnologyDepartment of Computer Engineering B.Tech.- Computer Engineering Mahajan Ashutosh Sharad Male Hindu OPEN 83.40 65.85

367 Sciences & TechnologyDepartment of Computer Engineering B.Tech.- Computer Engineering MAHIMA NIMBALKAR Female Hindu OPEN 80.30 75.60

368 Sciences & TechnologyDepartment of Computer Engineering B.Tech.- Computer Engineering Pawar Prathamesh Vivek Male Hindu OPEN 9.4 80.40

369 Sciences & TechnologyDepartment of Computer Engineering B.Tech.- Computer Engineering Chavan Abhishek Bhagvat Male Hindu OPEN 56 55

370 Sciences & TechnologyDepartment of Computer Engineering B.Tech.- Computer Engineering Malay Khakhar Male Hindu All India Candidature Candidates (General OMS)  95 68

371 Sciences & TechnologyDepartment of Computer Engineering B.Tech.- Computer Engineering MANKE SOMIL MILIND Male Hindu OPEN 92.00 73.50

372 Sciences & TechnologyDepartment of Computer Engineering B.Tech.- Computer Engineering Marda Aditya Ravindra Male Hindu OPEN 88.55 52.33

373 Sciences & TechnologyDepartment of Computer Engineering B.Tech.- Computer Engineering Mitra Ananya Pradyot Female Hindu OPEN 90.4 81.23 0

374 Sciences & TechnologyDepartment of Computer Engineering B.Tech.- Computer Engineering Mohammed Basheer Jaffer ali Male Muslim OPEN 56.40 53.08

375 Sciences & TechnologyDepartment of Computer Engineering B.Tech.- Computer Engineering Mohite Kshitija Kiran Female Hindu OPEN 91.00 70.31

376 Sciences & TechnologyDepartment of Computer Engineering B.Tech.- Computer Engineering MULE PRANAV SAHEBRAO Male Hindu OPEN 86.80 64.15

377 Sciences & TechnologyDepartment of Computer Engineering B.Tech.- Computer Engineering Muley Sumedh Aniruddha Male Hindu OPEN 80.40 73.69

378 Sciences & TechnologyDepartment of Computer Engineering B.Tech.- Computer Engineering Nagepatil Tanmay Rajesh Male Hindu OPEN 91 62.31

379 Sciences & TechnologyDepartment of Computer Engineering B.Tech.- Computer Engineering Nahar Yash Nitin Male Hindu OPEN 87.60 69.38

380 Sciences & TechnologyDepartment of Computer Engineering B.Tech.- Computer Engineering Navale Anish Pradeep Male Jain OPEN 82.00 66.00

381 Sciences & TechnologyDepartment of Computer Engineering B.Tech.- Computer Engineering NAVIN BUBNA Male Hindu All India Candidature Candidates (General OMS)  6.2 CGPA 52.60

382 Sciences & TechnologyDepartment of Computer Engineering B.Tech.- Computer Engineering Navlani Ishika Sunil Female Hindu OPEN 82.60 61.85

383 Sciences & TechnologyDepartment of Computer Engineering B.Tech.- Computer Engineering Niharika Avinash Devkhile Female Hindu OPEN 81 67

384 Sciences & TechnologyDepartment of Computer Engineering B.Tech.- Computer Engineering NITISH SINGH Male Hindu All India Candidature Candidates (General OMS)  10 CGPA 83

385 Sciences & TechnologyDepartment of Computer Engineering B.Tech.- Computer Engineering Paranjpe Karan Ajit Male Hindu OPEN 92 76.15

386 Sciences & TechnologyDepartment of Computer Engineering B.Tech.- Computer Engineering Patel Aliakbar Saifee Male Muslim OPEN 83.60 61.08

387 Sciences & TechnologyDepartment of Computer Engineering B.Tech.- Computer Engineering Patil Abhinav Namdeo Male Hindu OPEN 80.40 48.92

388 Sciences & TechnologyDepartment of Computer Engineering B.Tech.- Computer Engineering Patil Chetna Vishwajit Female Hindu OBC  77.40 56

389 Sciences & TechnologyDepartment of Computer Engineering B.Tech.- Computer Engineering Prabal Nikkumbh Male Hindu All India Candidature Candidates (General OMS)  9.8 CGPA 67.00

390 Sciences & TechnologyDepartment of Computer Engineering B.Tech.- Computer Engineering Pritesh Gurjar Male Hindu All India Candidature Candidates (General OMS)  78 75.8

391 Sciences & TechnologyDepartment of Computer Engineering B.Tech.- Computer Engineering RAJPUROHIT BHAVESH RAMESH Male Hindu OPEN 79.80 67.54

392 Sciences & TechnologyDepartment of Computer Engineering B.Tech.- Computer Engineering Rana Akshad Shishir Male Hindu OPEN 70 50

393 Sciences & TechnologyDepartment of Computer Engineering B.Tech.- Computer Engineering Ranka Narendra Gopaldas Male Hindu OPEN 70.20 60.92

394 Sciences & TechnologyDepartment of Computer Engineering B.Tech.- Computer Engineering Ranka Neel Virendra Male Jain OPEN 86.00 75.85

395 Sciences & TechnologyDepartment of Computer Engineering B.Tech.- Computer Engineering Raut Prarthana Girish Female Hindu OPEN 82.20 57.69

396 Sciences & TechnologyDepartment of Computer Engineering B.Tech.- Computer Engineering Rokade Darpan Ekanath Male Hindu OPEN 84.60 62



397 Sciences & TechnologyDepartment of Computer Engineering B.Tech.- Computer Engineering Safiya Nesar Female Muslim All India Candidature Candidates (General OMS)  93 78.8

398 Sciences & TechnologyDepartment of Computer Engineering B.Tech.- Computer Engineering Sakshi Kapote Female Hindu OBC  9.4 73.54

399 Sciences & TechnologyDepartment of Computer Engineering B.Tech.- Computer Engineering Sakshi Sahay Female Hindu All India Candidature Candidates (General OMS)  10 78.3

400 Sciences & TechnologyDepartment of Computer Engineering B.Tech.- Computer Engineering Sanchit Sial Male Hindu All India Candidature Candidates (General OMS)  9.4cgpa 61.2

401 Sciences & TechnologyDepartment of Computer Engineering B.Tech.- Computer Engineering Satvik Gurjar Male Hindu All India Candidature Candidates (General OMS)  8.2 CGPA 66.4

402 Sciences & TechnologyDepartment of Computer Engineering B.Tech.- Computer Engineering Sayyed Faizan Nazim Male Muslim OPEN 68.40 59.38

403 Sciences & TechnologyDepartment of Computer Engineering B.Tech.- Computer Engineering Sethi Deevesh Mahendra Male Jain OPEN 73.60 64.31

404 Sciences & TechnologyDepartment of Computer Engineering B.Tech.- Computer Engineering Shah Yash Jitendra Male Jain OPEN 82.4 62.1

405 Sciences & TechnologyDepartment of Computer Engineering B.Tech.- Computer Engineering Shaikh Asad Imtiyaz Male Muslim OPEN 78.66 56.66

406 Sciences & TechnologyDepartment of Computer Engineering B.Tech.- Computer Engineering Shaikh Mohammednoor Shafi Male Muslim OBC  70.80 58.92

407 Sciences & TechnologyDepartment of Computer Engineering B.Tech.- Computer Engineering Shaikh Rida Javed Female Muslim OPEN 88.00 84.46

408 Sciences & TechnologyDepartment of Computer Engineering B.Tech.- Computer Engineering Shirbhate Yash Pramod Male Hindu OPEN 82.80 70.30

409 Sciences & TechnologyDepartment of Computer Engineering B.Tech.- Computer Engineering Shirke Neev Dilipraj Male Hindu OPEN 78 58

410 Sciences & TechnologyDepartment of Computer Engineering B.Tech.- Computer Engineering Shivam Kumar jha Male Hindu All India Candidature Candidates (General OMS)  8.6 58.4

411 Sciences & TechnologyDepartment of Computer Engineering B.Tech.- Computer Engineering SHRISTI DAS Female Hindu OPEN 77 61

412 Sciences & TechnologyDepartment of Computer Engineering B.Tech.- Computer Engineering Shubham Kulkarni Male Hindu OPEN 9.4 78

413 Sciences & TechnologyDepartment of Computer Engineering B.Tech.- Computer Engineering Sikchi Yash Aman Male Hindu OPEN 90.20 87

414 Sciences & TechnologyDepartment of Computer Engineering B.Tech.- Computer Engineering Singam Mahendra Gangadhar Male Hindu SBC  84.80 71.38

415 Sciences & TechnologyDepartment of Computer Engineering B.Tech.- Computer Engineering Srivastwa Aditya Raj Madhurendra Male Hindu OPEN 83.33 71.08

416 Sciences & TechnologyDepartment of Computer Engineering B.Tech.- Computer Engineering SUMIR BROOTA Male Hindu OPEN 82 78

417 Sciences & TechnologyDepartment of Computer Engineering B.Tech.- Computer Engineering Takbhate Shirish Ramraja Male Hindu OPEN 93 62.15

418 Sciences & TechnologyDepartment of Computer Engineering B.Tech.- Computer Engineering Thakkar Dhairya Dinesh Male Hindu OPEN 80.2 66

419 Sciences & TechnologyDepartment of Computer Engineering B.Tech.- Computer Engineering Vangunde Avinash Ramesh Male Hindu OBC  89.20 69.54

420 Sciences & TechnologyDepartment of Computer Engineering B.Tech.- Computer Engineering Vasanwala Taher Mustafabhai Male Muslim OPEN 79.80 61.23

421 Sciences & TechnologyDepartment of Computer Engineering B.Tech.- Computer Engineering Vaswani Jai Manoj Male Hindu OPEN 86.40 77.08

422 Sciences & TechnologyDepartment of Computer Engineering B.Tech.- Computer Engineering Vaz Rylan Peter Male Christian OPEN 87.8 76.46

423 Sciences & TechnologyDepartment of Computer Engineering B.Tech.- Computer Engineering Wadone Malleshwari Dattatraya Female Hindu OPEN 93 70

424 Sciences & TechnologyDepartment of Computer Engineering B.Tech.- Computer Engineering Waghela Kshitij Nitin Male Hindu OPEN 77.60 54

425 Sciences & TechnologyDepartment of Computer Engineering B.Tech.- Computer Engineering Waghmare Aditya Chandrakant Male Hindu OBC  87.32 61.32

426 Sciences & TechnologyDepartment of Computer Engineering B.Tech.- Computer Engineering Yadav Yash Avinash Male Hindu OBC  76.8 71.54

427 Sciences & TechnologyDepartment of Computer Engineering B.Tech.- Computer Engineering Chobe Rudra Uday Male Hindu OPEN 8.6 66.46

428 Sciences & TechnologyDepartment of Computer Engineering B.Tech.- Computer Engineering Tharkude Sakshi Naresh Female Hindu OPEN 81.20 60.31

429 Sciences & TechnologyDepartment of Computer Engineering B.Tech.- Computer Engineering Sheshadri Prashant Vyas Male Hindu OPEN 74.60 64

430 Sciences & TechnologyDepartment of Computer Engineering B.Tech.- Computer Engineering Amlani Jyoti Harish Female Hindu OPEN 85.40 63.69

431 Sciences & TechnologyDepartment of Computer Engineering B.Tech.- Computer Engineering kulkarni Kedar Dinesh Male Hindu OPEN 83.40 65.38

432 Sciences & TechnologyDepartment of Computer Engineering B.Tech.- Computer Engineering Dasarwar Keyur Sagar Male Hindu OPEN 9 CGPA 68

433 Sciences & TechnologyDepartment of Computer Engineering B.Tech.- Computer Engineering- Lateral Entry Khamkar Rameshwari Rajshekhar Female Hindu OPEN 88.55 52.33

434 Sciences & TechnologyDepartment of Computer Engineering B.Tech.- Computer Engineering- Lateral Entry Syed Abdullah Nasir Alam Male Muslim OPEN 65 62

435 Sciences & TechnologyDepartment of Computer Engineering B.Tech.- Computer Engineering- Lateral Entry Kadam Ashitosh Shankar Male Hindu OPEN 77.40 NULL 75

436 Sciences & TechnologyDepartment of Computer Engineering B.Tech.- Computer Engineering- Lateral Entry Kudale Rituja Sandeep Female Hindu OBC  80.20 NULL 69.29

437 Sciences & TechnologyDepartment of Computer Engineering B.Tech.- Computer Engineering- Lateral Entry Limbachiya Manav Hasmukh Male Hindu OPEN 72.80 NULL 75.59

438 Sciences & TechnologyDepartment of Computer Engineering B.Tech.- Computer Engineering- Lateral Entry Bhosale Abhishek Suresh Male Hindu OPEN 49.40 NULL 76.12

439 Sciences & TechnologyDepartment of Computer Engineering B.Tech.- Computer Engineering- Lateral Entry Jain Priyansi Chandresh Female Jain OPEN 86.80 NULL 63.50

440 Sciences & TechnologyDepartment of Computer Engineering B.Tech.- Computer Engineering- Lateral Entry Kankaria Varun Abhay Male Jain OPEN 71.82 NULL 65.94

441 Sciences & TechnologyDepartment of Computer Engineering B.Tech.- Computer Engineering- Lateral Entry Kulkarni Yashkirti Ajit Male Hindu OPEN 75.82 53.08 63.71



442 Sciences & TechnologyDepartment of Computer Engineering B.Tech.- Computer Engineering- Lateral Entry Patil Nishad Suresh Male Hindu OBC  74 NULL 76.50

443 Sciences & TechnologyDepartment of Computer Engineering B.Tech.- Computer Engineering- Lateral Entry Ruchit Ujjwal Desai Male Hindu All India Candidature Candidates (General OMS)  79.16 NULL 66.21

444 Sciences & TechnologyDepartment of Computer Engineering B.Tech.- Computer Engineering- Lateral Entry Rutuj Kiran Chordiya Male Hindu OPEN 8.6 cgpa NULL 81.13

445 Sciences & TechnologyDepartment of Computer Engineering B.Tech.- Computer Engineering- Lateral Entry Siddhant Anup Kulkarni Male Hindu OPEN 58 NULL 79.94

446 Sciences & TechnologyDepartment of Computer Engineering B.Tech.- Computer Engineering- Lateral Entry More Vaibhav Milind Male Hindu OPEN 85.40 NULL 73.56

447 Sciences & TechnologyDepartment of Computer Engineering B.Tech.- Computer Engineering- Lateral Entry DESHMUKH ABHISHEK RAJENDRA Male Hindu OBC  89.45 66.77 83.44

448 Sciences & TechnologyDepartment of Computer Sciences B.Sc. (Computer Science) ANURAG VILAS RAWANE Male Jain OPEN 77.00 67.00

449 Sciences & TechnologyDepartment of Computer Sciences B.Sc. (Computer Science) Banerjee Kaushik Sujit Male Hindu All India Candidature Candidates (General OMS)  D Grade 42.46

450 Sciences & TechnologyDepartment of Computer Sciences B.Sc. (Computer Science) Dhumal Shubhankar Prashant Male Hindu OBC  56.40

451 Sciences & TechnologyDepartment of Computer Sciences B.Sc. (Computer Science) Mahadik Husain Asif Male Muslim OPEN 83.20 70.31

452 Sciences & TechnologyDepartment of Computer Sciences B.Sc. (Computer Science) MULAY SARANG SHANTARAM Male Hindu OPEN 8.8 CGPA 66.15

453 Sciences & TechnologyDepartment of Computer Sciences B.Sc. (Computer Science) Parkar Gufran Abdul Gaffar Male Muslim OPEN 84.8 70.15

454 Sciences & TechnologyDepartment of Computer Sciences B.Sc. (Computer Science) Ninan David Subhash Male Christian OPEN 79.80 62.92

455 Sciences & TechnologyDepartment of Computer Sciences B.Sc. (Computer Science) Sanap Aniket Laxman Male Hindu NT-D  7 CGPA 58.46

456 Sciences & TechnologyDepartment of Computer Sciences B.Sc. (Computer Science) Dev Chinmay Shrikant Male Hindu OPEN 72.91 60.77

457 Sciences & TechnologyDepartment of Mathematics & StatisticsBSc. Statistics Chinmay Suresh Male Hindu All India Candidature Candidates (General OMS)  93.1 79.8

458 Sciences & TechnologyDepartment of Mathematics & StatisticsBSc. Statistics Jain Simone Sanjay Female Jain OPEN 82 70.46

459 Sciences & TechnologyDepartment of Mathematics & StatisticsBSc. Statistics Kaushal Kumar Yadav Male Hindu OPEN 84 66.66

460 Sciences & TechnologyDepartment of Mathematics & StatisticsBSc. Statistics Kulkarni Prachet Renukadas Male Hindu OPEN 94.02 68

461 Sciences & TechnologyDepartment of Mathematics & StatisticsBSc. Statistics Maheshwari Ishaan Ajay Male Hindu OPEN 81.60 60.15

462 Sciences & TechnologyDepartment of Mathematics & StatisticsBSc. Statistics Patil Jaydeep Somkant Male Hindu OPEN 8.2 58.15

463 Sciences & TechnologyDepartment of Mathematics & StatisticsBSc. Statistics Patil Pratik Pramod Male Hindu OPEN 93.20 66.15

464 Sciences & TechnologyDepartment of Mathematics & StatisticsBSc. Statistics Ramshe Mrunmayi Sanjay Female Hindu OBC  87.20 66.77

465 Sciences & TechnologyDepartment of Mathematics & StatisticsBSc. Statistics Sahu Amisha Arvind Female Hindu OBC  92.40 74

466 Sciences & TechnologyDepartment of Mathematics & StatisticsBSc. Statistics Shakya Prashant Dharmendra Kumar Male Hindu OBC  89.40 66.15

467 Sciences & TechnologyDepartment of Mathematics & StatisticsBSc. Statistics Solanki Darshit Atul Male Hindu OPEN 80.60 49.38

468 Sciences & TechnologyDepartment of Mathematics & StatisticsBSc. Statistics Disha Bisen Female Hindu All India Candidature Candidates (General OMS)  10.0 CGPA69.00

469 Sciences & TechnologyDepartment of Mathematics & StatisticsBSc. Statistics Kulkarni Mitali Prashant Female Hindu OPEN 95 66.15

470 Sciences & TechnologyDepartment of Mathematics & StatisticsMSc. Statistics ADAK ANKITA KALURAM Female Hindu OPEN 83.20 62.15 NULL

471 Sciences & TechnologyDepartment of Mathematics & StatisticsMSc. Statistics Dikshani Diwakar Kumbhare Female Hindu OPEN 79.27 60 NULL

472 Sciences & TechnologyDepartment of Mathematics & StatisticsMSc. Statistics Dwivedi Akhil Govinddas Male Hindu OPEN 67.45 51.38 NULL

473 Sciences & TechnologyDepartment of Mathematics & StatisticsMSc. Statistics Jadhav Pranjal Gabaji Shakuntala Female Hindu OPEN 88.00 58.15 NULL

474 Sciences & TechnologyDepartment of Mathematics & StatisticsMSc. Statistics Kurtadikar Soham Milind Male Hindu OPEN 80 52 NULL

475 Sciences & TechnologyDepartment of Mathematics & StatisticsMSc. Statistics Navale Anand Ramdas Manik Male Hindu OPEN 84 62.7 NULL

476 Sciences & TechnologyDepartment of Mathematics & StatisticsMSc. Statistics Shinde Prasad Prakash Male Hindu OPEN 70.80 51.5 NULL

477 Sciences & TechnologyDepartment of Mathematics & StatisticsMSc. Statistics Tople Madhuri Sandeep Anilla Female Hindu OPEN 73.45 57.54 NULL

478 Sciences & TechnologyDepartment of Mechanical Engineering BTech-Mechanical Engg Akole Amey Shrikant Male Hindu OBC  55.40 54.15

479 Sciences & TechnologyDepartment of Mechanical Engineering BTech-Mechanical Engg Dangi Siddharth Kishor Male Hindu OPEN 80.80 78

480 Sciences & TechnologyDepartment of Mechanical Engineering BTech-Mechanical Engg Deshmukh Vaishnavi Udaysinh Female Hindu OPEN 91.40 57.07

481 Sciences & TechnologyDepartment of Mechanical Engineering BTech-Mechanical Engg Ghule Siddhant Sanjay Male Hindu OBC  92.2 71.8

482 Sciences & TechnologyDepartment of Mechanical Engineering BTech-Mechanical Engg Gothekar Ajlan Amiruddin Male Muslim OPEN 78.20 62.31

483 Sciences & TechnologyDepartment of Mechanical Engineering BTech-Mechanical Engg IDRIS PRESSWALA Male Muslim All India Candidature Candidates (General OMS)  78.83 75.80

484 Sciences & TechnologyDepartment of Mechanical Engineering BTech-Mechanical Engg Jadhav Shreyas Vilas Male Hindu OPEN 78` 58.46

485 Sciences & TechnologyDepartment of Mechanical Engineering BTech-Mechanical Engg Jadhav Suraj Sanjay Male Hindu OPEN 76.00 68.15

486 Sciences & TechnologyDepartment of Mechanical Engineering BTech-Mechanical Engg JAIN AMAN MAHESH Male Jain OPEN 83.40 62.92



487 Sciences & TechnologyDepartment of Mechanical Engineering BTech-Mechanical Engg KULKARNI NANDAN SANJAY Male Hindu OPEN 93.80 63.08

488 Sciences & TechnologyDepartment of Mechanical Engineering BTech-Mechanical Engg Lad Vinit Navin Male Hindu OBC  8.4 CGPA 69.38

489 Sciences & TechnologyDepartment of Mechanical Engineering BTech-Mechanical Engg Lodhi Ravikumar Shivmurat Male Hindu OPEN 67.80 57.38

490 Sciences & TechnologyDepartment of Mechanical Engineering BTech-Mechanical Engg Menezes Prestin Wilson Male Christian OPEN 82.60 76.15

491 Sciences & TechnologyDepartment of Mechanical Engineering BTech-Mechanical Engg Mokal Rutik Subhash Male Hindu OBC  80 50.46

492 Sciences & TechnologyDepartment of Mechanical Engineering BTech-Mechanical Engg More Abhishek Vivek Male Hindu OPEN 89.40 73.85

493 Sciences & TechnologyDepartment of Mechanical Engineering BTech-Mechanical Engg Muhammed Tauseef Male Muslim All India Candidature Candidates (General OMS)  4.6 52

494 Sciences & TechnologyDepartment of Mechanical Engineering BTech-Mechanical Engg Musale Tanishk Kailas Male Hindu OBC  91 83

495 Sciences & TechnologyDepartment of Mechanical Engineering BTech-Mechanical Engg Nahar Nandan Praful Male Jain OPEN 84 70

496 Sciences & TechnologyDepartment of Mechanical Engineering BTech-Mechanical Engg Nair Vighnesh Suresh Male Hindu OPEN 88.80 77.01

497 Sciences & TechnologyDepartment of Mechanical Engineering BTech-Mechanical Engg Natekar Raju Mantappa Male Hindu SC  84.80 62.46

498 Sciences & TechnologyDepartment of Mechanical Engineering BTech-Mechanical Engg Pal Vishwajeet kuber Male Hindu OPEN 83.20 63.54

499 Sciences & TechnologyDepartment of Mechanical Engineering BTech-Mechanical Engg Parmar Pooja Manoj Female Hindu OPEN 90.00 73.60

500 Sciences & TechnologyDepartment of Mechanical Engineering BTech-Mechanical Engg Patkar Rugved Atul Male Hindu OPEN 93 85.23

501 Sciences & TechnologyDepartment of Mechanical Engineering BTech-Mechanical Engg Phatangare Siddesh Mukund Male Hindu OBC  88.20 63.08

502 Sciences & TechnologyDepartment of Mechanical Engineering BTech-Mechanical Engg Rajput Sagar Ranjeetsingh Male Hindu VJ/DT, NT-A  72 52

503 Sciences & TechnologyDepartment of Mechanical Engineering BTech-Mechanical Engg Sahasrabuddhe Amod Uday Male Hindu OPEN 82.20 62.92

504 Sciences & TechnologyDepartment of Mechanical Engineering BTech-Mechanical Engg Shityalkar Akhilesh Laxman Male Hindu OPEN 85.80 62.92

505 Sciences & TechnologyDepartment of Mechanical Engineering BTech-Mechanical Engg Suratwala Dhruv Gopal Male Hindu OPEN 83.60 61.85

506 Sciences & TechnologyDepartment of Mechanical Engineering BTech-Mechanical Engg Talbar Akshay Jayant Male Hindu OBC  91.80 89.69

507 Sciences & TechnologyDepartment of Mechanical Engineering BTech-Mechanical Engg Temghare Rushikesh Nivrutti Male Hindu OPEN 82 79

508 Sciences & TechnologyDepartment of Mechanical Engineering BTech-Mechanical Engg Pawar Rudrasen Chandrakant Male Hindu OPEN 87.80 50.77

509 Sciences & TechnologyDepartment of Mechanical Engineering BTech-Mechanical Engg Rishul Chouhan Male Hindu All India Candidature Candidates (General OMS)  86 54

510 Sciences & TechnologyDepartment of Mechanical Engineering BTech-Mechanical Engg Ghorpade Pratik Shivaji Male Hindu OPEN 91.00 88.00

511 Sciences & TechnologyDepartment of Mechanical Engineering BTech-Mechanical Engg- Lateral Entry Bains Bakhtawarsingh Harpreetsingh Male Sikh OPEN 89.80 73.69

512 Sciences & TechnologyDepartment of Mechanical Engineering BTech-Mechanical Engg- Lateral Entry Chabukswar Tanvi Anil Female Hindu SC  77 59.35

513 Sciences & TechnologyDepartment of Mechanical Engineering BTech-Mechanical Engg- Lateral Entry Dungarwal Yash Prakash Male Jain OPEN 89.60 78.89

514 Sciences & TechnologyDepartment of Mechanical Engineering BTech-Mechanical Engg- Lateral Entry Feryn Ketan Dedhiya Male Jain OPEN 73.20 62.88

515 Sciences & TechnologyDepartment of Mechanical Engineering BTech-Mechanical Engg- Lateral Entry Hire Prathamesh Ramling Male Hindu OPEN 77.27 55.00 65.24

516 Sciences & TechnologyDepartment of Mechanical Engineering BTech-Mechanical Engg- Lateral Entry Hotkar Pranav Suhas Male Hindu SC  66.00 61.18

517 Sciences & TechnologyDepartment of Mechanical Engineering BTech-Mechanical Engg- Lateral Entry JAGGI ANISH ANIL Male Hindu OPEN 88.80 80.31 9.72 SGPA

518 Sciences & TechnologyDepartment of Mechanical Engineering BTech-Mechanical Engg- Lateral Entry Kodag Abhishek Udaykumar Male Hindu OPEN 85.80 74.38

519 Sciences & TechnologyDepartment of Mechanical Engineering BTech-Mechanical Engg- Lateral Entry Mahajan Soham Deepak Male Hindu OPEN 90.4 75 8.6

520 Sciences & TechnologyDepartment of Mechanical Engineering BTech-Mechanical Engg- Lateral Entry Omkar Nandkumar Patil Male Hindu OPEN 7.4 71.68

521 Sciences & TechnologyDepartment of Mechanical Engineering BTech-Mechanical Engg- Lateral Entry Patil Sourabh Sambhaji Male Hindu OPEN 66.60 67.82

522 Sciences & TechnologyDepartment of Mechanical Engineering BTech-Mechanical Engg- Lateral Entry Shejwal Yoshita Kailas Female Hindu OPEN 80.60 65.59

523 Sciences & TechnologyDepartment of Mechanical Engineering BTech-Mechanical Engg- Lateral Entry Shende Rushab Maharudra Male Hindu OPEN 82.40 58.31 76.18

524 Sciences & TechnologyDepartment of Mechanical Engineering BTech-Mechanical Engg- Lateral Entry Wale Ashutsoh Vishwanath Male Hindu OPEN

525 Sciences & TechnologyDepartment of Mechanical Engineering BTech-Mechanical Engg- Lateral Entry Deshmukh Vedant Ravindra Male Hindu OPEN 71 75.59

526 Sciences & TechnologyDepartment of Mechanical Engineering BTech-Mechanical Engg- Lateral Entry Patil Viplav Vijay Male Hindu OBC  85.80 83

527 Sciences & TechnologyDepartment of Mechanical Engineering BTech-Mechanical Engg- Lateral Entry Sakhare Shubham Raju Male Hindu SBC  64.40 49.33 66.35

528 Sciences & TechnologyDepartment of Mechanical Engineering BTech-Mechanical Engg- Lateral Entry Shetti Pavan Shashidhar Male Hindu OPEN 84.36 54.82

529 Sciences & TechnologyDepartment of Mechanical Engineering BTech-Mechanical Engg- Lateral Entry Umbarkar pranav Dnyanraj Male Hindu OPEN 85.40 61

530 Sciences & TechnologyDepartment of Mechanical Engineering M.Tech-Product Design & Development(PDD) Gojare Kiran Nandkishore Female Hindu OPEN 82.93 59.13

531 Sciences & TechnologyDepartment of Mechanical Engineering M.Tech-Product Design & Development(PDD) More Akshay Anna Male Hindu OPEN 78.73 72



532 Inter Disciplinary StudiesDepartment of Vocational Education B.A. (Travels and Tourism) Apte Mrunalini Amit Female Hindu OPEN 80.20 59.23

533 Inter Disciplinary StudiesDepartment of Vocational Education B.A. (Travels and Tourism) Choukate Payal Ashok Female Hindu OBC  67 45

534 Inter Disciplinary StudiesDepartment of Vocational Education B.A. (Travels and Tourism) D Souza Mario Sabino Male Christian OPEN 60.4 50.4

535 Inter Disciplinary StudiesDepartment of Vocational Education B.A. (Travels and Tourism) Dhavale Hrishikesh Ganesh Male Hindu SC  87.40 63

536 Inter Disciplinary StudiesDepartment of Vocational Education B.A. (Travels and Tourism) Dhawan Tanishka Sandeep Female Hindu OPEN 76 78.31

537 Inter Disciplinary StudiesDepartment of Vocational Education B.A. (Travels and Tourism) GAIKWAD APURV SURENDRA Male Hindu SC  73.64 53.23

538 Inter Disciplinary StudiesDepartment of Vocational Education B.A. (Travels and Tourism) Galande Sai Sameer Female Hindu OPEN 83.20 64.92

539 Inter Disciplinary StudiesDepartment of Vocational Education B.A. (Travels and Tourism) Ingole Yashodeep Sureshrao Male Buddhist SC  78 &nbsp;

540 Inter Disciplinary StudiesDepartment of Vocational Education B.A. (Travels and Tourism) Jaykar Neelam Sanjay Female Hindu SC  69.20 55.08

541 Inter Disciplinary StudiesDepartment of Vocational Education B.A. (Travels and Tourism) Kannadkar Aaryan Makarand Male Hindu OPEN 67.6 65.6

542 Inter Disciplinary StudiesDepartment of Vocational Education B.A. (Travels and Tourism) Kelkar Chaitanya Vijay Male Hindu OPEN 60 56.77

543 Inter Disciplinary StudiesDepartment of Vocational Education B.A. (Travels and Tourism) Khan Saherish Parvez Female Muslim OPEN 70.60 60.31

544 Inter Disciplinary StudiesDepartment of Vocational Education B.A. (Travels and Tourism) Khori Chetan Rajeshkharappa Male Hindu OPEN 57.60 60.92

545 Inter Disciplinary StudiesDepartment of Vocational Education B.A. (Travels and Tourism) Mhasawade Shraddha Deepak Female Hindu OBC  86.40 65.23

546 Inter Disciplinary StudiesDepartment of Vocational Education B.A. (Travels and Tourism) Shete Rasika Pramod Female Hindu OPEN 54.80 47.85

547 Inter Disciplinary StudiesDepartment of Vocational Education B.A. (Travels and Tourism) Shitole Bhagyashree Rajendra Female Hindu OPEN 74.36 62

548 Inter Disciplinary StudiesDepartment of Vocational Education B.A. (Travels and Tourism) Thakur Deepeshkumar Girender Male Hindu OPEN 5.6 CGPA 43.38

549 Inter Disciplinary StudiesDepartment of Vocational Education B.A. (Travels and Tourism) Wakre Atharva Gunwant Male Hindu OBC  76.40 51.69

550 Inter Disciplinary StudiesDepartment of Vocational Education B.A. (Travels and Tourism) Shevade Sayali Vijaykumar Female Hindu OPEN 69.40 42.30

551 Inter Disciplinary StudiesDepartment of Vocational Education M.A. (Travels and Tourism) Patil Zelam Kesarinath Female Hindu OPEN 82.29 74.67

552 Journalism & Mass CommunicationDepartment of Media, Communication & JournalismB.A.  JOURNALISM & MASS COMMUNICATION Alefiya Mohamed Bakrawala Female Muslim OPEN 65 &nbsp;

553 Journalism & Mass CommunicationDepartment of Media, Communication & JournalismB.A.  JOURNALISM & MASS COMMUNICATION Arya Singh Female Hindu All India Candidature Candidates (General OMS)  9.8

554 Journalism & Mass CommunicationDepartment of Media, Communication & JournalismB.A.  JOURNALISM & MASS COMMUNICATION Ashlesha Balasaheb Chavan Female Hindu OPEN NULL NULL

555 Journalism & Mass CommunicationDepartment of Media, Communication & JournalismB.A.  JOURNALISM & MASS COMMUNICATION Basu Prattay Male Hindu All India Candidature Candidates (General OMS)  8.2 cgpa 60

556 Journalism & Mass CommunicationDepartment of Media, Communication & JournalismB.A.  JOURNALISM & MASS COMMUNICATION Bendigiri Bhairavi Sandeep Female Hindu OPEN 79.40 71.4

557 Journalism & Mass CommunicationDepartment of Media, Communication & JournalismB.A.  JOURNALISM & MASS COMMUNICATION Biradar Vinayak Shesherao Male Hindu OPEN 82.40 62

558 Journalism & Mass CommunicationDepartment of Media, Communication & JournalismB.A.  JOURNALISM & MASS COMMUNICATION Bodwade Kunal Bhaskar Male Buddhist SC  68.60 55.08

559 Journalism & Mass CommunicationDepartment of Media, Communication & JournalismB.A.  JOURNALISM & MASS COMMUNICATION Chugani Chahat Kumar Female Hindu OPEN 79.2 66.15

560 Journalism & Mass CommunicationDepartment of Media, Communication & JournalismB.A.  JOURNALISM & MASS COMMUNICATION Das Saranya Sourabh Male Hindu All India Candidature Candidates (General OMS)  75.40 68.15

561 Journalism & Mass CommunicationDepartment of Media, Communication & JournalismB.A.  JOURNALISM & MASS COMMUNICATION Dave Khushi Shrikrishna Female Hindu OPEN 67.40 60.62

562 Journalism & Mass CommunicationDepartment of Media, Communication & JournalismB.A.  JOURNALISM & MASS COMMUNICATION Deshpande Yash Mangesh Male Hindu OPEN 61.80 46.3

563 Journalism & Mass CommunicationDepartment of Media, Communication & JournalismB.A.  JOURNALISM & MASS COMMUNICATION Hanbarhatty Sakshi Rajanikant Female Christian OPEN 54.66 62.31

564 Journalism & Mass CommunicationDepartment of Media, Communication & JournalismB.A.  JOURNALISM & MASS COMMUNICATION Irkar Pratiksha Chandrakant Female Hindu NT-C  76.80 60.15

565 Journalism & Mass CommunicationDepartment of Media, Communication & JournalismB.A.  JOURNALISM & MASS COMMUNICATION Jadhav Pratiksha Nanasaheb Female Hindu OPEN 85 60

566 Journalism & Mass CommunicationDepartment of Media, Communication & JournalismB.A.  JOURNALISM & MASS COMMUNICATION Jadhav Rohan Dattatray Male Hindu VJ/DT, NT-A  66.00 48.77

567 Journalism & Mass CommunicationDepartment of Media, Communication & JournalismB.A.  JOURNALISM & MASS COMMUNICATION Joshi Hrishikesh Ashutosh Male Hindu OPEN 8.2 50.77

568 Journalism & Mass CommunicationDepartment of Media, Communication & JournalismB.A.  JOURNALISM & MASS COMMUNICATION Kadam Sakshi Shirish Female Hindu OPEN 90 69.23

569 Journalism & Mass CommunicationDepartment of Media, Communication & JournalismB.A.  JOURNALISM & MASS COMMUNICATION Kajgikar Rugved Ravindra Male Hindu OPEN 72 56

570 Journalism & Mass CommunicationDepartment of Media, Communication & JournalismB.A.  JOURNALISM & MASS COMMUNICATION Khaiwale Sakshi Harish Female Hindu OBC  9.4 CGPA 66.46

571 Journalism & Mass CommunicationDepartment of Media, Communication & JournalismB.A.  JOURNALISM & MASS COMMUNICATION Khedkar Prajakta Vikram Female Hindu OPEN 79.40 61.38

572 Journalism & Mass CommunicationDepartment of Media, Communication & JournalismB.A.  JOURNALISM & MASS COMMUNICATION Landge Amol Shamrao Male Hindu OPEN 59.00 58.62

573 Journalism & Mass CommunicationDepartment of Media, Communication & JournalismB.A.  JOURNALISM & MASS COMMUNICATION Lipare Pradyumna Deepak Male Hindu SBC  89 68.77

574 Journalism & Mass CommunicationDepartment of Media, Communication & JournalismB.A.  JOURNALISM & MASS COMMUNICATION Mulay Amol Santosh Male Hindu OPEN 54 52.77

575 Journalism & Mass CommunicationDepartment of Media, Communication & JournalismB.A.  JOURNALISM & MASS COMMUNICATION Neha Mehrotra Female Hindu All India Candidature Candidates (General OMS)  NULL 10 CGPA

576 Journalism & Mass CommunicationDepartment of Media, Communication & JournalismB.A.  JOURNALISM & MASS COMMUNICATION Nikita Rajendra Ghule Female Hindu OPEN 7.2 CGPA 72



577 Journalism & Mass CommunicationDepartment of Media, Communication & JournalismB.A.  JOURNALISM & MASS COMMUNICATION Pandav Anand Dhananjay Male Hindu OPEN 77.15 83.85

578 Journalism & Mass CommunicationDepartment of Media, Communication & JournalismB.A.  JOURNALISM & MASS COMMUNICATION Pandhare Nikita Jagdish Female Hindu OBC  79.40 61.38

579 Journalism & Mass CommunicationDepartment of Media, Communication & JournalismB.A.  JOURNALISM & MASS COMMUNICATION Pangave Atharva Vijay Male Hindu OPEN 73.60 53.08

580 Journalism & Mass CommunicationDepartment of Media, Communication & JournalismB.A.  JOURNALISM & MASS COMMUNICATION Pawar Sanat Sudhir Male Hindu NT-B  82.80 56.77

581 Journalism & Mass CommunicationDepartment of Media, Communication & JournalismB.A.  JOURNALISM & MASS COMMUNICATION Phadtare Rohan Bhupendra Male Hindu OPEN 8 51.38

582 Journalism & Mass CommunicationDepartment of Media, Communication & JournalismB.A.  JOURNALISM & MASS COMMUNICATION Priya Prakash Female Hindu All India Candidature Candidates (General OMS)  9.8 66.4

583 Journalism & Mass CommunicationDepartment of Media, Communication & JournalismB.A.  JOURNALISM & MASS COMMUNICATION Rathod Tanay Rajesh Male Jain OPEN 58.8 53.69

584 Journalism & Mass CommunicationDepartment of Media, Communication & JournalismB.A.  JOURNALISM & MASS COMMUNICATION Sandbhor Mrunal Prasad Female Hindu OPEN 79.60 69.54

585 Journalism & Mass CommunicationDepartment of Media, Communication & JournalismB.A.  JOURNALISM & MASS COMMUNICATION Shaikh Mahir Mustafa Idris Male Muslim OPEN 62.40 44.46

586 Journalism & Mass CommunicationDepartment of Media, Communication & JournalismB.A.  JOURNALISM & MASS COMMUNICATION Shaikh Mohd Aadil Shamsuddin Male Muslim OPEN 73.80 64.00

587 Journalism & Mass CommunicationDepartment of Media, Communication & JournalismB.A.  JOURNALISM & MASS COMMUNICATION Shaikh Zaara Tanvir Female Muslim OPEN 81.20 66

588 Journalism & Mass CommunicationDepartment of Media, Communication & JournalismB.A.  JOURNALISM & MASS COMMUNICATION Sougata Nandy Male Hindu All India Candidature Candidates (General OMS)  6.6 61.4

589 Journalism & Mass CommunicationDepartment of Media, Communication & JournalismB.A.  JOURNALISM & MASS COMMUNICATION Soundrya kalse Female Hindu OBC  7.2 58

590 Journalism & Mass CommunicationDepartment of Media, Communication & JournalismB.A.  JOURNALISM & MASS COMMUNICATION Srujan Ratnakar Dabhade Male Hindu OPEN 79.2 66.15

591 Journalism & Mass CommunicationDepartment of Media, Communication & JournalismB.A.  JOURNALISM & MASS COMMUNICATION Suryawanshi Achal Ravindra Female Hindu OBC  80.60 62

592 Journalism & Mass CommunicationDepartment of Media, Communication & JournalismB.A.  JOURNALISM & MASS COMMUNICATION Sutar Anand Ravindra Male Hindu OBC  67 53

593 Journalism & Mass CommunicationDepartment of Media, Communication & JournalismB.A.  JOURNALISM & MASS COMMUNICATION Thange Onkar Chandrashekhar Male Hindu OPEN 74.80 60

594 Journalism & Mass CommunicationDepartment of Media, Communication & JournalismB.A.  JOURNALISM & MASS COMMUNICATION Vaidehi Palsokar Female Hindu OPEN 8.2 &nbsp;

595 Journalism & Mass CommunicationDepartment of Media, Communication & JournalismB.A.  JOURNALISM & MASS COMMUNICATION Waghmare Priyanka Pramod Female Hindu OBC  79.40 62.46

596 Journalism & Mass CommunicationDepartment of Media, Communication & JournalismB.A.  JOURNALISM & MASS COMMUNICATION Yadav Kiran Gayadin Female Hindu OPEN 66.60 72.92

597 Journalism & Mass CommunicationDepartment of Media, Communication & JournalismB.A.  JOURNALISM & MASS COMMUNICATION Dange Adesh Sampat Male Hindu OBC  71 62.77

598 Journalism & Mass CommunicationDepartment of Media, Communication & JournalismB.A.  JOURNALISM & MASS COMMUNICATION Mude Ayesha Farooq Female Muslim OPEN 8.0 CGPA 69.54

599 Journalism & Mass CommunicationDepartment of Media, Communication & JournalismB.A.  JOURNALISM & MASS COMMUNICATION Pawar Barkha Sunil Female Hindu OPEN 81.64 62.77

600 Journalism & Mass CommunicationDepartment of Media, Communication & JournalismB.A.  JOURNALISM & MASS COMMUNICATION Ratlamwala Mustafa Mazhar Husain Male Muslim OPEN 77.60 55.23

601 Journalism & Mass CommunicationDepartment of Media, Communication & JournalismB.A.  JOURNALISM & MASS COMMUNICATION Shefali Paul Female Christian All India Candidature Candidates (General OMS)  4.8 CGPA 84

602 Journalism & Mass CommunicationDepartment of Media, Communication & JournalismB.A.  JOURNALISM & MASS COMMUNICATION Vedpathak Mruganayana Madhav Female Hindu OBC  77.60 54.62

603 Journalism & Mass CommunicationDepartment of Media, Communication & JournalismB.A.  JOURNALISM & MASS COMMUNICATION Mithi Singh Female Hindu All India Candidature Candidates (General OMS)  7.0 54.60

604 Journalism & Mass CommunicationDepartment of Media, Communication & JournalismB.A.  JOURNALISM & MASS COMMUNICATION Firke Suraj Praful Male Hindu OBC  88.60 55.07

605 Journalism & Mass CommunicationDepartment of Media, Communication & JournalismM.A. (JOURNALISM & MASS COMMUNICATION) Gawli Sumeet Vijay Male Hindu OBC  58.61 57.33

606 Journalism & Mass CommunicationDepartment of Media, Communication & JournalismM.A. (JOURNALISM & MASS COMMUNICATION) Kulkarni Harsha Vinayak Female Hindu OPEN 80.00 66.92

607 Journalism & Mass CommunicationDepartment of Media, Communication & JournalismM.A. (JOURNALISM & MASS COMMUNICATION) Prachi Kanhaiya Agarwal Female Hindu OPEN 65 63

608 Journalism & Mass CommunicationDepartment of Media, Communication & JournalismM.A. (JOURNALISM & MASS COMMUNICATION) Ruchita Gaur Female Hindu All India Candidature Candidates (General OMS)  84 86.82

609 Journalism & Mass CommunicationDepartment of Media, Communication & JournalismM.A. (JOURNALISM & MASS COMMUNICATION) SAHU GEETANJALI UALI JHUNU Female Hindu OPEN 53 63.69

610 Journalism & Mass CommunicationDepartment of Media, Communication & JournalismM.A. (JOURNALISM & MASS COMMUNICATION) Sethi Gurleen Kaur Ravinder Singh Female Sikh OPEN 80 68

611 Journalism & Mass CommunicationDepartment of Media, Communication & JournalismM.A. (JOURNALISM & MASS COMMUNICATION) Srivastava Deepanshu Ajendra Male Hindu OPEN

612 Journalism & Mass CommunicationDepartment of Media, Communication & JournalismM.A. (JOURNALISM & MASS COMMUNICATION) Tanmay Dhakate Male Hindu OPEN 8.6 65

613 Journalism & Mass CommunicationDepartment of Media, Communication & JournalismM.A. (JOURNALISM & MASS COMMUNICATION) Chikodi Shafa Bashir Female Muslim OPEN 71.60 54.67

614 Journalism & Mass CommunicationDepartment of Media, Communication & JournalismM.A. (JOURNALISM & MASS COMMUNICATION) Namita Pradhan Female Hindu All India Candidature Candidates (General OMS)  61.3 61.5

615 Journalism & Mass CommunicationDepartment of Media, Communication & JournalismM.A. (JOURNALISM & MASS COMMUNICATION) Khan Ashiya Barakatulla Female Muslim OPEN 72.3 68.5

616 Humanities & Social SciencesDepartment of Economics M.A. (Economics) Avinash Dharmaraj Dalal Male Hindu OPEN 70.42 NULL 68

617 Humanities & Social SciencesDepartment of Economics M.A. (Economics) Hariharan Chandrasekharan Male Other OPEN 83.3 81.3

618 Humanities & Social SciencesDepartment of Economics M.A. (Economics) Sharma Dinesh Dilip Male Hindu OPEN 68.13 82.17

619 Humanities & Social SciencesDepartment of Economics M.A. (Economics) Sonawane Pradnya Sadashiv Sujata Female Hindu SC  56 50.92

620 Humanities & Social SciencesDepartment of Economics M.A. (Economics) Anjali Shirdhonkar Female Hindu OPEN 58 NULL 58

621 Humanities & Social SciencesDepartment of Psychology M.A. (PSYCHOLOGY) Ansari Azram intekhab Female Muslim OPEN 79.80 69.85



622 Humanities & Social SciencesDepartment of Psychology M.A. (PSYCHOLOGY) Arya Nath Female Hindu All India Candidature Candidates (General OMS)  6.4 65

623 Humanities & Social SciencesDepartment of Psychology M.A. (PSYCHOLOGY) Bagle Ankita Prakash Female Hindu OPEN 77.20 57.50

624 Humanities & Social SciencesDepartment of Psychology M.A. (PSYCHOLOGY) Bhanushali Maitri Hemant Jigna Female Hindu OPEN 71.20 71.69

625 Humanities & Social SciencesDepartment of Psychology M.A. (PSYCHOLOGY) Bhome Aditi Vasudev Female Hindu OPEN 87.40 73.23

626 Humanities & Social SciencesDepartment of Psychology M.A. (PSYCHOLOGY) Brahme Manasi Rajendra Female Hindu OPEN 84.73 82.31

627 Humanities & Social SciencesDepartment of Psychology M.A. (PSYCHOLOGY) Chhabhaiya Pankti Gunvant Female Hindu OPEN 78.91 73.85

628 Humanities & Social SciencesDepartment of Psychology M.A. (PSYCHOLOGY) Dahifale Mahesh Suresh Male Hindu OPEN 92.55 54.33

629 Humanities & Social SciencesDepartment of Psychology M.A. (PSYCHOLOGY) Fernandes Lydia John Female Christian OPEN 69.82 60.00

630 Humanities & Social SciencesDepartment of Psychology M.A. (PSYCHOLOGY) Fernandes Nicol Simon Male Christian OPEN 63.45 51

631 Humanities & Social SciencesDepartment of Psychology M.A. (PSYCHOLOGY) Himanshi Gupta Female Hindu All India Candidature Candidates (General OMS)  66.14 64

632 Humanities & Social SciencesDepartment of Psychology M.A. (PSYCHOLOGY) Hema Vivek Pande Female Hindu OPEN 78

633 Humanities & Social SciencesDepartment of Psychology M.A. (PSYCHOLOGY) Jadhav Kiran Sandip Female Hindu OPEN &nbsp; &nbsp;

634 Humanities & Social SciencesDepartment of Psychology M.A. (PSYCHOLOGY) Jadhav Pranali Satish Female Hindu SC  7.4 cgpa 71.38 NULL

635 Humanities & Social SciencesDepartment of Psychology M.A. (PSYCHOLOGY) Jain Ayushi Dinesh Premlata Female Jain OPEN 65.82 63.23 NULL

636 Humanities & Social SciencesDepartment of Psychology M.A. (PSYCHOLOGY) kachwala Khadija Zoeb Tasneem Female Muslim All India Candidature Candidates (General OMS)  57.00 44.9 NULL

637 Humanities & Social SciencesDepartment of Psychology M.A. (PSYCHOLOGY) Warke Bhagyashree Nirad Female Hindu OPEN 80.30 70.67 NULL

638 Humanities & Social SciencesDepartment of Psychology M.A. (PSYCHOLOGY) Keerthi Amarpaul Premkumar Male Christian OPEN 72.96 66.50 NULL

639 Humanities & Social SciencesDepartment of Psychology M.A. (PSYCHOLOGY) Kulkarni Nimisha Atul Vasudha Female Hindu OPEN 72.73 66.46 NULL

640 Humanities & Social SciencesDepartment of Psychology M.A. (PSYCHOLOGY) MADHUMITA ROY Female Hindu All India Candidature Candidates (General OMS)  65.50 59 NULL

641 Humanities & Social SciencesDepartment of Psychology M.A. (PSYCHOLOGY) Mahajan Sameeksha Manoj Female Hindu OPEN 78.55 56.15 NULL

642 Humanities & Social SciencesDepartment of Psychology M.A. (PSYCHOLOGY) Mahima Nakra Female Hindu OPEN 66.2 73.80 NULL

643 Humanities & Social SciencesDepartment of Psychology M.A. (PSYCHOLOGY) Malvadkar Vaibhavi Kishor Female Hindu OPEN 81.20 79.38 NULL

644 Humanities & Social SciencesDepartment of Psychology M.A. (PSYCHOLOGY) MOHINI PANCHABHAI SUNIL Female Hindu OPEN 63.00 NULL 66.00

645 Humanities & Social SciencesDepartment of Psychology M.A. (PSYCHOLOGY) Parmar Priya Rajesh Harsha Female Hindu OBC  77.40 68.92 NULL

646 Humanities & Social SciencesDepartment of Psychology M.A. (PSYCHOLOGY) Phanse Eshwari Sunil Supriya Female Hindu OPEN 84.91 65.69 NULL

647 Humanities & Social SciencesDepartment of Psychology M.A. (PSYCHOLOGY) Polle Samruthdhi Kishor Female Hindu All India Candidature Candidates (General OMS)  63.8 68 NULL

648 Humanities & Social SciencesDepartment of Psychology M.A. (PSYCHOLOGY) Puneet Agrawal Male Other All India Candidature Candidates (General OMS)  82 92 NULL

649 Humanities & Social SciencesDepartment of Psychology M.A. (PSYCHOLOGY) Rasalkar Sayali Bhalchandra Female Hindu OPEN 82 67.38 NULL

650 Humanities & Social SciencesDepartment of Psychology M.A. (PSYCHOLOGY) Rodriues Jennifer Anthony Female Christian OPEN 73 NULL 58.15

651 Humanities & Social SciencesDepartment of Psychology M.A. (PSYCHOLOGY) Shaikh Fareen Farooque Female Muslim OPEN 71.40 81.69 NULL

652 Humanities & Social SciencesDepartment of Psychology M.A. (PSYCHOLOGY) Shaikh Sayrabano Anwar Female Muslim OPEN 71.09 78.15 NULL

653 Humanities & Social SciencesDepartment of Psychology M.A. (PSYCHOLOGY) S K Sharma Male Hindu OPEN &nbsp; &nbsp; NULL

654 Humanities & Social SciencesDepartment of Psychology M.A. (PSYCHOLOGY) Suvarna Nidhi Bhaskar Pooja Female Hindu OPEN 69.24 69.69 NULL

655 Humanities & Social SciencesDepartment of Psychology M.A. (PSYCHOLOGY) Tiwari Aishwarya Mangalprasad Female Hindu OPEN 70.36 60.46 NULL

656 Humanities & Social SciencesDepartment of Psychology M.A. (PSYCHOLOGY) Valentinah Shimray Female Christian All India Candidature Candidates (General OMS)  62.50 53.4 NULL

657 Humanities & Social SciencesDepartment of Psychology M.A. (PSYCHOLOGY) Vishlavath Maneesha Hanumanthu Female Hindu All India Candidature Candidates (General OMS)  57 65.85 NULL

658 Humanities & Social SciencesDepartment of Psychology M.A. (PSYCHOLOGY) YASHI ARYA Female Hindu All India Candidature Candidates (General OMS)  6.6 CGPA 6.3 CGPANULL

659 Humanities & Social SciencesDepartment of Psychology M.A. (PSYCHOLOGY) Yumnam Tomthilnganbi Rakesh Female Hindu OPEN 6.2 CGPA 76.04 NULL

660 Humanities & Social SciencesDepartment of Psychology M.A. (PSYCHOLOGY) Ansari Anam Yamin Female Muslim OPEN 50.40 67.67 NULL

661 Humanities & Social SciencesDepartment of Psychology M.A. (PSYCHOLOGY) Hardikar Anushka Parag Female Hindu OPEN 65.60 73.54 NULL

662 Humanities & Social SciencesDepartment of Psychology M.A. (PSYCHOLOGY) Oza Rutvi Himanshu Female Hindu OPEN 56.55 72.31 NULL

663 Humanities & Social SciencesDepartment of Psychology M.A. (PSYCHOLOGY) Shaikh Shahbaz Nasir Male Muslim OPEN 81.45 77.69 NULL

664 Humanities & Social SciencesDepartment of Psychology M.A. (PSYCHOLOGY) Rashida Tambuwala Female Muslim OPEN 78 70.17 NULL

665 Humanities & Social SciencesDepartment of Psychology M.A. (PSYCHOLOGY) Zaidi Malika Abbas Female Muslim OPEN 63.45 64

666 Humanities & Social SciencesDepartment of Psychology B.A. (Psychology) Akriti Abeer Female Hindu All India Candidature Candidates (General OMS)  66.2 62



667 Humanities & Social SciencesDepartment of Psychology B.A. (Psychology) Agarwal Mansi Manoj Female Hindu OPEN 94 69.69

668 Humanities & Social SciencesDepartment of Psychology B.A. (Psychology) Freyan Bharucha Female Zoroastrian OPEN 82 62.33

669 Humanities & Social SciencesDepartment of Psychology B.A. (Psychology) Charniya Saniya Karim Female Muslim OPEN 76.4 63.23

670 Humanities & Social SciencesDepartment of Psychology B.A. (Psychology) Murtuza Dahodwala Male Muslim All India Candidature Candidates (General OMS)  60 62

671 Humanities & Social SciencesDepartment of Psychology B.A. (Psychology) Deshpande Janhavi Pravin Female Hindu OPEN 80 52.77

672 Humanities & Social SciencesDepartment of Psychology B.A. (Psychology) Dsouza Cherise Shae Boniface Female Christian OPEN 91.40 69.69

673 Humanities & Social SciencesDepartment of Psychology B.A. (Psychology) Katkar Divya Sanjay Female Hindu OPEN 65 59.38

674 Humanities & Social SciencesDepartment of Psychology B.A. (Psychology) Aniket Tejrao Khade Male Hindu OBC  9.2 72.40

675 Humanities & Social SciencesDepartment of Psychology B.A. (Psychology) Mahamunkar Shrutika Dehu Female Hindu OPEN 73 58

676 Humanities & Social SciencesDepartment of Psychology B.A. (Psychology) MEGHNA MEHROTRA Female Hindu All India Candidature Candidates (General OMS)  9.4 79.6

677 Humanities & Social SciencesDepartment of Psychology B.A. (Psychology) Ishtdev Mishra Male Hindu All India Candidature Candidates (General OMS)  60.33 66.17

678 Humanities & Social SciencesDepartment of Psychology B.A. (Psychology) Shaikh Rehnuma Sajid Female Muslim OPEN 84.60 78.62

679 Humanities & Social SciencesDepartment of Psychology B.A. (Psychology) Upasana Prabir Shil Female Hindu OPEN 8.6 78.2

680 Humanities & Social SciencesDepartment of Psychology B.A. (Psychology) Ayush Singh Male Hindu All India Candidature Candidates (General OMS)  65 47

681 Humanities & Social SciencesDepartment of Psychology B.A. (Psychology) Kamble Mukesh Govind Male Buddhist SC  8.0cgpa 66.15

682 Humanities & Social SciencesDepartment of Psychology B.A. (Psychology) Agre Snehal Jalandhar Female Hindu OPEN 8.0cgpa 78.6

683 Humanities & Social SciencesDepartment of Psychology B.A. (Psychology) Iyer Riya Jaikant Female Hindu OPEN 81.40 57.38

684 Humanities & Social SciencesDepartment of Psychology B.A. (Psychology) Rawat Anjali Mahendra Female Hindu OPEN 79 58.46

685 Humanities & Social SciencesDepartment of Psychology B.A. (Psychology) Kambale Shraddha Sunil Female Hindu SC  62.20 50.31

686 Law Department of Law & Governance LLM  Agalave Sadashiv Chintamani Bhagyashree Male Hindu OPEN 56.57 50.00

687 Law Department of Law & Governance LLM  AGRE AKSHATA SHIVKUMAR Female Hindu OPEN 77.08 54 59

688 Law Department of Law & Governance LLM  Arora Ramneet Kaur Ranjeet Singh Female Hindu OPEN 84.73 74.67 60

689 Law Department of Law & Governance LLM  Balsane Amol Kalu Male Hindu SC  62.61 54.67 55

690 Law Department of Law & Governance LLM  Bang Krishna Girish Male Hindu OPEN 75.23 57.67 58.02

691 Law Department of Law & Governance LLM  BarrettoLeona Sarah Frank Female Christian OPEN 56.4 62.33 59

692 Law Department of Law & Governance LLM  Bhave Abhijit Pramod Male Hindu OPEN 73.85 55.5 51.4

693 Law Department of Law & Governance LLM  Bhutia Nawang Tenzing Male Buddhist All India Candidature Candidates (General OMS)  66 64 53.8

694 Law Department of Law & Governance LLM  Bichave Shreya Sunil Female Hindu OBC  82.55 73.00 64.00

695 Law Department of Law & Governance LLM  Chavan Siddharth Brahmanand Male Hindu SC  84.15 76.67 55.2

696 Law Department of Law & Governance LLM  Chavanke Swapnil Vilas Male Hindu OPEN 46.92 52.33 55.60

697 Law Department of Law & Governance LLM  Dangat Akshay Narendra Male Hindu OPEN 70.91 55 55.7

698 Law Department of Law & Governance LLM  Date Hemant Murlidhar Male Hindu OPEN 70.61 63.67 55.55

699 Law Department of Law & Governance LLM  Dawn Swagata Subrata Female Hindu OPEN 81.64 73.17 55.3

700 Law Department of Law & Governance LLM  Desale Yatish Dilip Male Hindu OPEN 56.46 48.50 53

701 Law Department of Law & Governance LLM  Dhaygude Deepti Arun Female Hindu OPEN 74 62.50 52.30

702 Law Department of Law & Governance LLM  Dipanjan Dey Male Other All India Candidature Candidates (General OMS)  55.31 49.70 53.20

703 Law Department of Law & Governance LLM  Dubey Suraj Sheshdhar Male Hindu OPEN 42.46 56.67 56.43

704 Law Department of Law & Governance LLM  Dugad Neha Vijay Female Jain OPEN 82.61 68 52.66

705 Law Department of Law & Governance LLM  Gaikwad Ranjeet Ramakant Male Hindu OPEN 68.18 66 60

706 Law Department of Law & Governance LLM  Gaikwad Rohit Zumbarrao Male Hindu OPEN 57.46 65.83 50

707 Law Department of Law & Governance LLM  Garde Pratik Jankinath Male Hindu OPEN 81.23 55.83 56

708 Law Department of Law & Governance LLM  Gujarathi Vaishnavi Milind Female Hindu OPEN 92.76 60 50.90

709 Law Department of Law & Governance LLM  Hutagikar Shreekant Fakeerappa Male Hindu OPEN 50 42

710 Law Department of Law & Governance LLM  Inamdar Nasir Usman Male Muslim OPEN 46.29 60.50 60.70

711 Law Department of Law & Governance LLM  Jadhav Nilesh Dilip Swati Male Hindu OBC  52.26 56.83 51



712 Law Department of Law & Governance LLM  Jagdale Trupti Jagdish Female Hindu OPEN 63.06 51.33 55

713 Law Department of Law & Governance LLM  Kadam Sachin Bharat Male Hindu OPEN 68.14 47.17 58.67

714 Law Department of Law & Governance LLM  Kagade Shailesh Kishanrao Male Hindu OPEN 58 66.83 55

715 Law Department of Law & Governance LLM  Kale MAyur Suresh Male Hindu OBC  57.20 62 53.88

716 Law Department of Law & Governance LLM  Kammar Shahabuddin Sayyed Male Muslim OPEN 61.14 55.17 59

717 Law Department of Law & Governance LLM  Khan Shahrukh Durdana Rashid Female Muslim OPEN 86.7 48.8 67.27

718 Law Department of Law & Governance LLM  Khodke Shubham Ramchandra Male Hindu OPEN 67.20 69.50 58.77

719 Law Department of Law & Governance LLM  Khoshboo Shivkumar Jangid Female Hindu OPEN 83.84 67 63.5

720 Law Department of Law & Governance LLM  Kopty Husayn Saifuddin Male Muslim OPEN 58.57 55.50 52.12

721 Law Department of Law & Governance LLM  Kum Shivani Malviya Female Hindu OPEN 67 50 66

722 Law Department of Law & Governance LLM  Kuwari Zain Shabbir Shaheen Male Muslim OPEN 63.69 55.67 50

723 Law Department of Law & Governance LLM  Langote Abhishek Subhash Male Hindu OPEN 74.30 58.83 53.7

724 Law Department of Law & Governance LLM  M.C.Catherine Female Christian All India Candidature Candidates (General OMS)  55.60 52 56

725 Law Department of Law & Governance LLM  Mali Lokesh Deepak Male Hindu OBC  NULL 55

726 Law Department of Law & Governance LLM  Mandhare Vishal Jitendra Male Hindu OPEN 77.4 69.4 67

727 Law Department of Law & Governance LLM  Mangale Bhagyashri Rajendra Female Hindu OPEN 56.13 64 55

728 Law Department of Law & Governance LLM  Manjrekar Siddhesh Santosh Male Hindu OPEN 77.69 81.67 50

729 Law Department of Law & Governance LLM  Marri Padmanabhan Krishnaiah Leelavathi Male Hindu OPEN 60 46 49

730 Law Department of Law & Governance LLM  Mayuri Nilesh Sane Female Hindu OPEN 49.20 55.50 50

731 Law Department of Law & Governance LLM  Memon Faisal Mohd Omar Male Muslim OPEN 50 59 50

732 Law Department of Law & Governance LLM  Mhatre Sharli Mahendra Female Hindu OPEN 8.0 CGPA 82 61

733 Law Department of Law & Governance LLM  Momin Mohd Sajid Mohd Yusuf Male Muslim OPEN 60 51.5 56

734 Law Department of Law & Governance LLM  Mulani Arif Tajuddin Male Muslim OPEN 49.50 44.66 56.10

735 Law Department of Law & Governance LLM  Muluk Neeraj Murlidhar Male Hindu OBC  56.61 45.50 57.66

736 Law Department of Law & Governance LLM  Mungle Arif Abdul Majid Male Muslim OPEN 51 47.17 57.07

737 Law Department of Law & Governance LLM  Nafday Alap Milind Male Hindu OPEN 63.86 51 51.4

738 Law Department of Law & Governance LLM  Nevse Devendra Dattatray Male Hindu OPEN 60.26 60.17 60.87

739 Law Department of Law & Governance LLM  Nisha Bishwakarma Female Hindu All India Candidature Candidates (General OMS)  58 58 50.62

740 Law Department of Law & Governance LLM  Oswal Neha Lalit Female Jain OPEN 81.45 53.83 62.77

741 Law Department of Law & Governance LLM  Pallavi Shirish Kulkarni Female Hindu OPEN 90.14 80.83 71.83

742 Law Department of Law & Governance LLM  Pandya Poojan Joy Male Hindu All India Candidature Candidates (General OMS)  51 50.67

743 Law Department of Law & Governance LLM  Patel Badshah Bakshu Male Muslim OPEN 63 56 58.90

744 Law Department of Law & Governance LLM  Pathan Taherkhan Sherkhan Male Muslim OPEN 52 57.67 58.97

745 Law Department of Law & Governance LLM  Patharia Sanjiv Harikant Male Hindu OPEN 38 42.5 62.53

746 Law Department of Law & Governance LLM  Patil Narayan Yallapa Male Hindu OPEN 65 50.17 -

747 Law Department of Law & Governance LLM  POPAT RAVAN GARAD Male Hindu SC  64.85 60.00 54.40

748 Law Department of Law & Governance LLM  Pradhan Subam Male Hindu All India Candidature Candidates (General OMS)  66 64.9 51.9

749 Law Department of Law & Governance LLM  Pravin Bhanudas Shete Male Hindu OPEN 76.85 76.67 63.93

750 Law Department of Law & Governance LLM  Salve Sandeep Madhukar Male Buddhist SC  87.57 88.50 53.00

751 Law Department of Law & Governance LLM  Sarda Deepa Anil Female Hindu OPEN 74.55 73 60.88

752 Law Department of Law & Governance LLM  Sayali Sanjay Shirolikar Female Christian OPEN 74.36 68.50 58.9

753 Law Department of Law & Governance LLM  Seema Chaudhary Female Hindu All India Candidature Candidates (General OMS)  49 58 49.41

754 Law Department of Law & Governance LLM  Shaikh Sameer Ismail Male Muslim OPEN 57.28 46.17 51.6

755 Law Department of Law & Governance LLM  Sharma Khushbu Female Hindu All India Candidature Candidates (General OMS)  62.28 82.83 63.14

756 Law Department of Law & Governance LLM  Sharma Tulasha Female Hindu All India Candidature Candidates (General OMS)  64 71.1 60.4



757 Law Department of Law & Governance LLM  Shinde Amit Ashok Male Hindu OPEN 53 43.33 56

758 Law Department of Law & Governance LLM  Sonawane Punam Sangram Female Hindu OPEN 41.84 50

759 Law Department of Law & Governance LLM  Shivangee Shukla Female Hindu All India Candidature Candidates (General OMS)  51 59 59

760 Law Department of Law & Governance LLM  shivganga Chandrakant Hawaldar Female Hindu SC  53.38 53.17 65.6

761 Law Department of Law & Governance LLM  Shubra kasliwal Female Jain OPEN 79.40 79.83 58.0

762 Law Department of Law & Governance LLM  Subba Barkha Female Hindu All India Candidature Candidates (General OMS)  68 49 51.8

763 Law Department of Law & Governance LLM  SURYAWANSHI HARSHWARDHAN RAJKUMAR Male Hindu SC  58.93 56.33 57.60

764 Law Department of Law & Governance LLM  Swapnil Yogaraj Zade Male Hindu OBC  72.15 75.50 55.99

765 Law Department of Law & Governance LLM  Tambe Ashish Anna Male Hindu NT-C  82.15 69.83 58.52

766 Law Department of Law & Governance LLM  Totla Akshay Pravinchandra Male Hindu OPEN 90.91 70 58.3

767 Law Department of Law & Governance LLM  Vaibhav Mahadev Nagane Male Hindu OPEN 48.76 60.33 56.27

768 Law Department of Law & Governance LLM  Vikram Govind Gawade Male Hindu OPEN 60.26 46.17 57.8

769 Law Department of Law & Governance LLM  AGRAWAL SHRESTH SHANKARLAL Male Hindu OPEN 48.80 60.60 52

770 Law Department of Law & Governance LLM  Aishwarya Vyankatesh Dange Female Hindu OPEN 71.80 69.33 53

771 Law Department of Law & Governance LLM  Amate Sanket Sanjay Male Hindu OPEN 60 60 51.8

772 Law Department of Law & Governance LLM  Aniket Pawar Male Hindu OPEN 62.66 48.00 55.00

773 Law Department of Law & Governance LLM  Awale Smita Subhash Female Hindu OPEN 53 60 62

774 Law Department of Law & Governance LLM  Bhangre Prathmesh Prakas Male Hindu OPEN 55.53 48.67 57.8

775 Law Department of Law & Governance LLM  Bhosale Prasad Sudhakar Male Hindu OPEN 61.73 51.67 53.66

776 Law Department of Law & Governance LLM  Birajdar Aishwarya Paramanand Female Hindu OPEN 70.53 67.33 58.5

777 Law Department of Law & Governance LLM  Date Prachi Kamalakar Female Hindu OPEN 64 71 53

778 Law Department of Law & Governance LLM  Honrao Pallavi Prafulla Female Hindu OPEN 56 56 50

779 Law Department of Law & Governance LLM  Indani Umesh Madanlal Male Hindu OPEN 62.85 67 67.33

780 Law Department of Law & Governance LLM  Indrajit Chatterjee Male Hindu OPEN 74 54 66

781 Law Department of Law & Governance LLM  Kashikar Prathamesh Unmesh Male Hindu OPEN 58.76 62.17 57.66

782 Law Department of Law & Governance LLM  Khilwani Jaya Balram Female Hindu OPEN 52.92 44.66 61.50

783 Law Department of Law & Governance LLM  Nagawade Deepak Shivaji Male Hindu OPEN 74.18 53.50 62.40

784 Law Department of Law & Governance LLM  Nirav Kishor Joshi Male Hindu OPEN 48 40.17 60.63

785 Law Department of Law & Governance LLM  Pansare Mahendra Ramesh Male Hindu OPEN 74.91 66.17 56.55

786 Law Department of Law & Governance LLM  Raja Sengupta Male Hindu All India Candidature Candidates (General OMS)  62.5 54.5 52.1

787 Law Department of Law & Governance LLM  Relekar Onkar Shivdas Male Hindu OBC  74.61 55

788 Law Department of Law & Governance LLM  Sawant Deepika Gajanan Female Hindu OPEN 56.66 53.53 60.10

789 Law Department of Law & Governance LLM  Taslim Amulal Shaikh Female Muslim OPEN 65.53 64.17 68.10

790 Law Department of Law & Governance LLM  Vaidya Bhalchandra Mahadev Male Hindu OPEN 64 55 50

791 Law Department of Law & Governance LLM  Yogesh shivaji Pawar Male Hindu OPEN 40.13 46.67 55

792 Law Department of Law & Governance LLM  Sharma Kusum Female Hindu All India Candidature Candidates (General OMS)  66.57 65.83 61.68

793 Law Department of Law & Governance LLM  Yadav Ranjeet Laltaram Male Hindu OPEN 73.20 70.83 57.26

794 Law Department of Law & Governance LLM  Chavan Vikrant Bhimsen Male Hindu OPEN - - 47.37

795 Law Department of Law & Governance LLM  Seetharaman Subramaniam Male Hindu OPEN 58.28 44 51

796 Law Department of Law & Governance LLM  Bhandare Sagar Suresh Male Hindu OPEN 52.13 60.00 52.36

797 Law Department of Law & Governance LLM  Rajput Mohansinh Umeshsinh Male Hindu OPEN 52.93 49.50 64.00

798 Law Department of Law & Governance LLM  Godbole Swaroop Hemant Male Hindu OPEN 61.20 72.00 56.00

799 Law Department of Law & Governance LLM  Pathak Pravartak Suhas Male Hindu OPEN 45.60 51.00 52.66

800 Law Department of Law & Governance LLM  Kotecha Akash Kishorkumar Male Jain OPEN 86.92 56.00 57.08

801 Law Department of Law & Governance LLM  Sangle Tanvi Anant Female Hindu OPEN 74.30 67.67 68.71



802 Law Department of Law & Governance LLM  Purandare Shraddha Prasad Female Hindu OPEN 72.40 67.83 69

803 Law Department of Law & Governance LLM  Pise Prakash Laxman Male Hindu OPEN 60 47.33 52.5

804 Law Department of Law & Governance LLM  Bankapur Akshay Harish Male Hindu OPEN 72.18 58.50 58.60

805 Art & Design PhD PhD Patil Ashu Digambarrao Female Hindu OPEN

806 Art & Design PhD PhD Mandre Shailesh Bajirao Male Hindu OPEN

807 Art & Design PhD PhD Sumedha Suneel Sahasrabudhe Female Hindu OPEN

808 Art & Design PhD PhD Aderao Shankar Madhavrao Male Hindu SC  

809 Art & Design PhD PhD Kalwale Jayaprakash Gangaram Male Hindu SC  

810 Commerce & ManagementPhD PhD Fasiha Adil Kauchali Female Muslim OPEN

811 Commerce & ManagementPhD PhD Syed Saad Amin Aftab Male Muslim All India Candidature Candidates (General OMS)  

812 Commerce & ManagementPhD PhD Kulkarni Niranjan Shripad Male Hindu OPEN

813 Commerce & ManagementPhD PhD Kamanboina Roshayya Venkatayya Male Hindu VJ/DT, NT-A  

814 Commerce & ManagementPhD PhD Deshpande Madhuja Vasant Female Hindu OPEN

815 Commerce & ManagementPhD PhD Vijapur Vidhya Hanamant Female Hindu OPEN

816 Commerce & ManagementPhD PhD xavier sherhill mohammad Hassan Female Christian OPEN

817 Commerce & ManagementPhD PhD Rohini Uday Nikam Female Hindu OBC  

818 Commerce & ManagementPhD PhD Mane Kirti Shailesh Female Hindu OPEN

819 Commerce & ManagementPhD PhD More Swati Shantaram Female Hindu OPEN

820 Commerce & ManagementPhD PhD Bhosale Monali Suhas Female Hindu OPEN

821 Commerce & ManagementPhD PhD Bhosale Suhas Sambhajirao Male Hindu OPEN

822 Inter Disciplinary StudiesPhD PhD Pardawala Zainab Huzaifa Female Muslim OPEN

823 Inter Disciplinary StudiesPhD PhD Jaid Ramesh Bhaguji Male Hindu OPEN

824 Inter Disciplinary StudiesPhD PhD Ravindra Madhukar Joshi Male Hindu OPEN

825 Journalism & Mass CommunicationPhD PhD Mate Rahool Sadashiv Male Hindu SBC  

826 Journalism & Mass CommunicationPhD PhD Borate Yogesh Sopan Male Hindu OPEN

827 Law PhD PhD Pawar Santosh Sambhaji Male Hindu OPEN

828 Law PhD PhD Rani Prabhakar Mukkawar Female Hindu OPEN

829 Law PhD PhD Palande Digvijay Ashok Male Hindu OBC  

830 Library and Information SciencePhD PhD J M Patekari Male Muslim OPEN

831 Library and Information SciencePhD PhD Lande Ashok Shivaji Male Hindu OBC  

832 Library and Information SciencePhD PhD Shende Chandrakant Narayan Male Hindu OPEN

833 Library and Information SciencePhD PhD Giri Manoj Ganpat Male Hindu NT-B  

834 Sciences & TechnologyPhD PhD Kapre KirtiAshok Female Hindu SBC  

835 Sciences & TechnologyPhD PhD Sapkal Sarita Dnyaneshwar Female Hindu SC  

836 Sciences & TechnologyPhD PhD Pise Reshma Nitin Female Hindu OPEN

837 Sciences & TechnologyPhD PhD shinde Archana Sandip Female Hindu OPEN

838 Sciences & TechnologyPhD PhD Shingare Ashwini Shekhar Female Hindu OBC  

839 Sciences & TechnologyPhD PhD Lade Sangita Gautam Female Hindu NT-B  

840 Sciences & TechnologyPhD PhD Pawar Virendra Dhairyashil Male Hindu OPEN

841 Sciences & TechnologyPhD PhD Bhutad Sonali Amol Female Hindu OPEN

842 Sciences & TechnologyPhD PhD Patil Sonali Sagar Female Hindu OPEN

843 Sciences & TechnologyPhD PhD patil priyanka Shivappa Female Hindu All India Candidature Candidates (General OMS)  

844 Sciences & TechnologyPhD PhD Pranav Dhaneshwar Male Hindu OPEN

845 Sciences & TechnologyPhD PhD Dhoka Prakash Kundanmal Male Hindu OPEN



Row Labels OMS NT-B  NT-C  NT-D  OBC  OPEN PWD SBC  SC  ST  VJ/DT, NT-A  Grand Total

B.A.  JOURNALISM & MASS COMMUNICATION 8 1 1 9 31 1 1 1 53

B.A. (Psychology) 5 1 12 2 20

B.A. (Travels and Tourism) 3 12 4 19

B.A. FASHION & APPAREL DESIGN 1 1 8 1 11

B.A. GRAPHIC DESIGN & MULTIMEDIA 1 1 6 17 3 28

B.A.INTERIOR DESIGN & DECORATION 2 1 2 7 46 1 59

B.DES. FASHION DESIGN 1 2 3

B.DES. GRAPHIC DESIGN 1 1 15 1 18

B.DES. PRODUCT DESIGN 4 1 2 20 1 1 3 32

B.Sc. (Computer Science) 1 1 1 6 9

B.Tech.- Computer Engineering 24 1 1 15 91 2 1 135

Bachelor of Business Administration(BBA) 10 1 7 57 1 2 1 79

BSc. Statistics 2 3 8 13

BTech-Mechanical Engg 3 8 36 1 3 1 52

LLM (Criminal Law, Business Law, Arbitration & International, Cyber Law, IPR)13 1 7 92 6 119

M.A. (Economics) 4 1 5

M.A. (Fashion & Apparel Design) 1 3 4

M.A. (JOURNALISM & MASS COMMUNICATION) 2 1 8 11

M.A. (PSYCHOLOGY) 9 1 34 1 45

M.A. (Travels and Tourism) 1 1

M.A.-INTERIOR DESIGN & DECORATION 2 1 2 1 6

M.Des. (Graphic Design) 1 1 2

M.Des. (Product Design) 1 1

M.Tech-Product Design & Development(PDD) 2 2

Master of Business Administration(MBA) 13 8 44 2 2 69

MSc. Statistics 8 8

Ph.D.( Professional Studies) 1 1

PhD in Chemical Engineering under Faculty of Science & Technology 1 1

PhD in Computer Engineering under Faculty of Science & Technology  1 1 5 1 8

PhD in Fashion Design under Faculty of Art and Design 1 1

PhD in Graphic Design under Faculty of Art and Design 2 2 4

PhD in Law and Governance under Faculty of Law 1 2 3

PhD in Library and Information Science under Faculty of Humanities and social science 1 1 2 4

PhD in Management under Faculty of Commerce and Management1 1 9 1 12

PhD in Mass Communication and Journalism under Faculty of Mass Communication and Journalism1 1 2

PhD in Mathematics & Statistics under Faculty of Science & Technology 1 1

PhD in Mechanical Engineering under Faculty of Science & Technology 2 2

PhD in Professional Studies under Faculty of Interdisciplinary Studies 2 2

(blank)

Grand Total 103 6 6 3 89 586 1 12 35 1 3 845

CATEGORY WISE ADMISSIONS 2018-19



Scheduled 

Castes and 

Schedule 

Caste 

converts to 

Buddhism 

(SC)

Schedule 

Tribes (ST)

Vimukta Jati 

(VJ)/De 

Notified 

Tribes(DT) 

(NT-A)

Nomadic 

Tribes 1 (NT-

B)

Nomadic 

Tribes 2 (NT-

C)

Nomadic 

Tribes 3 (NT-

D)

Other 

Backward 

Classes 

(OBC)

Open 

Category

13.00% 7.00% 3.00% 2.50% 3.50% 2.00% 19.00% 50.00%

1 B.A. (Fashion and Apparel Design) 5 11 1 1 0 0 0 0 2 5

2 B.A. (Graphic Design and Multimedia) 9 21 3 1 1 1 1 0 4 11

3 B.A. (Interior Design and Decoration) 18 42 5 3 1 1 1 1 8 21

4 B.A. (Interior Design and Decoration) - Lateral Admission15 4 10 1 1 0 0 0 0 2 5

5 B.A. (JMC) 30 18 42 5 3 1 1 1 1 8 21

6 B.A. (Psychology) 60 9 21 3 1 1 1 1 0 4 11

7 B.A. (Travels and Tourism) 14 9 21 3 1 1 1 1 0 4 11

8 B.Des (Product Design) 60 14 32 4 2 1 1 1 1 6 16

9 B.Des. (Fashion Design) 30 5 11 1 1 0 0 0 0 2 5

10 B.Des. (Graphic Design) 30 9 21 3 1 1 1 1 0 4 11

11 B.Sc. (Computer Science) 45 5 11 1 1 0 0 0 0 2 5

12 B.Tech. (Mechanical Engineering) 15 36 84 11 6 3 2 3 2 16 42

13 B.Tech (Mechanical Engineering) - Lateral Admission 30 12 28 4 2 1 1 1 1 5 14

14 B.Tech. (Computer Engineering) 15 36 84 11 6 3 2 3 2 16 42

15 B.Tech. (Computer Engineering)  - Lateral Admission120 5 11 1 1 0 0 0 0 2 6

16 Bachelor of Business Administration (BBA) 40 27 63 8 4 2 2 2 1 12 32

17 Bachelor of Business Administration (BBA) 120 7 16 2 1 0 0 1 0 3 8

18 BSc. Statistics 16 5 11 1 1 0 0 0 0 2 5

90

1 LLM 23 36 84 11 6 3 2 3 2 16 42

2 M.A. (Economics) 15 3 7 1 0 0 0 0 0 1 4

3 M.A. (Fashion & Apparel Design) 3 7 1 0 0 0 0 0 1 4

4 M.A. (Interior Design and Decoration) 120 3 7 1 0 0 0 0 0 1 4

5 M.A. (JMC) 10 6 14 2 1 0 0 0 0 3 7

6 M.A. (Psychology) 10 15 35 5 2 1 1 1 1 7 18

7 M.A. (Travel & Tourism) 10 3 7 1 0 0 0 0 0 1 4

8 M.Des. (Graphic Design) 20 3 7 1 0 0 0 0 0 1 4

9 M.Des. (Product Design) 50 3 7 1 0 0 0 0 0 1 4

Reservation for MS Candidates

Seat Matrix  For Admissions 2018-19

Sr. No. Name of the Programme

Sanctio

ned 

Intake

Outside 

Maharasht

ra State 

(OMS) 30%

Mahara

shtra 

State 

(MS)- 

70%



10 M.Tech. Mechanical (Product Design & Development)10 5 13 2 1 0 0 0 0 2 6

11 Master of Business Administration (MBA) 10 54 126 16 9 4 3 4 3 24 63

12 MSc. Statistics 10 3 7 1 0 0 0 0 0 1 4

13 MMS (Cooperation and Micro Finance) 18 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0

180

10
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Admissions 2017-18 
 



VU

2017-18

Reservation/ relaxation in admission

ADA

Course Category No. of students 

admitted

% of quota provided for 

reservation and preparation in 

respect of actual enrolment

Reservation for 

enrollment in 

Nos.

 15

SC 0 13 1

ST 0 7 1

NT-A 1 3 1

NT-B 0 2.5 0

NT-C 0 3.5 0

NT-D 0 2 0

OBC 1 19 2

Open 0 50 4

PWD 0 3 1

OMS 1 30 5

Total 3 15

Course Category No. of students 

admitted

% of quota provided for 

reservation and preparation in 

respect of actual enrolment

Reservation for 

enrollment in 

Nos.

 30

SC 1 13 3

ST 0 7 1

NT-A 0 3 1

NT-B 0 2.5 1

NT-C 0 3.5 1

NT-D 0 2 0

OBC 4 19 4

Open 11 50 9

PWD 0 3 1

OMS 0 30 9

Total 16 30

Course Category No. of students 

admitted

% of quota provided for 

reservation and preparation in 

respect of actual enrolment

Reservation for 

enrollment in 

Nos.

 30

SC 0 13 3

ST 0 7 1

NT-A 0 3 1

NT-B 0 2.5 1

NT-C 0 3.5 1

NT-D 0 2 0

OBC 4 19 4

Open 10 50 9

PWD 0 3 1

OMS 2 30 9

Total 16 30

BA 

Fashion & 

Apparel 

Design

BA 

Graphic 

Design & 

Multimedi

a

BA 

Interior 

Design & 

Decoratio

n



Course Category No. of students 

admitted

% of quota provided for 

reservation and preparation in 

respect of actual enrolment

Reservation for 

enrollment in 

Nos.

 15

SC 0 13 1

ST 0 7 1

NT-A 0 3 1

NT-B 0 2.5 0

NT-C 0 3.5 0

NT-D 0 2 0

OBC 0 19 2

Open 8 50 4

PWD 1 3 1

OMS 0 30 5

Total 9 15

Course Category No. of students 

admitted

% of quota provided for 

reservation and preparation in 

respect of actual enrolment

Reservation for 

enrollment in 

Nos.

 15

SC 0 13 1

ST 0 7 1

NT-A 0 3 1

NT-B 0 2.5 0

NT-C 0 3.5 0

NT-D 0 2 0

OBC 0 19 2

Open 9 50 4

PWD 0 3 1

OMS 0 30 5

Total 9 15

Course Category No. of students 

admitted

% of quota provided for 

reservation and preparation in 

respect of actual enrolment

Reservation for 

enrollment in 

Nos.

 15

SC 0 13 1

ST 0 7 1

NT-A 0 3 1

NT-B 0 2.5 0

NT-C 0 3.5 0

NT-D 0 2 0

OBC 1 19 2

Open 0 50 4

PWD 0 3 1

OMS 0 30 5

Total 1 15

B.Des 

Graphic 

Design

B.Des 

Product 

Design

B.Des 

Fashion 

Design



Course Category No. of students 

admitted

% of quota provided for 

reservation and preparation in 

respect of actual enrolment

Reservation for 

enrollment in 

Nos.

 120

SC 1 13 10

ST 0 7 6

NT-A 1 3 6

NT-B 0 2.5 2

NT-C 0 3.5 2

NT-D 0 2 0

OBC 10 19 16

Open 38 50 34

PWD 1 3 6

OMS 3 30 38

Total 54 120

Course Category No. of students 

admitted

% of quota provided for 

reservation and preparation in 

respect of actual enrolment

Reservation for 

enrollment in 

Nos.

 10

SC 0 13 1

ST 0 7 0

NT-A 0 3 1

NT-B 0 2.5 0

NT-C 0 3.5 0

NT-D 0 2 0

OBC 0 19 1

Open 1 50 3

PWD 0 3 1

OMS 1 30 3

Total 2 10

Course Category No. of students 

admitted

% of quota provided for 

reservation and preparation in 

respect of actual enrolment

Reservation for 

Admissions in 

Nos.

 130

SC 1 13 11

ST 0 7 6

NT-A 1 3 7

NT-B 0 2.5 2

NT-C 0 3.5 2

NT-D 0 2 0

OBC 10 19 17

Open 39 50 37

PWD 1 3 7

OMS 4 30 41

Total 56 130

ADA 

UG+PG 

Total

MA 

Interior 

Design & 

Decoratio

n

AD UG 

Total



VU

2017-18

Reservation/ relaxation in admission

CM

Course Category No. of students 

admitted

% of quota provided for 

reservation and preparation in 

respect of actual enrolment

Reservation for 

Admissions in 

Nos.

 60

SC 0 13 5

ST 0 7 3

NT-A 0 3 1

NT-B 1 2.5 1

NT-C 1 3.5 1

NT-D 0 2 1

OBC 2 19 8

Open 27 50 21

PWD 0 3 1

OMS 6 30 18

Total 37 60

Course Category No. of students 

admitted

% of quota provided for 

reservation and preparation in 

respect of actual enrolment

Reservation for 

Admissions in 

Nos.

 60

SC 0 13 5

ST 0 7 3

NT-A 0 3 1

NT-B 0 2.5 1

NT-C 0 3.5 1

NT-D 0 2 1

OBC 1 19 8

Open 40 50 21

PWD 0 3 1

OMS 7 30 18

Total 48 60

Course Category No. of students 

admitted

% of quota provided for 

reservation and preparation in 

respect of actual enrolment

Reservation for 

enrollment in 

Nos.

 120

SC 0 13 10

ST 0 7 6

NT-A 0 3 2

NT-B 1 2.5 2

NT-C 1 3.5 2

NT-D 0 2 2

OBC 3 19 16

Open 67 50 42

PWD 0 3 2

OMS 13 30 36

Total 85 120

BBA

MBA

CM 

UG+PG 

Total



VU

2017-18

Reservation/ relaxation in admission

HSS

Course Category No. of students 

admitted

% of quota provided for 

reservation and preparation in 

respect of actual enrolment

Reservation 

for 

Admissions in 

Nos.

 10

SC 0 13 1

ST 0 7 0

NT-A 0 3 1

NT-B 0 2.5 0

NT-C 0 3.5 0

NT-D 0 2 0

OBC 0 19 1

Open 2 50 3

PWD 0 3 1

OMS 1 30 3

Total 3 10

MA 

Psycholog

y



VU

2017-18

Reservation/ relaxation in admission

IDS

Course Category No. of students 

admitted

% of quota provided for 

reservation and preparation in 

respect of actual enrolment

Reservation for 

Admissions in Nos.

 30

SC 1 13 3

ST 0 7 1

NT-A 0 3 1

NT-B 0 2.5 1

NT-C 0 3.5 1

NT-D 0 2 0

OBC 5 19 4

Open 19 50 9

PWD 0 3 1

OMS 0 30 9

Total 25 30

MMS 

(Cooperative 

& 

Microfinance)



VU

2017-18

Reservation/ relaxation in admission

JMC

Course Category

No. of 

students 

admitted

% of quota provided for 

reservation and preparation 

in respect of actual enrolment

Reservation for 

Admissions in 

Nos.

 30

SC 2 13 3

ST 0 7 1

NT-A 0 3 1

NT-B 0 2.5 1

NT-C 1 3.5 1

NT-D 0 2 0

OBC 4 19 4

Open 19 50 9

PWD 0 3 1

OMS 2 30 9

Total 28 30

BA 

Journalis

m & Mass 

Communi

cation



VU

2017-18

Reservation/ relaxation in admission

ST

Course Category No. of students 

admitted

% of quota provided for reservation 

and preparation in respect of actual 

enrolment

Reservation for 

Admissions in 

Nos.60

SC 1 13 5

ST 0 7 3

NT-A 0 3 1

NT-B 0 2.5 1

NT-C 0 3.5 1

NT-D 0 2 1

OBC 5 19 8

Open 43 50 21

PWD 0 3 1

OMS 11 30 18

Total 60 60

Course Category No. of students 

admitted

% of quota provided for reservation 

and preparation in respect of actual 

enrolment

Reservation for 

Admissions in 

Nos.60

SC 0 13 5

ST 0 7 3

NT-A 0 3 1

NT-B 0 2.5 1

NT-C 0 3.5 1

NT-D 0 2 1

OBC 4 19 8

Open 16 50 21

PWD 0 3 1

OMS 0 30 18

Total 20 60

Course Category No. of students 

admitted

% of quota provided for reservation 

and preparation in respect of actual 

enrolment

Reservation for 

Admissions in 

Nos.60

SC 0 13 5

ST 0 7 3

NT-A 0 3 1

NT-B 0 2.5 1

NT-C 0 3.5 1

NT-D 0 2 1

OBC 1 19 8

Open 3 50 21

PWD 0 3 1

OMS 0 30 18

Total 4 60

B.tech 

Comp 

Engg

B.tech 

Mech 

Engg

II nd Year 

B.Tech 

Comp 

Engg 



Course Category No. of students 

admitted

% of quota provided for reservation 

and preparation in respect of actual 

enrolment

Reservation for 

Admissions in 

Nos.60

SC 0 13 5

ST 0 7 3

NT-A 0 3 1

NT-B 0 2.5 1

NT-C 0 3.5 1

NT-D 0 2 1

OBC 0 19 8

Open 13 50 21

PWD 0 3 1

OMS 1 30 18

Total 14 60

Course Category No. of students 

admitted

% of quota provided for reservation 

and preparation in respect of actual 

enrolment

Reservation for 

Admissions in 

Nos.

240

SC 1 13 20

ST 0 7 12

NT-A 0 3 4

NT-B 0 2.5 4

NT-C 0 3.5 4

NT-D 0 2 4

OBC 10 19 32

Open 75 50 84

PWD 0 3 4

OMS 12 30 72

Total 98 240

Course Category No. of students 

admitted

% of quota provided for reservation 

and preparation in respect of actual 

enrolment

Reservation for 

Admissions in 

Nos.
9

SC 0 13 1

ST 0 7 1

NT-A 0 3 1

NT-B 0 2.5 0

NT-C 0 3.5 0

NT-D 0 2 0

OBC 1 19 0

Open 3 50 2

PWD 0 3 1

OMS 0 30 3

Total 4 9

M tech 

Mechanic

al 

II nd Year 

B.Tech 

Mech 

Engg

ST UG 

Total



Course Category No. of students 

admitted

% of quota provided for reservation 

and preparation in respect of actual 

enrolment

Reservation for 

Admissions in 

Nos.

249

SC 1 13 21

ST 0 7 13

NT-A 0 3 5

NT-B 0 2.5 4

NT-C 0 3.5 4

NT-D 0 2 4

OBC 11 19 32

Open 78 50 86

PWD 0 3 5

OMS 12 30 75

Total 102 249

ST Total



VU

2017-18

Reservation/ relaxation in admission

Ph.D

Course Category No. of students 

admitted

% of quota provided for 

reservation and preparation 

in respect of actual 

enrolment

Reservation for 

Admissions in Nos.

 42

SC 4 13 4

ST 0 7 2

NT-A 0 3 1

NT-B 2 2.5 1

NT-C 0 3.5 1

NT-D 0 2 1

OBC 7 19 5

Open 29 50 13

PWD 0 3 1

OMS 0 30 13

Total 42 42

Ph.D



VU

2017-18

Reservation/ relaxation in admission

PG

Course Category No. of 

students 

admitted

% of quota provided for 

reservation and preparation in 

respect of actual enrolment

Reservation for 

Admissions in Nos.

 9

SC 0 13 1

ST 0 7 1

NT-A 0 3 1

NT-B 0 2.5 0

NT-C 0 3.5 0

NT-D 0 2 0

OBC 1 19 0

Open 3 50 2

PWD 0 3 1

OMS 0 30 3

Total 4 9

Course Category No. of 

students 

admitted

% of quota provided for 

reservation and preparation in 

respect of actual enrolment

Reservation for 

Admissions in Nos.

 10

SC 0 13 1

ST 0 7 0

NT-A 0 3 1

NT-B 0 2.5 0

NT-C 0 3.5 0

NT-D 0 2 0

OBC 0 19 1

Open 1 50 3

PWD 0 3 1

OMS 1 30 3

Total 2 10

Course Category No. of 

students 

admitted

% of quota provided for 

reservation and preparation in 

respect of actual enrolment

Reservation for 

Admissions in Nos.

 60

SC 0 13 5

ST 0 7 3

NT-A 0 3 1

NT-B 0 2.5 1

NT-C 0 3.5 1

NT-D 0 2 1

OBC 1 19 8

Open 40 50 21

PWD 0 3 1

OMS 7 30 18

Total 48 60

STEM

ADA

CML



Course Category No. of 

students 

admitted

% of quota provided for 

reservation and preparation in 

respect of actual enrolment

Reservation for 

Admissions in Nos.

 30

SC 1 13 3

ST 0 7 1

NT-A 0 3 1

NT-B 0 2.5 1

NT-C 0 3.5 1

NT-D 0 2 0

OBC 5 19 4

Open 19 50 9

PWD 0 3 1

OMS 0 30 9

Total 25 30

Course Category No. of 

students 

admitted

% of quota provided for 

reservation and preparation in 

respect of actual enrolment

Reservation for 

Admissions in Nos.

 10

SC 0 13 1

ST 0 7 0

NT-A 0 3 1

NT-B 0 2.5 0

NT-C 0 3.5 0

NT-D 0 2 0

OBC 0 19 1

Open 2 50 3

PWD 0 3 1

OMS 1 30 3

Total 3 10

Course Category No. of 

students 

admitted

% of quota provided for 

reservation and preparation in 

respect of actual enrolment

Reservation for 

Admissions in Nos.

 119

SC 1 13 11

ST 0 7 5

NT-A 0 3 5

NT-B 0 2.5 2

NT-C 0 3.5 2

NT-D 0 2 1

OBC 7 19 14

Open 65 47 38

PWD 0 3 5

OMS 9 15 36

Total 82 119

VU PG 

Total

IDS

HSS



VU

2017-18

Reservation/ relaxation in admission

UG

Course Category No. of 

students 

admitted

% of quota provided for 

reservation and preparation in 

respect of actual enrolment

Reservation for 

Admissions in Nos.

 240

SC 1 13 20

ST 0 7 12

NT-A 0 3 4

NT-B 0 2.5 4

NT-C 0 3.5 4

NT-D 0 2 4

OBC 10 19 32

Open 75 50 84

PWD 0 3 4

OMS 12 30 72

Total 98 240

Course Category No. of 

students 

admitted

% of quota provided for 

reservation and preparation in 

respect of actual enrolment

Reservation for 

Admissions in Nos.

 120

SC 1 13 10

ST 0 7 6

NT-A 1 3 6

NT-B 0 2.5 2

NT-C 0 3.5 2

NT-D 0 2 0

OBC 10 19 16

Open 38 50 34

PWD 1 3 6

OMS 3 30 38

Total 54 120

Course Category No. of 

students 

admitted

% of quota provided for 

reservation and preparation in 

respect of actual enrolment

Reservation for 

Admissions in Nos.

 60

SC 0 13 5

ST 0 7 3

NT-A 0 3 1

NT-B 1 2.5 1

NT-C 1 3.5 1

NT-D 0 2 1

OBC 2 19 8

Open 27 50 21

PWD 0 3 1

OMS 6 30 18

Total 37 60

STEM

ADA

CML



Course Category No. of 

students 

admitted

% of quota provided for 

reservation and preparation in 

respect of actual enrolment

Reservation for 

Admissions in Nos.

 30

SC 2 13 3

ST 0 7 1

NT-A 0 3 1

NT-B 0 2.5 1

NT-C 1 3.5 1

NT-D 0 2 0

OBC 4 19 4

Open 19 50 9

PWD 0 3 1

OMS 2 30 9

Total 28 30

Course Category No. of 

students 

admitted

% of quota provided for 

reservation and preparation in 

respect of actual enrolment

Reservation for 

Admissions in Nos.

 450

SC 4 13 38

ST 0 7 22

NT-A 1 3 12

NT-B 1 2.5 8

NT-C 2 3.5 8

NT-D 0 2 5

OBC 26 19 60

Open 159 50 148

PWD 1 3 12

OMS 23 30 137

Total 217 450

VU UG 

Total

JMC



VU

2017-18

Reservation in Admission

Course Category No. of 

students 

admitte

d

% of quota provided for 

reservation and preparation in 

respect of actual enrolment

Reservation for 

Admissions in Nos.

 450

SC 4 13 38

ST 0 7 22

NT-A 1 3 12

NT-B 1 2.5 8

NT-C 2 3.5 8

NT-D 0 2 5

OBC 26 19 60

Open 159 50 148

PWD 1 3 12

OMS 23 30 137

Total 217 450

Course Category No. of 

students 

admitte

d

% of quota provided for 

reservation and preparation in 

respect of actual enrolment

Reservation for 

Admissions in Nos.

 119

SC 1 13 11

ST 0 7 5

NT-A 0 3 5

NT-B 0 2.5 2

NT-C 0 3.5 2

NT-D 0 2 1

OBC 7 19 14

Open 65 47 38

PWD 0 3 5

OMS 9 15 36

Total 82 119

Course Category No. of 

students 

admitte

d

% of quota provided for 

reservation and preparation in 

respect of actual enrolment

Reservation for 

Admissions in Nos.

 42

SC 4 13 4

ST 0 7 2

NT-A 0 3 1

NT-B 2 2.5 1

NT-C 0 3.5 1

NT-D 0 2 1

OBC 7 19 5

Open 29 50 13

PWD 0 3 1

OMS 0 30 13

Total 42 42

VU UG 

Total

VU PG 

Total

VU Ph.D 

Total



Course Category No. of 

students 

admitte

d

% of quota provided for 

reservation and preparation in 

respect of actual enrolment

Reservation for 

Admissions in Nos.

 611

SC 9 13 53

ST 0 7 29

NT-A 1 3 18

NT-B 3 2.5 11

NT-C 2 3.5 11

NT-D 0 2 7

OBC 40 19 79

Open 253 47 199

PWD 1 3 18

OMS 32 15 186

Total 341 611

VU Total



VU

2017-18

Reservation in Admission

Course Category No. of 

students 

admitted

% of quota provided for 

reservation and preparation in 

respect of actual enrolment

Reservation for 

Admissions in 

Nos. (Intake)

SC 9 13 53

ST 0 7 29

NT-A 1 3 18

NT-B 3 2.5 11

NT-C 2 3.5 11

NT-D 0 2 7

OBC 40 19 79

Open 253 47 199

PWD 1 3 18

OMS 32 15 186

Total 341 611

UG+PG+

Ph.D 

Total


